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FOREWORD 

Earth is still the only one found in the Universe, humans 
have not been able to escape to other planets, no free 
oxygen on the planet Mars, humans are still far from 
looking for life on planets outside the solar system, even 
100K years of space travel is impossible if we measure the 
age of the emerging civilization of just 6000 years while 
universe of 13.8 billion years. So democracy freedom 
utopia has natural limits of statistical humans intelligences 
and environment. Poorly, it is tricked as  infiltration tools 
by greedy imperialism to destroy other countries with 
sanctions and wars. So the conclusion by natural law, 
civilized socialism is the end goal of one Earth civilization. 
         Since humans discovered how to make an atomic 
bomb in 1945 that could destroy life on Earth, this 
invention was soon used for the mass killings of humans 
in Hiroshima-Nagasaki in 1945. Since then, the nuclear 
arms race began. The rivalry of civilizations that kill each 
other has actually been predicted by religions since stone 
age. The story of Jewish religion about the sons of Adam 
of Cain (Qabil) and Abel (Habil) who killed each other, 
that's an accurate description of humans who ultimately 
destroy each other until the Miracle of the Soul of God 
comes to save mankind souls itself, but surely the Day 
After comes soon with Universe BIG RIP, and it is hard  to 
accept by scientific.  See my PPT power-point in last pages 
section VI for quickly studies of satanic democracy wars 
led by the USA since 1945 and  Russia-Ukraine war 2022.  
            
Musman          
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I. 6000 YEARS HUMAN 
SOCIALISM AND 
CAPITALISM OUTLOOK
1.1. Learnings from Russia vs Ukraine Wars 2022

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The undeniable reality of civilization fate, God Almighty 
decided Earth remains one and only one found in the 
Universe[2], humans have not been able to escape to 
other planets, humans have not been able to create new 
life on the Moon, no oxygen on the planet Mars, humans 
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are still far away from looking for life on planets beyond 
the solar system, even it is 100,000 years impossible 
journey if we measure the age of the civilization that just 
emerged 6000 years in mysterious space time journey of 
universe of 13.8 billion years[2]. So by natural law, the 
goal of civilized socialism is the real goal of one Earth 
civilization, so throw away the idea of unlimited 
democratic freedom with tendency now as satanic 
democracy.  

The simple meaning of the satanic democracy carried out 
by the USA is that the USA wants democratic freedom to 
be carried out throughout the world, even though the 
USA knows that democratic freedom is also an infiltration 
tool that divides a nation whose intelligence level of 
technological civilization is lower, so that the nation is 
easy to control. if necessary destroy the economy with 
embargo and sanction, if necessary destroyed through 
war and bombing. 

In 2022 there has been critical peak of the ideological  
struggle between the theory of democratic freedom and 
the theory of civilized socialism, it is a war between Russia 
and Ukraine. The theory of civilized socialism is rooted 
from religious socialism which respects the origin of 
humans as creatures who were born as evolutionary 
creatures as part of life created by God Almighty. 
Meanwhile, the ideology of democratic freedom has the 
principle of 1 man 1 vote in all matters of decision making 
of a nation and state. In fact, making decisions by 1 man 1 
vote, it has a 90% chance of error (by tyranny of majority) 
in determining the future of a country, because 
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statistically biological evolution, the percentage of 
intelligent humans will be born a little, let's say the 
percentage of intelligent humans between 2% and 10% in 
a given population. An extreme example, only 1 person 
Albert Einstein was born as an intelligent human being 
who discovered the formula E = mc2.  

As a clear example, Zelensky was democratically elected 
president of Ukraine in 2018, but then he decided to go to 
war against Russia, even though Ukraine was granted 
peaceful independence by Russia to look to the future of 
the 41 million Ukrainian people led by him. It was as if a 
horde of demons were tempting Zelensky into eating 
tempting US dollar apples[71].  

So the principle of the ideology of democratic freedom is 
naturally mistaken and easily misled into a vicious greedy  
democracy in which the civilized socialism is intentionally 
being wasted. Human civilization is demanded from the 
stone age, that human technology could prevent hunger 
throughout for better future world (socialism basis). 
Humans created money, but civilization must be able to 
make humans independent from creatures enslaved by 
money to obtain their basic life as living beings (socialism 
concept). 

The classic story about the murder of Abel by Cain, is a 
perfect illustration that human civilization will continue to 
fight each other, humans kill each other, humans destroy 
each other on Earth until Judgment Day arrives, the Spirit 
of God will come to help the human soul who has always 
been a restless wanderer, then Universe ended with BIG 



 
 

RIP, and this religious prophecy story is hard to accept
logic of science.  

The story of the 
religion about Adam
tricked by satan into eating a 
tantalizing apple, 
truth of humans fighting with 
themselves in a God Mind 
Game.  
 
It’s all God Mind Gamers, 
humans are only little 
gamers.  
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Cain and Abel were the first two children of Adam and 
Eve after they were expelled from the Garden of Eden in 
the book of Genesis. According to the Bible story, Cain 
killed Abel because God accepted Abel's sacrifice but 
rejected Cain's sacrifice. With this act of jealousy, Cain 
became the first killer. The problem started when the two 
brothers decided to offer sacrifices to God from each of 
their crops, but God only accepted Abel's crops. How did 
the first two people on Earth know to sacrifice to God? 
The Moses Law, which detailed sacrifices, had not been 
introduced. And more problematically, why did God reject 
Cain's sacrifice? The text does not provide a reason. 
However, ancient Sumerian texts describe conflicts 
between nomads and first settled peasants and may have 
influenced the story.  

Since Hiroshima nuclear bombs 1945, the USA's 
democracy campaign throughout the world is just a 
systematic fraud so that the USA continues to exist to 
dominate the world's hegemony. A real example, when 
Indonesia Sukarno was overthrown by student 
demonstrations in 1966 which was followed by the 
genocide of communist party followers, the USA and 
Europe were silent and allowed the mass killings to take 
place. USA and its allies will disburse foreign debt loans in 
US currency until the country's currency continues to 
weaken and depreciate against US dollars.  

For example in Indonesia, in 1973 the USA one dollar can 
be exchanged with Rp 500 Indonesian, but after 24 years, 
the rupiah currency falls, it takes Rp 15,000 to buy USD 1, 
meaning this is economic colonialism where a country's 
currency can be chaotic to fall through trade sanctions 
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and world finance colonialism which dominated by USD 
dollar currency[1]. 

As far as we see the actions of the USA and NATO since 
becoming the legal owners of superior Western civilization 
since the atomic bomb genocide was used in 1945 AD 
until now, they have carried out a campaign for 
democratic freedom. But why are USA and NATO so 
hostile to the hammer and sickle symbol? Why are the USA 
and NATO so very threatened by the existence of the 
Russian and Chinese socialist civilizations, civilizations that 
have achieved high satellite technology. Why are the USA 
and NATO waging war and infiltration of the whole world. 
What we see as the results of the 75-year campaign for 
democratic freedom, are forms of arrogance as if Western 
civilization is the legal owner of Earth. Civilizations with 
one party state, do not violate the laws of nature, because 
we know that the level of intelligence to understand the 
constitution has a small percentage, while at the level of 
the large majority of the people they do not understand 
the basic constitutional goal of achieving civilized 
socialism. For example, China with a population of 1.3 
billion, with the freedom of democracy to achieve 
prosperity and the technological power of a nation, it 
becomes a game full of risks. It seems that God Almighty 
has given China a way to carry out the goals of civilized 
socialism and achieved it with the title of his book Karl 
Marx Das Kapital, this is the answer to the mystery of 
human capitalism. The greatest mystery of mankind today 
is why the age of civilization is only 6000 years old, why it 
is so difficult to imagine for a 100,000 year future 
civilization with wars that want to destroy each other. 
While it's clear that God has decided that Earth is the only 



 
 

one in the universe, that it's nearly impossible to make 
20,000 years of space travel, even then, Alpha Centauri is 
closest. While we know the age of the universe is 13.8 
billion years. It's tiring to see this game of civilization.

1.2. Why 6000 years humans are 70% Wars  Games?

If we predict future human civilization time’s 10,000 years, 
life evolution time’s 3,800,000,000 years, and universe 
time’s 13,800,000,000 years. Then we can make universe 
clock system[2] as follows : 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
If you look at the time period of the universe which is so 
long in billions of years, the evolution of life on earth is 
also billions of years, while the emergence of human 
civilization was only 6000 years ago, and we are like being 
awakened from a long sleep. It is as if the clock of the 
universe's computing time has arrived at 0 o'clock. When 
the condition is the end of the space-time journey, and a 
new universe space-time journey is about to begin
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3.8 billion years of life are multi complex of  mind games. If 
human civilization is singular in the universe, then 
civilization is a final mind game itself [2].  
 
Mind games are mathematical computational basics for 
generating the physical universe formats.  A civilization is 
a complex society that is characterized by urban 
development, social stratification, a form of government, 
and symbolic systems of communication (such as writing). 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Civilizations are intimately associated with and often 
further defined by other socio-politico-economic 
characteristics, such as centralization, the domestication of 
both humans and other organisms, specialization of 
labour, culturally-ingrained ideologies of progress and 
supremacism, monumental architecture, taxation, societal 
dependence upon farming and expansionism. 
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Historically, "a civilization" has often been understood as a 
larger and "more advanced" culture, in implied contrast to 
smaller, supposedly primitive cultures. In this broad sense, 
a civilization contrasts with non-centralized tribal societies, 
including the cultures of nomadic pastoralists, Neolithic 
societies or hunter-gatherers; however, sometimes it also 
contrasts with the cultures found within civilizations 
themselves. Civilizations are organized densely-populated 
settlements divided into hierarchical social classes with a 
ruling elite and subordinate urban and rural populations, 
which engage in intensive agriculture, mining, small-scale 
manufacture and trade. Civilization concentrates power, 
extending human control over the rest of nature, 
including over other human beings. 
 
A civilization (or civilisation) is a complex society that is 
characterized by urban development, social stratification, 
a form of government, and symbolic systems of 
communication (such as writing).  
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Civilizations are intimately associated with and often have 
characteristics such as centralization, the domestication of 
plant and animal species, specialization of labour, 
culturally-ingrained ideologies of progress and 
supremacism, monumental architecture, taxation, societal 
dependence upon farming and expansionism. 
 
Historically, "a civilization" has often been understood as a 
larger and "more advanced" culture, in implied contrast to 
smaller, supposedly primitive cultures. In this broad sense, 
a civilization contrasts with non-centralized tribal societies, 
including the cultures of nomadic pastoralists, Neolithic 
societies or hunter-gatherers; however, sometimes it also 
contrasts with the cultures found within civilizations 
themselves. Civilizations are organized densely-populated 
settlements divided into hierarchical social classes with a 
ruling elite and subordinate urban and rural populations, 
which engage in intensive agriculture, mining, small-scale 
manufacture and trade. Civilization concentrates power, 
extending human control over the rest of nature, 
including over other human beings. 
 
Civilization, as its etymology suggests, is a concept 
originally associated with towns and cities. The earliest 
emergence of civilizations is generally connected with the 
final stages of the Neolithic Revolution, culminating in the 
relatively rapid process of urban revolution and state-
formation, a political development associated with the 
appearance of a governing elite.  
 
A group of theorists, making use of systems theory, looks 
at a civilization as a complex system, i.e., a framework by 
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which a group of objects can be analysed that work in 
concert to produce some result. Civilizations can be seen 
as networks of cities that emerge from pre-urban cultures 
and are defined by the economic, political, military, 
diplomatic, social and cultural interactions among them. 
Any organization is a complex social system and a 
civilization is a large organization. Systems theory helps 
guard against superficial and misleading analogies in the 
study and description of civilizations. 
 
Systems theorists look at many types of relations between 
cities, including economic relations, cultural exchanges 
and political/diplomatic/military relations. These spheres 
often occur on different scales. For example, trade 
networks were, until the nineteenth century, much larger 
than either cultural spheres or political spheres. Extensive 
trade routes, including the Silk Road through Central Asia 
and Indian Ocean sea routes linking the Roman Empire, 
Persian Empire, India and China, were well established 
2000 years ago when these civilizations scarcely shared 
any political, diplomatic, military, or cultural relations. The 
first evidence of such long-distance trade is in the ancient 
world. During the Uruk period, Guillermo Algaze has 
argued that trade relations connected Egypt, 
Mesopotamia, Iran and Afghanistan. Resin found later in 
the Royal Cemetery at Ur is suggested was traded 
northwards from Mozambique. 
 
Many theorists argue that the entire world has already 
become integrated into a single "world system", a process 
known as globalization. Different civilizations and 
societies all over the globe are economically, politically, 
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and even culturally interdependent in many ways. There is 
debate over when this integration began, and what sort 
of integration – cultural, technological, economic, 
political, or military-diplomatic – is the key indicator in 
determining the extent of a civilization. David Wilkinson 
has proposed that economic and military-diplomatic 
integration of the Mesopotamian and Egyptian 
civilizations resulted in the creation of what he calls the 
"Central Civilization" around 1500 BC. Central Civilization 
later expanded to include the entire Middle East and 
Europe, and then expanded to a global scale with 
European colonization, integrating the Americas, 
Australia, China and Japan by the nineteenth century. 
According to Wilkinson, civilizations can be culturally 
heterogeneous, like the Central Civilization, or 
homogeneous, like the Japanese civilization. What 
Huntington calls the "clash of civilizations" might be 
characterized by Wilkinson as a clash of cultural spheres 
within a single global civilization. Others point to the 
Crusades as the first step in globalization. The more 
conventional viewpoint is that networks of societies have 
expanded and shrunk since ancient times, and that the 
current globalized economy and culture is a product of 
recent European colonialism. 
 
Civilization has been spread by colonization, invasion, 
religious conversion, the extension of bureaucratic control 
and trade, and by introducing agriculture and writing to 
non-literate peoples. Some non-civilized people may 
willingly adapt to civilized behaviour. But civilization is 
also spread by the technical, material and social 
dominance that civilization engenders. 
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Assessments of what level of civilization a polity has 
reached are based on comparisons of the relative 
importance of agricultural as opposed to trading or 
manufacturing capacities, the territorial extensions of its 
power, the complexity of its division of labour, and the 
carrying capacity of its urban centres. Secondary elements 
include a developed transportation system, writing, 
standardized measurement, currency, contractual and 
tort-based legal systems, art, architecture, mathematics, 
scientific understanding, metallurgy, political structures, 
and organized religion. 
        Political scientist Samuel Huntington has argued that 
the defining characteristic of the 21st century will be a 
clash of civilizations. According to Huntington, conflicts 
between civilizations will supplant the conflicts between 
nation-states and ideologies that characterized the 19th 
and 20th centuries. These views have been strongly 
challenged by others like Edward Said, Muhammed Asadi 
and Amartya Sen.  Ronald Inglehart and Pippa Norris have 
argued that the "true clash of civilizations" between the 
Muslim world and the West is caused by the Muslim 
rejection of the West's more liberal sexual values, rather 
than a difference in political ideology, although they note 
that this lack of tolerance is likely to lead to an eventual 
rejection of (true) democracy.  
 
Cultural Historian Morris Berman suggests in Dark Ages 
America: the End of Empire that in the corporate 
consumerist United States, the very factors that once 
propelled it to greatness―extreme individualism, 
territorial and economic expansion, and the pursuit of 
material wealth―have pushed the United States across a 
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critical threshold where collapse is inevitable. Politically 
associated with over-reach, and as a result of the 
environmental exhaustion and polarization of wealth 
between rich and poor, he concludes the current system is 
fast arriving at a situation where continuation of the 
existing system saddled with huge deficits and a 
hollowed-out economy is physically, socially, economically 
and politically impossible.  Although developed in much 
more depth, Berman's thesis is similar in some ways to that 
of Urban Planner, Jane Jacobs who argues that the five 
pillars of United States culture are in serious decay: 
community and family; higher education; the effective 
practice of science; taxation and government; and the self-
regulation of the learned professions. 
 
Cultural critic and author Derrick Jensen argues that 
modern civilization is directed towards the domination of 
the environment and humanity itself in an intrinsically 
harmful, unsustainable, and self-destructive fashion.  
Defending his definition both linguistically and 
historically, he defines civilization as "a culture... that both 
leads to and emerges from the growth of cities", with 
"cities" defined as "people living more or less permanently 
in one place in densities high enough to require the 
routine importation of food and other necessities of life".  
This need for civilizations to import ever more resources, 
he argues, stems from their over-exploitation and 
diminution of their own local resources. Therefore, 
civilizations inherently adopt imperialist and expansionist 
policies and, to maintain these, highly militarized, 
hierarchically structured, and coercion-based cultures and 
lifestyles. 



 
 

 
If the war scenario between Russia and Ukraine widens 
into a world war, then into a nuclear war in 2022, please 
predict the future of humanity in 100,000 years, even 
though civilization only appeared 6000 years ago.
means that the predictions of religions more accurately 
describe that human life is very short. The human game is 
more dominant in mind games, where the mystery of the 
mind comes from the mystery of God the Creator.
                     QUESTION FOR FUTURE HUMANITY

 

 

 

 

 

 

As an electrical engineer myself, I find it hard to believe 
that actually the human mind can suddenly disappear, 
and humans will be returned to their condition like 
chimpanzees (without thoughts). But the logic that the 
human mind in civilization really only appeared 6
years ago, while the age of life on Earth has been 3.8 
billion years, this is really a human mystery question that is 
difficult to solve. Why did humans finally predict the Big 
Bang to occur 13.8 billion years ago, is it true that when 
humans appear, there will soon be a BIG RIP apocalypse 
throughout the space-time universe.  
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The war between Russia and Ukraine in 2022 is a major 
war between white races in Europe. The white 
nations of Europe and the United States are fighting each 
other with the last threat of destroying each other, killing 
each other, this is the use of weapons of mass destruction 
with nuclear warheads. For my joke, it looks battle of 
primitive humans of Neanderthal vs Denisovan since stone 
age till now. Meanwhile, the rise of China's socialist 
country which has transformed into a world capitalist 
country, where the value of China's trade has defeated 
USA hegemony.  

The rise of China's socialist state with a population of 1
billion, the rise of China's one-party system that can 
survive in the battle of civilizations campaigning for 
democracy of opinion, multi-party democracy, democracy 
of freedom, and economic democracy.  

But humans are born will always follow the natural 
of biological evolution, humans cannot be born the same 
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as fabricated robots with the same level of intelligence in 
the battle of civilizations. What we see from economic 
democracy is that countries that are rich in intelligence 
will increasingly dominate developing or poor countries or 
capitalist democracies Europe, USA, Japan will dominate 
the world economy. But God Almighty, has his own game 
algorithm for the journey of human civilization, with the 
emergence of China's socialism-capitalism system, this will 
change the fate of human civilization in the next 100-500 
years.  

The war between Russia and Ukraine is actually a war 
between the concepts of satanic democracy using the 
power of the domination of the American dollar currency, 
which wants to destroy the concepts of socialism which 
were actually born from socialism of religions with basic 
values of civilized humanity. 

The vicious greedy democracy shown by the actions of the 
United States since dropping the atomic bombs on the 
civilian population of Hiroshima and Nagasaki in 1945, 
this really makes the communist socialist system the main 
enemy of US democracy that must be removed from the 
face of the Earth by any means.  

Whereas the true values of socialism were born since the 
stone age, because humans appeared on this Earth not 
directly creating money, humans did not directly create 
technology, humans were born through the evolution 
from its primitive religions.  

If humans appear, it is certain that civilization will emerge 
in all its complexity.  



 
 

Because civilization is related to the writing of human 
history, the written history of human activity is the 
starting point of civilization.  

About 6000 years ago, human civilization emerged, while 
we know the age of the universe was 13.8 billion years 
ago. Why do humans seem to suddenly appear this fast? 
This is the big question[2].  

Whether civilization will reach the age of 100,000 years, 
this too is still a very very big question.  

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

When human started civilization 6000 years ago, it will 
start also religious socialism, intellectual socialism, cultural 
socialism by random statistically varies of 
human races colors, countries around one globe of one 
Earth. Religious socialism [6] is a type of socialism based 
on religious values. Members of several major religions 
have found that their beliefs about human society fit with 
socialist principles and ideas[58].  

Earth Civilization

100,000 yrs ??

6500 yrs

0
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As a result, religious socialist movements have developed 
within these religions. Those movements include Buddhist 
socialism, Christian socialism, Islamic socialism and Jewish 
socialism. According to the Encyclopedia Britannica 
Online, socialism is a "social and economic doctrine that 
calls for public rather than private ownership or control of 
property and natural resources. According to the socialist 
view, individuals do not live or work in isolation but live in 
cooperation with one another. Furthermore, everything 
that people produce is in some sense a social product, and 
everyone who contributes to the production of a good is 
entitled to a share in it. Society as a whole, therefore, 
should own or at least control property for the benefit of 
all its members. Early Christian communities also practiced 
the sharing of goods and labour, a simple form of 
socialism subsequently followed in certain forms of 
monasticism. Several monastic orders continue these 
practices today". 

The teachings of Jesus are frequently described as 
socialist, especially by Christian socialists. Acts 4:35 
records that in the early church in Jerusalem  one claimed 
that any of their possessions was their own", although the 
pattern would later disappear from church history except 
within monasticism. Christian socialism was one of the 
founding threads of the British Labour Party and is 
claimed to begin with the uprising of Wat Tyler and John 
Ball in the 14th century CE. 

Abu Dharr al-Ghifari, a Companion of Muhammad, is 
credited by multiple authors as a principal antecedent of 
Islamic socialism. 
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The Christian socialist Hutterites believed in strict 
adherence to biblical principles, "church discipline" and 
practiced a religious form of communism. The Hutterites 
"established in their communities a rigorous system of 
Ordnungen, which were codes of rules and regulations 
that governed all aspects of life and ensured a unified 
perspective. As an economic system, Christian communism 
was attractive to many of the peasants who supported 
social revolution in sixteenth century central Europe" such 
as the German Peasants' War and "Friedrich Engels thus 
came to view Anabaptists as proto-Communists". 

Religious socialism was the early form of socialism and pre-
Marxist communism. In Christian Europe, communists 
were believed to have adopted atheism. In Protestant 
England, communism was too close to the Roman Catholic 
communion rite, hence socialist was the preferred term. 
Friedrich Engels argued that in 1848, when The 
Communist Manifesto was published, socialism was 
respectable in Europe while communism was not. The 
Owenites in England and the Fourierists in France were 
considered respectable socialists while working-class 
movements that "proclaimed the necessity of total social 
change" denoted themselves communists. This branch of 
socialism produced the communist work of Étienne Cabet 
in France and Wilhelm Weitling in Germany. 

There are those who view that the early Christian Church 
such as that one described in the Acts of the Apostles was 
an early form of communism and religious socialism. The 
view is that communism was just Christianity in practice 
and Jesus as the first communist.  This link was 
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highlighted in one of Karl Marx's early writings which 
stated that  Christ is the intermediary unto whom man 
unburdens all his divinity, all his religious bonds, so the 
state is the mediator unto which he transfers all his 
Godlessness, all his human liberty". Furthermore, Thomas 
Müntzer led a large Anabaptist communist movement 
during the German Peasants' War which Engels analysed 
in The Peasant War in Germany. The Marxist ethos that 
aims for unity reflects the Christian universalist teaching 
that humankind is one and that there is only one god who 
does not discriminate among people. Pre-Marxist 
communism was also present in the attempts to establish 
communistic societies such as those made by the Essenes 
and by the Judean desert sect. 

In the 16th century, English writer Thomas More, who is 
venerated in the Catholic Church as Saint Thomas More, 
portrayed a society based on common ownership of 
property in his treatise Utopia, whose leaders 
administered it through the application of reason.Several 
groupings in the English Civil War supported this idea, but 
especially the Diggers, who espoused clear communistic 
yet agrarian ideals. Oliver Cromwell and the Grandees' 
attitude to these groups was at best ambivalent and often 
hostile. Criticism of the idea of private property continued 
into the Enlightenment era of the 18th century through 
such thinkers as the deeply religious Jean-Jacques 
Rousseau. Raised a Calvinist, Rousseau was influenced by 
the Jansenist movement within the Roman Catholic 
Church. The Jansenist movement originated from the 
most orthodox Roman Catholic bishops who tried to 
reform the Roman Catholic Church in the 17th century to 
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stop secularization and Protestantism. One of the main 
Jansenist aims was democratizing to stop the aristocratic 
corruption at the top of the Church hierarchy. The 
participants of the Taiping Rebellion, who founded the 
Taiping Heavenly Kingdom, a syncretic Christian-Shenic 
theocratic kingdom, are viewed by the Communist Party 
of China as proto-communists. 

Buddhist socialism advocates socialism based on the 
principles of Buddhism. Both Buddhism and socialism seek 
to provide an end to suffering by analyzing its conditions 
and removing its main causes through praxis. Both also 
seek to provide a transformation of personal 
consciousness (respectively, spiritual and political) to bring 
an end to human alienation and selfishness. People who 
have been described as Buddhist socialists include 
Buddhadasa Bhikkhu, B. R. Ambedkar, S. W. R. D. 
Bandaranaike, Han Yong-un, Girō Senoo, U Nu, Uchiyama 
Gudō and Norodom Sihanouk. 

Bhikkhu Buddhadasa coined the phrase "Dhammic 
socialism". He believed that socialism is a natural state, 
meaning all things exist together in one system. Han 
Yong-un felt that equality was one of the main principles 
of Buddhism. In an interview published in 1931, Yong-un 
spoke of his desire to explore Buddhist socialism: "I am 
recently planning to write about Buddhist socialism. Just 
like there is Christian socialism as a system of ideas in 
Christianity, there must be also Buddhist socialism in 
Buddhism." 
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Tenzin Gyatso, the Fourteenth Dalai Lama of Tibet, stated 
that of all the modern economic theories, the economic 
system of Marxism is founded on moral principles, while 
capitalism is concerned only with gain and profitability. 
The failure of the regime in the former Soviet Union was, 
for me, not the failure of Marxism but the failure of 
totalitarianism. For this reason I still think of myself as half-
Marxist, half-Buddhist". 

There are individuals and groups, past and present, that 
are clearly both Christian and socialist such as Frederick 
Denison Maurice, author of The Kingdom of Christ (1838). 
Another example is the Christian Socialist Movement, 
affiliated with the British Labour Party. Distributism is an 
economic philosophy formulated by such Catholic thinkers 
as G. K. Chesterton and Hilaire Belloc to apply the 
principles of social justice articulated by the Roman 
Catholic Church, especially in Pope Leo XIII's encyclical 
Rerum novarum. 

Various Catholic clerical parties have at times referred to 
themselves as Christian Social. Two examples are the 
Christian Social Party of Karl Lueger in Austria before and 
after World War I and the contemporary Christian Social 
Union in Bavaria. Nonetheless, these parties have never 
espoused socialist policies and have always stood at the 
conservative side of Christian democracy. Hugo Chávez of 
Venezuela was an advocate of a form of Christian 
socialism as he claims that Jesus was a socialist. 

Christian anarchism is a Christian movement in political 
theology that combines anarchism and Christianity. The 
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foundation of Christian anarchism is a rejection of 
violence, with Leo Tolstoy's The Kingdom of God Is Within 
You regarded as a key text. Tolstoy sought to separate 
Russian Orthodox Christianity—which was merged with 
the state—from what he believed was the true message of 
Jesus as contained in the Gospels, specifically in the 
Sermon on the Mount. Tolstoy takes the viewpoint that all 
governments who wage war, and churches who in turn 
support those governments, are an affront to the Christian 
principles of nonviolence and nonresistance. Although 
Tolstoy never actually used the term Christian anarchism 
in The Kingdom of God Is Within You, reviews of this book 
following its publication in 1894 appear to have coined 
the term. Christian anarchist groups have included the 
Doukhobors, Catholic Worker Movement and the 
Brotherhood Church. 

Christian communism is a form of religious communism 
based on Christianity. It is a theological and political 
theory based upon the view that the teachings of Jesus 
Christ compel Christians to support communism as the 
ideal social system. Although there is no universal 
agreement on the exact date when Christian communism 
was founded, many Christian communists assert that 
evidence from the Bible (in the Acts of the Apostles) 
suggests that the first Christians, including the apostles, 
established their own small communist society in the years 
following Jesus' death and resurrection. As such, many 
advocates of Christian communism argue that it was 
taught by Jesus and practiced by the apostles themselves. 
Some independent historians confirm it 
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Islamic socialism incorporates Islamic principles to 
socialism. As a term, it was coined by various Muslim 
leaders to describe a more spiritual form of socialism. 
Scholars have highlighted the similarities between the 
Islamic economic system and socialist theory as both 
socialism and Islam are against unearned income. Muslim 
socialists believe that the teachings of the Quran and 
Muhammad—especially the zakat—are compatible with 
principles of socialism. They draw inspiration from the 
early Medinan welfare state established by Muhammad. 
Muslim socialists found their roots in anti-imperialism. 
Muslim socialist leaders believe in the derivation of 
legitimacy from the public[57]. 

Islamic socialism is the political ideology of Libya's 
Muammar al-Gaddafi, former Iraqi president Ahmed 
Hassan al-Bakr, Syrian president Hafez Al-Assad and of 
Zulfikar Ali Bhutto, the Pakistani leader of Pakistan 
Peoples Party. The Green Book, written by Gaddafi, 
consists of three parts, namely "The Solution of the 
Problem of Democracy: 'The Authority of the People'", "The 
Solution of the Economic Problem: 'Socialism'" and "The 
Social Basis of the Third Universal Theory". The book is 
controversial because it completely rejects modern 
conceptions of liberal democracy and encourages the 
institution of a form of direct democracy based on popular 
committees. Critics charge that Qaddafi uses these 
committees as tools of autocratic political repression in 
practice. 

Muslim socialists believe that socialism is compatible with 
Islamic teachings and usually embrace secular forms of 
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socialism. However, some Muslim socialists believe that 
socialism should be applied within an Islamic framework 
and numerous Islamic socialist ideologies exist. 

Islamic Marxism attempts to apply Marxist economic, 
political, and social teachings within an Islamic 
framework. Traditional forms of Marxism are anti-religious 
and support atheism, which has led many Muslims to 
reject Marxism. However, the affinity between Marxist and 
Islamic ideals of social justice has led some Muslims to 
embrace their own forms of Marxism since the 1940s. 
Islamic Marxists believe that Islam meets the needs of 
society and can accommodate or guide the social changes 
Marxism hopes to accomplish. Islamic Marxists are also 
dismissive of traditional Marxist views on materialism and 
religion. 

As a term, it has been used to describe Ali Shariati (in 
Shariati and Marx: A Critique of an "Islamic" Critique of 
Marxism by Assef Bayat). It is also sometimes used in 
discussions of the 1979 Iranian Revolution. 

In the modern era, Islamic socialism can be divided into 
two: a left-wing and a right-wing form. The left wing (Siad 
Barre, Haji Misbach, Ali Shariati, Yasser Arafat, Abdullah al-
Alayli, and Jalal Al-e Ahmad) advocated proletarian 
internationalism, the implementation of Islamic Sharia, 
whilst encouraging Muslims to join or collaborate with 
international socialist or Marxist movements. Right-wing 
socialists (Mohammed Iqbal, Agus Salim, Jamal ad-Din 
Asad-Abadi, Musa al-Sadr, and Mahmud Shaltut) are 
ideologically closer to third positionism, supporting not 
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just social justice, egalitarian society and universal 
equality, but also Islamic revivalism and implementation of 
Sharia. They also reject a full adoption of a class struggle 
and keep a distance from other socialist movements. 

Islamic socialism is a political philosophy that incorporates 
Islamic principles into socialism. As a term, it was coined 
by various Muslim leaders to describe a more spiritual form 
of socialism. Islamic socialists believe that the teachings of 
the Quran and Muhammad—especially the zakat—are not 
only compatible with principles of socialism, but also very 
supportive of them. They draw inspiration from the early 
Medinan welfare state established by Muhammad. Muslim 
socialists found their roots in anti-imperialism. This can 
especially be seen in the writings of Salama Moussa, who 
wrote extensively both about socialism, and about 
Egyptian nationalism against British rule. 

Muslim socialist leaders believe in the derivation of 
legitimacy from the public, and wish to implement a 
government based on social welfare and the concept of 
zakat. In practice, this has been seen through guaranteed 
incomes, pensions, and welfare. These practical 
applications of the idea of Islamic socialism have a history 
going back to Muhammad and the first few Caliphates, to 
modern political parties founded in the 1970s. 

Islamic Socialists often use the Quran to defend their 
positions. A Turkish Islamic socialist organisation, Anti-
capitalist Muslims, openly challenged right-wing Muslims 
to read the Quran and "try to disprove the fact that it is 
leftist". 
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Abū Dharr al-Ghifārī, a companion of Muhammad, is 
credited by some scholars, like Muhammad Sharqawi and 
Sami Ayad Hanna, as a principal antecedent of Islamic 
socialism. He protested against the accumulation of 
wealth by the ruling class during Uthman's caliphate and 
urged the equitable redistribution of wealth. The first 
Muslim Caliph Abu Bakr introduced a guaranteed 
minimum standard of income, granting each man, woman 
and child ten dirhams annually—this was later increased to 
twenty dirhams. 

According to Sami A. Hanna and Hanif Ramay, one of the 
first expressions of Islamic socialism was the Wäisi 
movement in Tatarstan, Russia in the late 19th and early 
20th centuries. The movement opposed the rule of the 
Russian Empire and was supported by Muslim farmers, 
peasants and petite bourgeoisie. It suffered repression by 
the Russian authorities and went underground in the 
early 20th century, when it started cooperating with 
communists, socialists and social democrats in anti-
government activity, and started identifying itself as an 
Islamic socialist movement in the wake of the 1905 
Russian Revolution. The movement aligned with the 
Bolsheviks during the Russian Revolution of 1917, during 
which the movement also established the first 
experimental Islamic commune. The Muslim Socialist 
Committee of Kazan was also active at this time. After the 
death of Lenin in 1924, the Wäisi movement asserted its 
independence from the Communist Party, however it was 
suppressed during the Great Purge in the 1930s. 



  36 
 

Soviet decision makers recognized that revolutionary 
activity along the Soviet Union's southern border would 
draw the attention of capitalist powers and invite them to 
intervene. It was this understanding which prompted the 
Russian representation at the Baku Congress in September 
1920 to reject the arguments of the national communists 
as impractical and counterproductive to the revolution in 
general, without elaborating their fear that the safety of 
Russia lay in the balance. It was this understanding, 
coupled with the Russian Bolsheviks' displeasure at seeing 
another revolutionary center proposed in their own 
domain revolutionary, that galvanized them into action 
against the national communists. 

The Iranian intellectual Muhammed Nakhshab is credited 
with the first synthesis between Shi'ism and European 
socialism. Nakhshab's movement was based on the tenet 
that Islam and socialism were not incompatible since both 
sought to accomplish social equality and justice. His 
theories had been expressed in his B.A. thesis on the laws 
of ethics. In 1943, Nakhshab founded the Movement of 
God-Worshipping Socialists, one of six original member 
organizations of the National Front. The organization was 
founded through the merger of two groupings, 
Nakhshab's circle of high school students at Dar al-Fanoun 
and Jalaleddin Ashtiyani's circle of about 25 students at 
the Faculty of Engineering at Tehran University. The 
organization was initially known as League of Patriotic 
Muslims. It combined religious sentiments, nationalism 
and socialist thoughts. After the 1953 coup against the 
National Front-led government of Mohammad 
Mosaddegh, Islamic socialism in Iran took a more radical 
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turn, with the Organization of Struggle for the 
Emancipation of the Working Class, using Marxist ideas 
under the influence of Ali Shariati and engaging in armed 
struggle against the government of the Shah of Iran, 
culminating in its participation in the Iranian Revolution 
which overthrew the Shah in 1979. However the 
movement fell foul of the Islamic Republic established 
after the Revolution. 

In South Asia, the Deobandi scholar and Indian 
independence activist Ubaidullah Sindhi travelled to 
Russia via Afghanistan in the 1910s. He remained in post-
revolution Russia until 1923, where he studied socialism 
and engaged in discussions with communist 
revolutionaries. From Russia he moved on to Turkey, 
where he developed his ideas on Islamic socialism, 
drawing parallels between Islam and communism in their 
emphasis on the fair distribution of wealth. 

Islamic socialism was also essential to the ideology of 
Pakistan, as its founder, Muhammad Ali Jinnah, to a crowd 
in Chittagong on March 26, 1948 declared that "you are 
only voicing my sentiments and the sentiments of millions 
of Musalmans when you say that Pakistan should be 
based on sure foundations of social justice and Islamic 
socialism which emphasizes equality and brotherhood of 
man", while Pakistan's first Prime Minister, Liaquat Ali 
Khan, on 25 August 1949, said in the same vein that: 

There are a number of 'isms' being talked about now-a-
days, but we are convinced that for us there is only one 
'ism', namely Islamic Socialism, which in a nutshell, means 
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that every person in this land has equal rights to be 
provided with food, shelter, clothing, education and 
medical facilities. Countries which cannot ensure these for 
their people can never progress. The economic 
programme drawn up some 1,350 years back is still the 
best economic programme for us. In fact, whatever 
systems people may try out they all ultimately return to 
Islamic Socialism by whatever name they may choose to 
call it. 

Jinnah's Muslim League, which was the first ruling party in 
Pakistan, contained a number of Islamic socialists, 
although they were relatively marginal in the party. Also 
influential in Pakistan was Ghulam Ahmed Perwez, an 
Islamic scholar who advocated Quranism and a focus on 
the study of modern sciences. Although he was criticised 
by more conservative scholars, he became aligned with 
Jinnah and Muhammad Iqbal, the former of whom 
appointed him as the editor of the magazine Talu-e-Islam, 
where he wrote and published articles espousing a 
socialistic interpretation of the Quran, arguing that 
"socialism best enforces Qur’anic dictums on property, 
justice and distribution of wealth", and advocating a 
progressive, non-theocratic government and the 
application of science and agrarian reform to further 
economic development. Perwez, as a part of his 
application of qur'anic thought to political ideology, 
stated that hell was a "... society in which men, dominated 
by its evil socio-economic system, struggle to accumulate 
wealth. 
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During the dictatorship of Ayub Khan in Pakistan in the 
1960s, Hanif Ramay led a group of intellectuals in Lahore 
in developing Islamic socialist ideas, drawing on the 
thought of Perwez and Khalifa Abdul Hakim, along with 
Ba'athist thinkers such as Michel Aflaq. Ramay and his co-
thinkers influenced Zulfikar Ali Bhutto when he founded 
the Pakistan Peoples Party with Jalaludin Abdur Rahim, 
and they were the primary ideological influence on the 
party's manifesto. Ramay outlined the priorities for the 
PPP's brand of Islamic socialism as including elimination of 
feudalism and uncontrolled capitalism, greater state 
regulation of the economy, nationalisation of major banks, 
industries and schools, encouraging participatory 
management in factories and building democratic 
institutions. They contextualised these policies as a 
modern extension of principles of equality and justice 
contained in the Quran and practiced under the authority 
of Muhammad in Medina and Mecca. However, during 
Bhutto's time in power during the 1970s, he scaled back 
his reform programme and deepened Pakistan's ties with 
the conservative, oil-rich Gulf monarchies following the 
1973 oil crisis, and purged the PPP's radical left and made 
concessions to Islamist parties in an effort to appease 
them. 

In Indonesia, former Communist Tan Malaka was an 
influential Islamic socialist thinker during the country's 
independence struggle, arguing that communism and 
Islam were compatible and that they should form the 
foundation for Indonesia's national revolution, and 
believing that Islam could be used to unify the working 
classes across the Muslim world. Although Malaka died in 
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1949, the same year that Indonesia achieved 
independence, the nation's first president Sukarno drew 
upon his ideas: he espoused ideological concepts which 
incorporated both religious and socialistic ideas, such as 
Pancasila and Nasakom. 

Although it was Marxist, the People's Democratic Party of 
Afghanistan (which took power after the country's Saur 
Revolution) started utilising rhetoric stressing similarities 
between socialism and Islam after its reforms provoked 
opposition from religious conservatives and landowners. 

From the Quran itself, the quote "Man is entitled only to 
what is due to his effort" has been used to in argument for 
Islamic Socialism, as an argument against the accretion of 
wealth through the manipulation of capital. Sura 7:128, 
"the land belongs to God," has also been used in a similar 
purpose 

One of the Five Pillars of Islam, zakāt is the practice of 
imposition (not charity) giving based on accumulated 
wealth (approximately 2.5% of all financial assets owned 
over the course of one lunar year). It is obligatory for all 
financially able Muslim adults and is considered to be an 
act of piety through which one expresses concern for the 
well-being of fellow Muslims as well as preserving social 
harmony between the wealthy and the poor. The zakat 
promotes a more equitable redistribution of wealth and 
fosters a sense of solidarity amongst members of the 
ummah (meaning "community"). 
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Zakat is meant to discourage the hoarding of capital and 
stimulate investment. Because the individual must pay 
zakat on the net wealth, wealthy Muslims are compelled 
to invest in profitable ventures, or otherwise see their 
wealth slowly erode. Furthermore, means of production 
such as equipment, factories and tools are exempt from 
zakat, which further provides the incentive to invest 
wealth in productive businesses. Personal assets such as 
clothing, household furniture and one residence are not 
considered zakatable assets. 

According to the Quran, there are eight categories of 
people (asnaf) who qualify to receive zakat funds: 

 Those living in absolute poverty (Al-Fuqarā'). 
 Those restrained because they cannot meet their basic 

needs (Al-Masākīn). 
 The zakat collectors themselves (Al-Āmilīna 'Alaihā). 
 Non-Muslims who are sympathetic to Islam or wish to 

convert to Islam (Al-Mu'allafatu Qulūbuhum). 
 People whom one is attempting to free from slavery or 

bondage. Also includes paying ransom or blood money, 
i.e. diya (Fir-Riqāb). 

 Those who have incurred overwhelming debts while 
attempting to satisfy their basic needs (Al-Ghārimīn). 

 Those fighting for a religious cause or a cause of God 
(Fī Sabīlillāh) or for the jihad in the way of Allah or 
those not a part of salaried soldiers. 

 Children of the street, or travellers (Ibnus-Sabīl). 

According to the Hadith, the family of Muhammad should 
not consume any zakat. Zakat should not be given to 
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one's own parents, grandparents, children, grandchildren, 
or spouses. Also it is forbidden to disburse zakat funds into 
investments instead of being directly given to those who 
are in need. Some scholars disagree whether the poor 
who qualify should include non-Muslims. Some state that 
zakat may be paid to non-Muslims, but only after the 
needs of Muslims have been met. Fi Sabillillah is the most 
prominent asnaf in Southeast Asian Muslim societies, 
where it broadly construed to include funding missionary 
work, Quranic schools, and anything else that serves the 
community in general. Zakat can be used to finance a 
jihad effort in the path of Allah. Zakat money should be 
used, provided the effort is to raise the banner of Islam. 
Additionally, the zakat funds may be spent on the 
administration of a centralized zakat collection system. 

Historically, Abul A'la Maududi championed the concept 
of Zakat. According to Maududi, Zakat should be primarily 
in the form of taxation from a position called the 
exchequer, who would manage the Zakat collected and 
make sure that it was distributed correctly. Should 
someone die with no family to pass on their wealth, then 
this wealth would be given to the exchequer for 
management. 

In the United Kingdom and according to a self-reported 
poll of 4000 people conducted by Zarine Kharas, Muslims 
today give more to charity than people of other religions. 
Today, conservative estimates of annual zakat are 
estimated to be 15 times global humanitarian aid 
contributions. 
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1.4. Religious Socialism’s on top civilization pyramid 

For 100 years from 1900-2000 AD, the United States and 
European countries glorified that they were the 
innovators of new technology, they were the owners of 
civilization, and this was the result of the democratic 
process of freedom of expression and choice that they did. 
But remember at the beginning of its civilization journey, 
Europe had ever chosen the jihadist path through 
religious wars in 700-1100 AD.  

When now 2000 AD China takes over the leadership of 
world technology trade, Western thinkers must realize 
that all this is just a game of civilization created by God 
Almighty. Perhaps before there was a nuclear bomb, war 
engineering theory could be applied to maintain 
hegemony.  

The conclusion is simple, so high intelligence, high-tech 
products of Western civilization, it is just a game of 
civilization. In fact, Earth is only one. Perhaps imagining 
exploration around Earth globe, it seems this can also be 
done interstellar exploration between galaxies. It turned 
out to be all absurd nonsense with pride in the results of 
human technology.  

What has been achieved is that nuclear technology allows 
humans to destroy each other, humans actually create 
hellfire, this is completely absurd. So get rid of the 
assumption that USA Europe civilization is the owner of 
the capitalist media Youtube, Twitter, Facebook, Google 
which can distort the truth of information. 

 



 
 

It's perhaps simple, why do Western democracies, 
especially the USA, hate the hammer and sickle symbol so 
much? This is based on the theory of human rights, that 
every human being has the right to freedom of choice, 
while communism limits choices, where there is only one 
way of socialism.  

The progress of today's technological civilization, 
according to Western thinkers, is due to the freedom of 
democracy in all choices. In reality the choice of civilization 
is only one Earth found in the universe.  

After Columbus circled the earth, humans kept asking if 
there was another earth from 1500 AD to 2000 AD. It 
turned out to be an absurd answer. The age of civilization 
is only 6000 years, why should we need 20,000 years to 
get to the nearest star system Alpha Centauri.
civilization only has one choice, like it or not, humans must 
be able to become civilized socialists. It was destiny from 
God Almighty, end goals  of religious socialism 
of pyramid of civilization. 
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When the war between Russia and Ukraine in 2022 was 
provoked by the USA and NATO, Russia always 
threatened the use of nuclear weapons. Let's use simple 
math, if a 15 kT nuclear bomb can kill 100,000 humans, 
then 1 unit of 450 kT can kill 3,000,000 humans. If Russia 
has 6000 units of nuclear bombs @ 450 kT, then it can 
eliminate 6000 x 3 million = 18 billion humans, whereas 
the 2022 population of humans is 8,000 billion. The stupid 
meaning is that humans can beat the creation of God 
Almighty who patiently for billions of years made the 
design of evolutionary life, starting from a mathematical 
algorithm program, then there were millions of species. It 
was all made 3.8 billion years. Predictions of religions 
since the stone age, it proved to be true, humans will 
make mischief on Earth until the Day of Judgment comes.  

If only there were changes in this decade from 2022 to 
2032, satanic democracy with imperialism from the USA 
and NATO, received guidance from God Almighty to pave 
the way for peace in China vs Taiwan and North Korea vs 
South Korea, and of course peace in Europe. But if it 
doesn't, and there is a nuclear war, then the truth of the 
predictions of religions are proven, the terms hell, 
armageddon, it's like humans themselves have an intuition 
for the future. Humans mostly don't have time to see the 
strangeness of large mathematical numbers from the 
passage of time in the universe, why the civilization 
number is 6000, why the evolution number of life is 
3,800,000,000, why the universe number is 
13,800,000,000. Just imagine the algorithm. The number 
6000 seems to be at the end or at the beginning of the 
journey of space-time. Religions are right.  



 
 

1.5. Islam Made Christianity Spread To Europe 750

The story of European 
kingdoms finally embracing 
Christianity 
paganism) can be seen from the 
chronology of the invasion of 
Islamic kingdoms to Europe in 
the 6-7 century.  
It was the Islamic 
factor that made Christianity 
spread throughout the 
European kingdoms in 750 AD, 
then they became jihadists who 
traveled thousands of 

kilometers to the Middle East for the Crusade war in 1000 
AD. Finally Europe got the miracle of a new awareness 
the Rennaissance and then Europe initiated a journey 
around the world, a new continent was discovered, a new 
invasion, a new colonialism. 
Let’s see the Battle of Tours in 732 AD[67].
Caliphate led by Abdul Rahman Al Ghafiqi invades 
Kingdom of Franks, France. If we look at the year 732 AD, 
it turns out that the Frankish Kingdom was still a Frankish 
paganism, but virtually all Franks shifted to Chalcedonian 
Christianity by 750 AD.  The Battle of Tours, also called the 
Battle of Poitiers and, by Arab sources, the Battle of the 
Highway of the Martyrs was fought on 10 October 732, 
and was an important battle during the Umayyad invasion 
of Gaul. It resulted in victory by the Frankish and 
Aquitainian forces under Charles Martel ove
Umayyad Caliphate led by Abdul Rahman Al Ghafiqi, 
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Governor-General of al-Andalus. Details of the battle, 
including the number of combatants and its exact 
location, are unclear from the surviving sources[68].  
 
Most sources agree that the Umayyads had a larger force 
and suffered heavier losses. Remarkably, the Frankish 
troops apparently fought without heavy cavalry. The 
battlefield was located somewhere between the cities of 
Poitiers and Tours, in Aquitaine in western France, near 
the border of the Frankish realm and the then-
independent Duchy of Aquitaine under Odo the Great. 
 
Al Ghafiqi was killed in combat, and the Umayyad army 
withdrew after the battle. The battle helped lay the 
foundations of the Carolingian Empire and Frankish 
supremacy of western Europe for the next century. Most 
historians agree that the establishment of Frankish power 
in western Europe shaped that continent's destiny and the 
Battle of Tours confirmed that power. 

 
Islam Timeline 637-647 AD 

637 Conquest of Jerusalem 

640 Battle of Babylon in Egypt. 

641 Conquest of Alexandria in Egypt. 

642 Conquest of Egypt. 

643 Conquest of Azarbaijan  
646 Muslims invade Armenia 

647 Muslims invade North Africa.  

 
 
 



 
 

Islam Timeline 648-677AD 
648 Muslims battle against the Byzantines.

655 Naval battle against the Byzantines.

670 Advance in North Africa 
674 The Muslims cross the Oxus. Bukhara 

becomes a vassal state. 

677 Occupation of Samarkand and Tirmiz. 
Siege of Constantinople. 

Age of Caliphs 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Spread of Christianity 597-664 in West Europe England
Christianization of Anglo-Saxon England began around 
600, influenced by the Gregorian mission from the 
southeast and the Hiberno-Scottish mission from the 
northwest. Augustine, the first Archbishop of Canterbury, 
took office in 597. Arwald, the last pagan Anglo
king, was killed in 686. 
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Germanic peoples :Colombanus, Boniface, Willibrord, and 
others took Christianity into northern Europe and spread 
Catholicism among the Germanic and Slavic peoples. The 
Synod of Whitby of 664, though not as decisive as 
sometimes claimed, was an important moment in the 
reintegration of the Celtic Church of the British Isles into 
the Roman hierarchy, after having been effectively cut 
from contact with Rome by the pagan invaders. 
The Alamanni became Christians after a period of 
syncretism during the 7th century, by gradual emulation 
of the new religion of the Merovingian elite. 
Christian missionaries to the Anglo-Saxons include: 
Augustine of Canterbury,Laurence of Canterbury, Mellitus, 
Justus Chad of Mercia, Saint Honorius, Aidan of 
Lindisfarne,Saint Trudpert (Irish, 7th century), Saint 
Rumbold 
 
Francia Empire. Francia, also called the Kingdom of the 
Franks was the largest post-Roman barbarian kingdom in 
Western Europe. It was ruled by the Franks during Late 
Antiquity and the Early Middle Ages. After the Treaty of 
Verdun in 843, West Francia became the predecessor of 
France, and East Francia became that of Germany. Francia 
was among the last surviving Germanic kingdoms from 
the Migration Period era before its partition in 843. 
 
The core Frankish territories inside the former Western 
Roman Empire were close to the Rhine and Maas rivers in 
the north. After a period where small kingdoms inter-
acted with the remaining Gallo-Roman institutions to their 
south, a single kingdom uniting them was founded by 
Clovis I who was crowned King of the Franks in 496. His 
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dynasty, the Merovingian dynasty, was eventually 
replaced by the Carolingian dynasty. Under the nearly 
continuous campaigns of Pepin of Herstal, Charles Martel, 
Pepin the Short, Charlemagne, and Louis the Pious—
father, son, grandson, great-grandson and great-great-
grandson—the greatest expansion of the Frankish empire 
was secured by the early 9th century, by this point dubbed 
as the Carolingian Empire. 
 
During the Merovingian and Carolingian dynasties the 
Frankish realm was one large kingdom polity subdivided 
into several smaller kingdoms, often effectively 
independent. The geography and number of 
subkingdoms varied over time, but a basic split between 
eastern and western domains persisted. The eastern 
kingdom was initially called Austrasia, centred on the 
Rhine and Meuse, and expanding eastwards into central 
Europe. It evolved into a German kingdom, the Holy 
Roman Empire. The western kingdom Neustria was 
founded in Northern Roman Gaul, and as the original 
kingdom of the Merovingians it came over time to be 
referred to as Francia, now France, although in other 
contexts western Europe generally could still be described 
as "Frankish". In Germany there are notorious other places 
named after the Franks such as the region of Franconia, 
the city of Frankfurt, and Frankenstein Castle. 

 

I think not many in the Western world in the USA and 
Europe know that the Islamic religion was the main cause 
of the spread of Christianity in Europe in 750 AD. So the 
religious factor that accelerated the clash of civilizations 
which then gave birth to the Rennaissance followed by 
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the Industrial Revolution. But if Europe and the USA feel 
that they are the owners of the future civilization, they are 
wrong. Because every civilization is a natural game 
created by God Almighty.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Religions are the colors of the game of the soul that last 
forever. If China is the future leader of the next 500 years, 
then civilization in Europe and the United States recedes 
due to thinking like a master of the inventor of the nuclear 
bomb, that is the law of the mystery game of the soul. 

 

 

Other 

Christian

IslamChinese 
Traditional

Orthodox 
Christian

Hindu

Buddha
Atheism

Colors of Mind Game



 
 

1.6. Islamophobia  since Crusade Wars 1000 AD

 

 

 

 

 

 

So the picture of satanic democracy is characterized by a 
great hatred of Islam since the Crusades in 1000 AD until 
2000 AD now, they have an eternal character as 
Islamophobia. Then after the first world war 1900 AD, 
they hated the hammer and sickle symbol associated with 
communism (Russophobia, Chinaphobia). Satanic 
democracy continues to campaign against socialism as an 
atheist that can be eliminated without trial. While the 
characteristics of Civilized Socialism are civilized religious 
and aware that the Earth is only one in the universe.
Islamophobia in Western Europe and the USA continues 
to be pumped with terrible provocations, even though we 
know that in Russia, which is dominated by Christianity, in 
reality Christianity and Islam in ex Uni Soviet countries 
have formed the format of national cohesion since 1000 
years ago. Russian ethnic groups who are Muslim have 
contributed to the development of the Russian state 
since 1000 AD, and until now are part of the cohesiveness 

Civilized
Socialism

Religious

Earth-One
Socialism
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Democracy
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of the multi-ethnic and multi-religious Russian nation 
state.  We see that during the war between Rus
Ukraine, the Russians showed national cohesiveness by 
assigning the Islamic Chechen state army to fight in 
Mariupol and other cities in Ukraine. Meanwhile, NATO 
countries which are dominated by Islamophobic countries 
such as France, England, Sweden, Germany, are indeed 
countries that have been fighting against 
countries/kingdoms since 1000 AD in the Middle East. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

At that time the year 800-1000 AD, the campaign of 
Islamophobia echoed by European Popes in France. We 
see the impact until now in this millennium century. But all 
of that was a game of civilization that gave birth to the 
Western Rennaissance, which gave birth to the Industrial 
Revolution, continues to give  Western Civilization today.
Next we see for almost 1500 years from 600 AD until now 
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2022 AD, the powerful echo of mystical words continues 
to have an extraordinary life spirit.  

 

 

 

 

Allah is the Greatest. Allah is the Greatest.

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The Arab-Byzantine wars, begun in the 7th century, were 
essentially over by 995, and Byzantine emperor Basil II 
was able to extend the empire's territorial recovery to its 

 

732 AD
•Allahu Akbar of Battle Tours in France 

1000 
AD

•Allahu Akbar of Crusade War Middle East

1200 
AD

•Allahu Akbar of Genghis Khan, Kublai Khan Islamic 
Mercenaries (Turk-Russia, Kazakh, Mongol, China) of  
World Greatest Invader. 

1453 
AD

•Allahu Akbar of Constantinople Fall 

2022 
AD

•Allahu Akbar of Chechen Ukraine War
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furthest extent in 1025, with frontiers stretching east to 
Iran.  

It controlled Bulgaria, much of southern Italy and 
suppressed piracy in the Mediterranean Sea. The empire's 
relationships with its Islamic neighbours were no more 
quarrelsome than its relationships with the Slavs and the 
Western Christians. The Normans in Italy, to the north 
Pechenegs, Serbs and Cumans, and Seljuk Turks in the east 
all competed with the empire. The political situation in the 
Middle East was changed by waves of Turkish migration—
in particular, the arrival of the Seljuk Turks in the 10th 
century. Previously a minor ruling clan from Transoxania, 
they were recent converts to Islam who migrated into Iran 
to seek their fortune. In two decades, they conquered Iran, 
Iraq, and the Near East. Byzantium's attempted 
confrontation in 1071 to suppress the Seljuks' sporadic 
raiding led to the defeat at the battle of Manzikert. In the 
same year, Jerusalem was taken from the Fatimids by the 
Turkish warlord Atsiz, who seized most of Syria and 
Palestine as part of the expansion of the Seljuks 
throughout the Middle East. The Seljuk hold on the city 
resulting in pilgrims reported difficulties and the 
oppression of Christians. The result was the First Crusade. 

The Crusades were a series of religious wars initiated, 
supported, and sometimes directed by the Latin Church in 
the medieval period. The best known of these Crusades 
are those to the Holy Land in the period between 1095 
and 1291 that were intended to recover Jerusalem and its 
surrounding area from Islamic rule. Concurrent military 
activities in the Iberian Peninsula against the Moors (the 
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Reconquista) and in northern Europe against pagan West 
Slavic, Baltic and Finnic peoples (the Northern Crusades) 
also became known as crusades. Through the 15th 
century, other church-sanctioned crusades were fought 
against heretical Christian sects, against the Byzantine 
and Ottoman empires, to combat paganism and heresy, 
and for political reasons. Unsanctioned by the church, 
Popular Crusades of ordinary citizens were also frequent. 
Beginning with the First Crusade which resulted in the 
recovery of Jerusalem in 1099, dozens of Crusades were 
fought, providing a focal point of European history for 
centuries. 

In 1095, Pope Urban II proclaimed the First Crusade at the 
Council of Clermont. He encouraged military support for 
Byzantine emperor Alexios I against the Seljuk Turks and 
called for an armed pilgrimage to Jerusalem. Across all 
social strata in western Europe, there was an enthusiastic 
popular response. The first Crusaders had a variety of 
motivations, including religious salvation, satisfying feudal 
obligations, opportunities for renown, and economic or 
political advantage. Later crusades were generally 
conducted by more organized armies, sometimes led by a 
king. All were granted papal indulgences. Initial successes 
established four Crusader states: the County of Edessa; the 
Principality of Antioch; the Kingdom of Jerusalem; and the 
County of Tripoli. The Crusader presence remained in the 
region in some form until the fall of Acre in 1291. After 
this, there were no further crusades to recover the Holy 
Land. 
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Proclaimed a crusade in 1123, the struggle between the 
Christians and Muslims in the Iberian Peninsula was called 
the Reconquista by Christians, and only ended in 1492 
with the fall of the Muslim Emirate of Granada. From 
1147, campaigns in Northern Europe against pagan tribes 
were considered crusades.  
 
In 1199, Pope Innocent III began the practice of 
proclaiming political crusades against Christian heretics. In 
the 13th century, crusading was used against the Cathars 
in Languedoc and against Bosnia; this practice continued 
against the Waldensians in Savoy and the Hussites in 
Bohemia in the 15th century and against Protestants in 
the 16th. From the mid-14th century, crusading rhetoric 
was used in response to the rise of the Ottoman Empire, 
only ending in 1699 with the War of the Holy League. 

Islamophobia is the fear of, hatred of, or prejudice against 
the religion of Islam or Muslims in general, especially 
when seen as a geopolitical force or a source of terrorism. 

The scope and precise definition of the term Islamophobia 
is the subject of debate. Some scholars consider it to be a 
form of xenophobia or racism, some consider 
Islamophobia and racism to be closely related or partially 
overlapping phenomena, while others dispute any 
relationship; primarily on the grounds that religion is not a 
race. 

On 15 March 2022, the United Nations General Assembly 
adopted a resolution by consensus which was introduced 
by Pakistan on behalf of the Organisation of Islamic 



 
 

Cooperation that proclaimed March 15 as 'International 
Day to Combat Islamophobia'.  

So we keep seeing that man will continue to f
precisely the religious wars of 1000 AD that accelerated 
humans to find industrial technology followed by global 
information technology, but divisions between ethnic 
groups on earth will continue.   

The question is, why not the Romans or China 
who invented industrial technology and internet 
information technology between 500-1000 AD. 
mystery of the game of civilization made by God Almighty.
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So we keep seeing that man will continue to fight. It is 
precisely the religious wars of 1000 AD that accelerated 
humans to find industrial technology followed by global 
information technology, but divisions between ethnic 

The question is, why not the Romans or China or Turkey 
who invented industrial technology and internet 

1000 AD. That is the 
mystery of the game of civilization made by God Almighty. 

 



 
 

1.7. Capitalism of Satanic Information Wars 

Currently in milennium, mass media capitalism shows the 
media as satanic news information, news that misleads 
the world, news that incites hostility, news that is 
intentionally faked. The 2022 war between Russia and 
Ukraine is an example of a mass media war, the war of lies 
in mass media capitalism against the shards of true 
information that has been marginalized and deliberately 
marginalized.  

At this millennium, it is the age of global internet with 
high speed, it can be said that the speed of information 
data via the internet is approaching the speed of light via 
fiber optics or electromagnetic waves via satellite.
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Human technology is already high, but humans are born 
every day, will continue to follow biological statistics rules, 
where the percentage of people who are lucky to be 
intelligent is small, so what we see today is the fact that 
the large capitalist information media will dominate with 
news according to their wishes. their own freedom, the 
true news will be hidden, and of course the statistics of 
human intelligence will speak, where many people will be 
lied to and provoked by the flood of fake news, the 
magnitude of the misleading news. 

The theory of democracy relies on the implicit assumption 
that voters are well informed about social issues, policies, 
and candidates so that they can make a truly informed 
decision. Since the late 20'th century there has been a 
growing concern that voters may be poorly informed 
because the news media are focusing more on 
entertainment and gossip and less on serious journalistic 
research on political issues. 

The media professors Michael Gurevitch and Jay Blumler 
have proposed a number of functions that the mass media 
are expected to fulfill in a democracy: 

 Surveillance of the sociopolitical environment 
 Meaningful agenda setting 
 Platforms for an intelligible and illuminating advocacy 
 Dialogue across a diverse range of views 
 Mechanisms for holding officials to account for how 

they have exercised power 
 Incentives for citizens to learn, choose, and become 

involved 
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 A principled resistance to the efforts of forces outside 
the media to subvert their independence, integrity, and 
ability to serve the audience 

 A sense of respect for the audience member, as 
potentially concerned and able to make sense of his or 
her political environment. 

This proposal has inspired a lot of discussions over 
whether the news media are actually fulfilling the 
requirements that a well functioning democracy requires. 
Commercial mass media are generally not accountable to 
anybody but their owners, and they have no obligation to 
serve a democratic function. They are controlled mainly by 
economic market forces. Fierce economic competition may 
force the mass media to divert themselves from any 
democratic ideals and focus entirely on how to survive the 
competition. 

The tabloidization and popularization of the news media 
is seen in an increasing focus on human examples rather 
than statistics and principles. There is more focus on 
politicians as personalities and less focus on political issues 
in the popular media. Election campaigns are covered 
more as horse races and less as debates about ideologies 
and issues. The dominating media focus on spin, conflict, 
and competitive strategies has made voters perceive the 
politicians as egoists rather than idealists. This fosters 
mistrust and a cynical attitude to politics, less civic 
engagement, and less interest in voting. The ability to find 
effective political solutions to social problems is hampered 
when problems tend to be blamed on individuals rather 
than on structural causes. This person-centered focus may 
have far-reaching consequences not only for domestic 
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problems but also for foreign policy when international 
conflicts are blamed on foreign heads of state rather than 
on political and economic structures. A strong media focus 
on fear and terrorism has allowed military logic to 
penetrate public institutions, leading to increased 
surveillance and the erosion of civil rights. 

The responsiveness and accountability of the democratic 
system is compromised when lack of access to substantive, 
diverse, and undistorted information is handicapping the 
citizens' capability of evaluating the political process. The 
fast pace and trivialization in the competitive news media 
is dumbing down the political debate. Thorough and 
balanced investigation of complex political issues does not 
fit into this format. The political communication is 
characterized by short time horizons, short slogans, simple 
explanations, and simple solutions. This is conducive to 
political populism rather than serious deliberation. 

Commercial mass media are often differentiated along the 
political spectrum so that people can hear mainly opinions 
that they already agree with. Too much controversy and 
diverse opinions are not always profitable for the 
commercial news media. Political polarization is emerging 
when different people read different news and watch 
different TV channels. This polarization has been 
worsened by the emergence of the social media that allow 
people to communicate mainly with groups of like-minded 
people, the so-called echo chambers. Extreme political 
polarization may undermine the trust in democratic 
institutions, leading to erosion of civil rights and free 
speech and in some cases even reversion to autocracy. 
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Many media scholars have discussed non-commercial 
news media with public service obligations as a means to 
improve the democratic process by providing the kind of 
political contents that a free market does not provide. The 
World Bank has recommended public service 
broadcasting in order to strengthen democracy in 
developing countries. These broadcasting services should 
be accountable to an independent regulatory body that is 
adequately protected from interference from political and 
economic interests. Public service media have an 
obligation to provide reliable information to voters. Many 
countries have publicly funded radio and television 
stations with public service obligations, especially in 
Europe and Japan, while such media are weak or non-
existent in other countries including the USA. Several 
studies have shown that the stronger the dominance of 
commercial broadcast media over public service media, 
the less the amount of policy-relevant information in the 
media and the more focus on horse race journalism, 
personalities, and the pecadillos of politicians. Public 
service broadcasters are characterized by more policy-
relevant information and more respect for journalistic 
norms and impartiality than the commercial media. 
However, the trend of deregulation has put the public 
service model under increased pressure from competition 
with commercial media. 

The emergence of the internet and the social media has 
profoundly altered the conditions for political 
communication. The social media have given ordinary 
citizens easy access to voice their opinion and share 
information while bypassing the filters of the large news 
media. This is often seen as an advantage for democracy. 
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The new possibilities for communication have 
fundamentally changed the way social movements and 
protest movements operate and organize. The internet 
and social media have provided powerful new tools for 
democracy movements in developing countries and 
emerging democracies, enabling them to bypass 
censorship, voice their opinions, and organize protests. 

A serious problem with the social media is that they have 
no truth filters. The established news media have to guard 
their reputation as trustworthy, while ordinary citizens 
may post unreliable information. In fact, studies show that 
false stories are going more viral than true stories. The 
proliferation of false stories and conspiracy theories may 
undermine public trust in the political system and public 
officials. 

Reliable information sources are essential for the 
democratic process. Less democratic governments rely 
heavily on censorship, propaganda, and misinformation in 
order to stay in power, while independent sources of 
information are able to undermine their legitimacy. 

1.8. China’s New Power Hegemony Next 500 years 
 
Entering the milennium 20th century, there has been a 
change in world hegemony, where China with a 
population of 1.3 billion has started to lead world trade. 
Rapid changes occur in information technology, satellite 
technology, what are the achievements of the country in 
pursuing high scientific technology for the future?   
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In simple logic, the nation which is the leader of world 
trade, it is the winner. Soon China will replace America 
and Western Europe, the US dollar currency will soon be 
dim.  
 
The natural laws of civilization will change the world 
every 500 years, just remember what was happened 2000-
500 = 1500 AD, West European started to global invasion, 
then back to 2000-1500 = 500, Roman empire ended then 
Islamic and Ottoman empires started to global invasion till 
1500 AD.  
 
If today a country like USA has thousands of nuclear 
ballistic missiles as hegemony power but the country 
economy is retreating and dividing, dreaming earthlike 
planet is still 100% impossible, then surely nuclear 
hegemony will soon be eliminated by future civilization. 
 
In next 500 years future, nuclear, solar, wind turbine 
technology will be used globally for power generation, 
and this could make electricity tariff free worldwide, next 
free global telecommunication for better shape of human 
civilization achievements.  
 
Countries that adopt international standard energy 
governance will be the future winners.  
 
The challenges of future  world  are struggles for energy 
justice. Countries that are shackled to an oligarchic 
political system, have foreign debts but are not used to 
create an efficient energy and transportation system, 
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these countries will continue to have political turmoil, 
being pitted against world power hegemony.  
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II. DIRTY WARS OF USA 
SATANIC DEMOCRACY 
(1945-2022) 
2.1. Colonialism Agenda of Democracy Freedom    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

It cannot be denied that the need for democracy is the 
demand for the revolution of human civilization which is 
part of the evolution of Earth's life. The facts show that the 
democracy of freedom provides fierce competition from 
intelligent individuals in the USA and Europe to become 
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global marketable technology innovators. A very clear 
example is internet information technology, 
smartphones, android which was invented by the USA 
civilization. But it is clear that the satanic democracy that 
guides humans to create the first world war and the 
second world war, then human civilization is ready to 
carry out self-annihilation with nuclear war. But it 
becomes a paradox question, why does democracy of 
freedom hate civilized socialism with its hammer and 
sickle symbol? If the democracy of freedom of the USA has 
been able to create new life on the planet Mars, if 
democracy of freedom can create the Moon into a 
habitable place, that is the big question why human
actually short in time in the space-time journey of the 
universe. So in future, there is no democracy freedom 
actually. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

AGE OF USA NATO HEGEMONY 1900-2000 (100 YEARS)

AGE OF WESTERN HEGEMONY 1500-2000 (500 YEARS)
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LIST OF USA SATANIC DEMOCRACY WARS (1-12) 

No 
Satanic 

Democracy 
Wars by USA 

19
45 

19
55 

19
65 

19
75 

19
85 

19
95 

20
05 

20
15 

20
22 

1 South Korea          
2 China 

         
3 Greece 

         
4 Costa Rica 

         
5 Albania 

         
6 Syria 

         
7 Burma and 

China          
8 Egypt 

         
9 Iran 

         
10 Guetemala          
11 Indonesia 

         
12 Vietnam 

         

LIST OF USA SATANIC DEMOCRACY WARS  (13-24) 

No 
Satanic 

Democracy 
Wars by USA 

19
45 

19
55 

19
65 

19
75 

19
85 

19
95 

20
05 

20
15 

20
22 

13 Cuba 
         

14 Congo 
         

15 Laos          
16 

Dominican 
Republic          

17 Brazil 
         

18 Iraq 
         

19 Cambodia 
         

20 Chile          
21 Bolivia 

         
22 Ethiopia 

         
23 Angola 

         
24 Argentina 
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LIST OF USA SATANIC DEMOCRACY WARS (25-35) 

No 
Satanic 

Democracy 
Wars by USA 

19
45 

19
55 

19
65 

19
75 

19
85 

19
95 

20
05 

20
15 

20
22 

25 Afghanistan 
         

26 Poland 
         

27 Chad 
         

28 Nicaragua 
         

29 Grenada 
         

30 Panama          
31 Haiti 

         
32 Zaire 

         
33 Yugoslavia 

         
34 Palestina 

         
35 Libya 

         

In fact, the campaign for democratic freedom that has 
been carried out by the USA and Europe since 1945 since 
the nuclear bombing of Hiroshima is a new form of 
invasion, a new form of imperialism, a new form of 
colonialism, a new form of slavery. If we look at what 
happened to de-communization in Ukraine (1991-2022) 
and de-communization in Indonesia (1965-1966), the USA 
and NATO countries did not care about the genocide that 
occurred, the USA and NATO did not care about the 
destruction of a nation's civilization. . USA and NATO will 
try to make the countries of Indonesia and Ukraine 
become very dependent on the form of foreign debt in the 
US dollar, the value of the Indonesian rupiah currency is 
enslaved by the US dollar currency. The USA and NATO do 



 
 

not care about the ultimate humanitarian goal, a
unity in civilized socialism. 

Will the civilizations of the USA and NATO continue to 
wage war for the freedom of democracy, the arrogant 
version of the West? If we calculate the age of the 
civilizational hegemony of the USA and NATO, it is about 
100 years from 1900 to 2000. Then China emerged with 
its civilized socialism system which began to replace the 
world trade hegemony. It is clear that China and Russia 
continue to carry the hammer and sickle logo, which the 
USA and NATO hate the most. In the battle of civilizations, 
the age of 100 years of alternation is a game of natural 
law. The whole world will see what the monster of 
democratic freedom looks like after 100 years. Will 
democratic freedom destroy a civilization like what? Will 
democratic freedoms provide what kind of world 
goodness? 

Since World War I, a
result of the view that 
Western civilization is the 
legal owner of world 
civilization, the USA and 
NATO act as world police, 
acting as world rulers 
where other countries must 
obey USA democ
freedom mindset, if not, 
sanctions are executed.

That’s all satanic democracy ways.  According to a study 
by Neuenkirc and Neumeier (2015) US and UN economic 
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sanctions had a statistically significant impact on target 
countries economies by reducing GDP growth by an 
average of 3 percentage points a year. The study also 
concluded that the negative effects typically last for a 
period of ten years amounting to an aggregate decline in 
the target country's GDP per-capita of 25.5 percent. 

Imposing sanctions on an opponent also affects the 
economy of the imposing country to a degree. If import 
restrictions are promulgated, consumers in the imposing 
country may have restricted choices of goods. If export 
restrictions are imposed or if sanctions prohibit companies 
in the imposing country from trading with the target 
country, the imposing country may lose markets and 
investment opportunities to competing countries. 

Hufbauer, Schott, and Elliot (2008) argue that regime 
change is the most frequent foreign-policy objective of 
economic sanctions, accounting for just over 39 percent of 
cases of their imposition. Hufbauer et al. claimed that in 
their studies, 34 percent of the cases studied were 
successful. When Robert A. Pape examined their study, he 
claimed that only five of their reported forty successes 
were actually effective, reducing the success rate to 4%. In 
either case, the difficulty and unexpected nuances of 
measuring the actual success of sanctions in relation to 
their goals are both increasingly apparent and still under 
debate. In other words, it is difficult to determine why a 
regime or country changes (i.e., if it was the sanction or 
inherent instability) and doubly so to measure the full 
political effect of a given action. 
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Offering an explanation as to why sanctions are still 
imposed even when they may be marginally effective, 
British diplomat Jeremy Greenstock suggests sanctions are 
popular not because they are known to be effective, but 
because "there is nothing else to do between words and 
military action if you want to bring pressure upon a 
government". Critics of sanctions like Belgian jurist Marc 
Bossuyt argue that in nondemocratic regimes, the extent 
to which this affects political outcomes is contested, 
because by definition such regimes do not respond as 
strongly to the popular will. 

A strong connection has been found between the 
effectiveness of sanctions and the size of veto players in a 
government. Veto players represent individual or 
collective actors whose agreement is required for a 
change of the status quo, for example parties in a 
coalition, or the legislature's check on presidential powers. 
When sanctions are imposed on a country, it can try to 
mitigate them by adjusting its economic policy. The size of 
the veto players determines how many constraints the 
government will face when trying to change status quo 
policies, and the larger the size of the veto players, the 
more difficult it is to find support for new policies, thus 
making the sanctions more effective. 

Francesco Giumelli writes that the "set of sanctions ... that 
many observers would be likely to consider the most 
persuasive (and effective)," namely UN sanctions against 
"central bank assets and sovereign wealth funds," are "of 
all the types of measures applied ... the one least 
frequently used." Giumelli also distinguishes between 
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sanctions against international terrorists, in which "the 
nature of the request is not as important as the 
constraining aspect," and sanctions imposed in connection 
with "post-conflict scenarios", which should "include 
flexible demands and the potential for adaptation if the 
situation changes". 

Sanctions have been criticized on humanitarian grounds, 
as they negatively impact a nation's economy and can also 
cause collateral damage on ordinary citizens. Peksen 
implies that sanctions can degenerate human rights in the 
target country. Some policy analysts believe imposing 
trade restrictions only serves to hurt ordinary people as 
opposed to government elites, and others have likened 
the practice to siege warfare. The United Nations Security 
Council (UNSC) has generally refrained from imposing 
comprehensive sanctions since the mid-1990s, in part due 
to the controversy over the efficacy and civilian harms 
attributed to the Sanctions against  Iraq. 

Democracy freedom is clearly dependent forever with 
intelligence factors. Environment and intelligence 
research investigates the impact of environment on 
intelligence. This is one of the most important factors in 
understanding human group differences in IQ test scores 
and other measures of cognitive ability. It is estimated that 
heredity genes contribute about 20–40% of the variance 
in intelligence in childhood and about 80% in adulthood. 
Thus the environment and its interaction with heredity 
genes account for a high proportion of the variation in 
intelligence seen in groups of young children, and for a 
small proportion of the variation observed in groups of 
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mature adults. Historically, there has been great interest in 
the field of intelligence research to determine 
environmental influences on the development of 
cognitive functioning, in particular, fluid intelligence, as 
defined by its stabilization at 16 years of age. Despite the 
fact that intelligence stabilizes in early adulthood it is 
thought that genetic factors come to play more of a role in 
our intelligence during middle and old age and that the 
importance of the environment dissipates.  

Methods of democracy with the majority of people's votes 
become the decision of the fate of the nation, this does 
not necessarily make a country strong, large, it does not 
necessarily make it a technology innovator, an 
independent nation. Humans will always be born 
following the statistical laws of natural evolution, the 
number of people who are lucky to have high intelligence 
will have a small percentage portion compared to the 
population. That is why religions warn about humans who 
will always tend to enslave humans, and in this modern 
era, humans will be enslaved through the power of 
money. So that the ways of worshiping democracy for 
freedom, democracy in the money economy, globally, can 
turn into a demonic democracy that actually creates new 
forms of colonialism and slavery. 

Historically, democracies and republics have been rare. 
Republican theorists linked democracy to small size: as 
political units grew in size, the likelihood increased that 
the government would turn despotic. At the same time, 
small political units were vulnerable to conquest. 
Montesquieu wrote, "If a republic be small, it is destroyed 
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by a foreign force; if it be large, it is ruined by an internal 
imperfection." According to Johns Hopkins University 
political scientist Daniel Deudney, the creation of the 
United States, with its large size and its system of checks 
and balances, was a solution to the dual problems of size. 

Retrospectively different polities, outside of declared 
democracies, have been described as proto-democrati. 
Democracy is a form of government in which the people 
have the authority to deliberate and decide legislation 
("direct democracy"), or to choose governing officials to do 
so ("representative democracy"). Who is considered part of 
"the people" and how authority is shared among or 
delegated by the people has changed over time and at 
different rates in different countries, but over time more 
and more of a democratic country's inhabitants have 
generally been included. Cornerstones of democracy 
include freedom of assembly, association and speech, 
inclusiveness and equality, citizenship, consent of the 
governed, voting rights, freedom from unwarranted 
governmental deprivation of the right to life and liberty, 
and minority rights. 

The notion of democracy has evolved over time 
considerably. The original form of democracy was a direct 
democracy. The most common form of democracy today is 
a representative democracy, where the people elect 
government officials to govern on their behalf such as in a 
parliamentary or presidential democracy. 

Prevalent day-to-day decision making of democracies is 
the majority rule, though other decision making 
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approaches like supermajority and consensus have also 
been integral to democracies. They serve the crucial 
purpose of inclusiveness and broader legitimacy on 
sensitive issues—counterbalancing majoritarianism—and 
therefore mostly take precedence on a constitutional level. 
In the common variant of liberal democracy, the powers of 
the majority are exercised within the framework of a 
representative democracy, but the constitution limits the 
majority and protects the minority—usually through the 
enjoyment by all of certain individual rights, e.g. freedom 
of speech or freedom of association. 

The term appeared in the 5th century BC to denote the 
political systems then existing in Greek city-states, notably 
Classical Athens, to mean "rule of the people", in contrast 
to aristocracy, meaning "rule of an elite". Western 
democracy, as distinct from that which existed in 
antiquity, is generally considered to have originated in 
city-states such as those in Classical Athens and the 
Roman Republic, where various schemes and degrees of 
enfranchisement of the free male population were 
observed before the form disappeared in the West at the 
beginning of late antiquity. In virtually all democratic 
governments throughout ancient and modern history, 
democratic citizenship consisted of an elite class until full 
enfranchisement was won for all adult citizens in most 
modern democracies through the suffrage movements of 
the 19th and 20th centuries. 

Democracy contrasts with forms of government where 
power is either held by an individual, as in autocratic 
systems like absolute monarchy, or where power is held 
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by a small number of individuals, as in an oligarchy—
oppositions inherited from ancient Greek philosophy. Karl 
Popper defined democracy in contrast to dictatorship or 
tyranny, focusing on opportunities for the people to 
control their leaders and to oust them without the need 
for a revolution. World public opinion strongly favors 
democratic systems of government. 

Although democracy is generally understood to be 
defined by voting, no consensus exists on a precise 
definition of democracy. Karl Popper says that the 
"classical" view of democracy is simply, "in brief, the theory 
that democracy is the rule of the people, and that the 
people have a right to rule." Kofi Annan states that "there 
are as many different forms of democracy as there are 
democratic nations in the world." One study identified 
2,234 adjectives used to describe democracy in the 
English language. 

Democratic principles are reflected in all eligible citizens 
being equal before the law and having equal access to 
legislative processes. For example, in a representative 
democracy, every vote has equal weight, no unreasonable 
restrictions can apply to anyone seeking to become a 
representative and the freedom of its eligible citizens is 
secured by legitimised rights and liberties which are 
typically protected by a constitution. Other uses of 
"democracy" include that of direct democracy, in which 
issues are directly voted on by the constituents. 

One theory holds that democracy requires three 
fundamental principles: upward control (sovereignty 
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residing at the lowest levels of authority), political 
equality, and social norms by which individuals and 
institutions only consider acceptable acts that reflect the 
first two principles of upward control and political 
equality. Legal equality, political freedom and rule of law 
are often identified as foundational characteristics for a 
well-functioning democracy. 

The term "democracy" is sometimes used as shorthand for 
liberal democracy, which is a variant of representative 
democracy that may include elements such as political 
pluralism; equality before the law; the right to petition 
elected officials for redress of grievances; due process; civil 
liberties; human rights; and elements of civil society 
outside the government. Roger Scruton argued that 
democracy alone cannot provide personal and political 
freedom unless the institutions of civil society are also 
present. 

In some countries, notably in the United Kingdom which 
originated the Westminster system, the dominant 
principle is that of parliamentary sovereignty, while 
maintaining judicial independence. In India, parliamentary 
sovereignty is subject to the Constitution of India which 
includes judicial review. Though the term "democracy" is 
typically used in the context of a political state, the 
principles also are applicable to private organisations. 

There are many decision-making methods used in 
democracies, but majority rule is the dominant form. 
Without compensation, like legal protections of individual 
or group rights, political minorities can be oppressed by 
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the "tyranny of the majority". Majority rule is a competitive 
approach, opposed to consensus democracy, creating the 
need that elections, and generally deliberation, are 
substantively and procedurally "fair," i.e. just and 
equitable. In some countries, freedom of political 
expression, freedom of speech, freedom of the press, and 
internet democracy are considered important to ensure 
that voters are well informed, enabling them to vote 
according to their own interests. 

It has also been suggested that a basic feature of 
democracy is the capacity of all voters to participate freely 
and fully in the life of their society. With its emphasis on 
notions of social contract and the collective will of all the 
voters, democracy can also be characterised as a form of 
political collectivism because it is defined as a form of 
government in which all eligible citizens have an equal say 
in lawmaking. 

Republics, though often associated with democracy 
because of the shared principle of rule by consent of the 
governed, are not necessarily democracies, as 
republicanism does not specify how the people are to rule. 
Classically the term "republic" encompassed both 
democracies and aristocracies. In a modern sense the 
republican form of government is a form of government 
without monarch. Because of this democracies can be 
republics or constitutional monarchies, such as the United 
Kingdom. 

The term democracy first appeared in ancient Greek 
political and philosophical thought in the city-state of 
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Athens during classical antiquity. The word comes from 
dêmos '(common) people' and krátos 'force/might'. Under 
Cleisthenes, what is generally held as the first example of 
a type of democracy in 508–507 BC was established in 
Athens. Cleisthenes is referred to as "the father of 
Athenian democracy". 

Athenian democracy took the form of a direct democracy, 
and it had two distinguishing features: the random 
selection of ordinary citizens to fill the few existing 
government administrative and judicial offices, and a 
legislative assembly consisting of all Athenian citizens. All 
eligible citizens were allowed to speak and vote in the 
assembly, which set the laws of the city state. However, 
Athenian citizenship excluded women, slaves, foreigners, 
and youths below the age of military service. Effectively, 
only 1 in 4 residents in Athens qualified as citizens. 
Owning land was not a requirement for citizenship. The 
exclusion of large parts of the population from the citizen 
body is closely related to the ancient understanding of 
citizenship. In most of antiquity the benefit of citizenship 
was tied to the obligation to fight war campaigns. 

Athenian democracy was not only direct in the sense that 
decisions were made by the assembled people, but also 
the most direct in the sense that the people through the 
assembly, boule and courts of law controlled the entire 
political process and a large proportion of citizens were 
involved constantly in the public business. Even though 
the rights of the individual were not secured by the 
Athenian constitution in the modern sense (the ancient 
Greeks had no word for "rights"), those who were citizens 
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of Athens enjoyed their liberties not in opposition to the 
government but by living in a city that was not subject to 
another power and by not being subjects themselves to 
the rule of another person. 

Range voting appeared in Sparta as early as 700 BC. The 
Apella was an assembly of the people, held once a month, 
in which every male citizen of at least 30 years of age 
could participate. In the Apella, Spartans elected leaders 
and cast votes by range voting and shouting (the vote is 
then decided on how loudly the crowd shouts). Aristotle 
called this "childish", as compared with the stone voting 
ballots used by the Athenian citizenry. Sparta adopted it 
because of its simplicity, and to prevent any biased voting, 
buying, or cheating that was predominant in the early 
democratic elections. 

Even though the Roman Republic contributed significantly 
to many aspects of democracy, only a minority of Romans 
were citizens with votes in elections for representatives. 
The votes of the powerful were given more weight 
through a system of gerrymandering, so most high 
officials, including members of the Senate, came from a 
few wealthy and noble families. In addition, the 
overthrow of the Roman Kingdom was the first case in the 
Western world of a polity being formed with the explicit 
purpose of being a republic, although it didn't have much 
of a democracy. The Roman model of governance inspired 
many political thinkers over the centuries, and today's 
modern representative democracies imitate more the 
Roman than the Greek models because it was a state in 
which supreme power was held by the people and their 
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elected representatives, and which had an elected or 
nominated leader. 

Vaishali, capital city of the Vajjian Confederacy of (Vrijji 
mahajanapada), India was also considered one of the first 
examples of a republic around the 6th century BCE. 

Other cultures, such as the Iroquois Nation in the 
Americas between around 1450 and 1600 AD also 
developed a form of democratic society before they came 
in contact with the Europeans. This indicates that forms of 
democracy may have been invented in other societies 
around the world. 
 
While most regions in Europe during the Middle Ages 
were ruled by clergy or feudal lords, there existed various 
systems involving elections or assemblies, although often 
only involving a small part of the population. In 
Scandinavia, bodies known as things consisted of freemen 
presided by a lawspeaker. These deliberative bodies were 
responsible for settling political questions, and variants 
included the Althing in Iceland and the Løgting in the 
Faeroe Islands. The veche, found in Eastern Europe, was a 
similar body to the Scandinavian thing. In the Roman 
Catholic Church, the pope has been elected by a papal 
conclave composed of cardinals since 1059. The first 
documented parliamentary body in Europe was the Cortes 
of León. Established by Alfonso IX in 1188, the Cortes had 
authority over setting taxation, foreign affairs and 
legislating, though the exact nature of its role remains 
disputed. The Republic of Ragusa, established in 1358 and 
centered around the city of Dubrovnik, provided 
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representation and voting rights to its male aristocracy 
only. Various Italian city-states and polities had republic 
forms of government. For instance, the Republic of 
Florence, established in 1115, was led by the Signoria 
whose members were chosen by sortition. In 10th–15th 
century Frisia, a distinctly non-feudal society, the right to 
vote on local matters and on county officials was based on 
land size. The Kouroukan Fouga divided the Mali Empire 
into ruling clans (lineages) that were represented at a 
great assembly called the Gbara. However, the charter 
made Mali more similar to a constitutional monarchy than 
a democratic republic. 

The Parliament of England had its roots in the restrictions 
on the power of kings written into Magna Carta (1215), 
which explicitly protected certain rights of the King's 
subjects and implicitly supported what became the 
English writ of habeas corpus, safeguarding individual 
freedom against unlawful imprisonment with right to 
appeal. The first representative national assembly in 
England was Simon de Montfort's Parliament in 1265. The 
emergence of petitioning is some of the earliest evidence 
of parliament being used as a forum to address the 
general grievances of ordinary people. However, the 
power to call parliament remained at the pleasure of the 
monarch. 

Studies have linked the emergence of parliamentary 
institutions in Europe during the medieval period to urban 
agglomeration and the creation of new classes, such as 
artisans, as well as the presence of nobility and religious 
elites. Scholars have also linked the emergence of 
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representative government to Europe's relative political 
fragmentation. Political scientist David Stasavage links the 
fragmentation of Europe, and its subsequent 
democratization, to the manner in which the Roman 
Empire collapsed: Roman territory was conquered by small 
fragmented groups of Germanic tribes, thus leading to the 
creation of small political units where rulers were 
relatively weak and needed the consent of the governed 
to ward off foreign threats. 

In Poland, noble democracy was characterized by an 
increase in the activity of the middle nobility, which 
wanted to increase their share in exercising power at the 
expense of the magnates. Magnates dominated the most 
important offices in the state (secular and ecclesiastical) 
and sat on the royal council, later the senate. The growing 
importance of the middle nobility had an impact on the 
establishment of the institution of the land sejmik (local 
assembly), which subsequently obtained more rights. 
During the fifteenth and first half of the sixteenth century, 
sejmiks received more and more powers and became the 
most important institutions of local power. In 1454, 
Casimir IV Jagiellon granted the sejmiks the right to 
decide on taxes and to convene a mass mobilization in the 
Nieszawa Statutes. He also pledged not to create new 
laws without their consent. 

In 17th century England, there was renewed interest in 
Magna Carta. The Parliament of England passed the 
Petition of Right in 1628 which established certain 
liberties for subjects. The English Civil War (1642–1651) 
was fought between the King and an oligarchic but 
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elected Parliament, during which the idea of a political 
party took form with groups debating rights to political 
representation during the Putney Debates of 1647. 
Subsequently, the Protectorate (1653–59) and the English 
Restoration (1660) restored more autocratic rule, 
although Parliament passed the Habeas Corpus Act in 
1679 which strengthened the convention that forbade 
detention lacking sufficient cause or evidence. After the 
Glorious Revolution of 1688, the Bill of Rights was enacted 
in 1689 which codified certain rights and liberties and is 
still in effect. The Bill set out the requirement for regular 
elections, rules for freedom of speech in Parliament and 
limited the power of the monarch, ensuring that, unlike 
much of Europe at the time, royal absolutism would not 
prevail. Economic historians Douglass North and Barry 
Weingast have characterized the institutions implemented 
in the Glorious Revolution as a resounding success in 
terms of restraining the government and ensuring 
protection for property rights. 

Renewed interest in the Magna Carta, the English Civil 
War, and the Glorious Revolution in the 17th century 
prompted the growth of political philosophy on the British 
Isles. Thomas Hobbes was the first philosopher to 
articulate a detailed social contract theory. Writing in 
Leviathan (1651), Hobbes theorized that individuals living 
in the state of nature led lives that were "solitary, poor, 
nasty, brutish and short" and constantly waged a war of 
all against all. In order to prevent the occurrence of an 
anarchic state of nature, Hobbes reasoned that individuals 
ceded their rights to a strong, authoritarian government. 
Later, philosopher and physician John Locke would posit a 
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different interpretation of social contract theory. Writing 
in his Two Treatises of Government (1689), Locke posited 
that all individuals possessed the inalienable rights to life, 
liberty and estate (property). According to Locke, 
individuals would voluntarily come together to form a 
state for the purposes of defending their rights. 
Particularly important for Locke were property rights, 
whose protection Locke deemed to be a government's 
primary purpose. Furthermore, Locke asserted that 
governments were legitimate only if they held the consent 
of the governed. For Locke, citizens had the right to revolt 
against a government that acted against their interest or 
became tyrannical. Although they were not widely read 
during his lifetime, Locke's works are considered the 
founding documents of liberal thought and profoundly 
influenced the leaders of the American Revolution and 
later the French Revolution. His liberal democratic 
framework of governance remains the preeminent form of 
democracy in the world. 

In the Cossack republics of Ukraine in the 16th and 17th 
centuries, the Cossack Hetmanate and Zaporizhian Sich, 
the holder of the highest post of Hetman was elected by 
the representatives from the country's districts. 

In North America, representative government began in 
Jamestown, Virginia, with the election of the House of 
Burgesses (forerunner of the Virginia General Assembly) 
in 1619. English Puritans who migrated from 1620 
established colonies in New England whose local 
governance was democratic; although these local 
assemblies had some small amounts of devolved power, 
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the ultimate authority was held by the Crown and the 
English Parliament. The Puritans (Pilgrim Fathers), 
Baptists, and Quakers who founded these colonies applied 
the democratic organisation of their congregations also to 
the administration of their communities in worldly matters 

The first Parliament of Great Britain was established in 
1707, after the merger of the Kingdom of England and the 
Kingdom of Scotland under the Acts of Union. Although 
the monarch increasingly became a figurehead, 
Parliament was only elected by male property owners, 
which amounted to 3% of the population in 1780. The first 
known British person of African heritage to vote in a 
general election, Ignatius Sancho, voted in 1774 and 
1780. During the Age of Liberty in Sweden (1718–1772), 
civil rights were expanded and power shifted from the 
monarch to parliament. The taxed peasantry was 
represented in parliament, although with little influence, 
but commoners without taxed property had no suffrage. 

The creation of the short-lived Corsican Republic in 1755 
was an early attempt to adopt a democratic constitution 
(all men and women above age of 25 could vote). This 
Corsican Constitution was the first based on 
Enlightenment principles and included female suffrage, 
something that was not included in most other 
democracies until the 20th century. 

In the American colonial period before 1776, and for some 
time after, often only adult white male property owners 
could vote; enslaved Africans, most free black people and 
most women were not extended the franchise. This 
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changed state by state, beginning with the republican 
State of New Connecticut, soon after called Vermont, 
which, on declaring independence of Great Britain in 
1777, adopted a constitution modelled on Pennsylvania's 
with citizenship and democratic suffrage for males with or 
without property, and went on to abolish slavery. The 
American Revolution led to the adoption of the United 
States Constitution in 1787, the oldest surviving, still 
active, governmental codified constitution. The 
Constitution provided for an elected government and 
protected civil rights and liberties for some, but did not 
end slavery nor extend voting rights in the United States, 
instead leaving the issue of suffrage to the individual 
states. Generally, states limited suffrage to white male 
property owners and taxpayers. At the time of the first 
Presidential election in 1789, about 6% of the population 
was eligible to vote. The Naturalization Act of 1790 
limited U.S. citizenship to whites only. The Bill of Rights in 
1791 set limits on government power to protect personal 
freedoms but had little impact on judgements by the 
courts for the first 130 years after ratification. 

In 1789, Revolutionary France adopted the Declaration of 
the Rights of Man and of the Citizen and, although short-
lived, the National Convention was elected by all men in 
1792. The Polish-Lithuanian Constitution of 3 May 1791 
sought to implement a more effective constitutional 
monarchy, introduced political equality between 
townspeople and nobility, and placed the peasants under 
the protection of the government, mitigating the worst 
abuses of serfdom. In force for less than 19 months, it was 
declared null and void by the Grodno Sejm that met in 
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1793. Nonetheless, the 1791 Constitution helped keep 
alive Polish aspirations for the eventual restoration of the 
country's sovereignty over a century later. 

However, in the early 19th century, little of democracy—as 
theory, practice, or even as word—remained in the North 
Atlantic world. During this period, slavery remained a 
social and economic institution in places around the 
world. This was particularly the case in the United States, 
where eight serving presidents had owned slaves, and the 
last fifteen slave states kept slavery legal in the American 
South until the Civil War. Advocating the movement of 
black people from the US to locations where they would 
enjoy greater freedom and equality, in the 1820s the 
abolitionist members of the ACS established the 
settlement of Liberia. The United Kingdom's Slave Trade 
Act 1807 banned the trade across the British Empire, 
which was enforced internationally by the Royal Navy 
under treaties Britain negotiated with other states. In 
1833, the UK passed the Slavery Abolition Act which took 
effect across the British Empire, although slavery was 
legally allowed to continue in areas controlled by the East 
India Company, in Ceylon, and in Saint Helena for an 
additional ten years. 

In the United States, the 1828 presidential election was 
the first in which non-property-holding white males could 
vote in the vast majority of states. Voter turnout soared 
during the 1830s, reaching about 80% of the adult white 
male population in the 1840 presidential election. North 
Carolina was the last state to abolish property 
qualification in 1856 resulting in a close approximation to 
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universal white male suffrage (however tax-paying 
requirements remained in five states in 1860 and survived 
in two states until the 20th century). In the 1860 United 
States Census, the slave population had grown to four 
million, and in Reconstruction after the Civil War, three 
constitutional amendments were passed: the 13th 
Amendment (1865) that ended slavery; the 14th 
Amendment (1869) that gave black people citizenship, 
and the 15th Amendment (1870) that gave black males a 
nominal right to vote. Full enfranchisement of citizens was 
not secured until after the civil rights movement gained 
passage by the US Congress of the Voting Rights Act of 
1965. 

The voting franchise in the United Kingdom was 
expanded and made more uniform in a series of reforms 
that began with the Reform Act 1832 and continued into 
the 20th century, notably with the Representation of the 
People Act 1918 and the Equal Franchise Act 1928. 
Universal male suffrage was established in France in 
March 1848 in the wake of the French Revolution of 1848. 
In 1848, several revolutions broke out in Europe as rulers 
were confronted with popular demands for liberal 
constitutions and more democratic government. 

In 1876 the Ottoman Empire transitioned from an 
absolute monarchy to a constitutional one, and held two 
elections the next year to elect members to her newly 
formed parliament. Provisional Electoral Regulations were 
issued, stating that the elected members of the Provincial 
Administrative Councils would elect members to the first 
Parliament. Later that year, a new constitution was 
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promulgated, which provided for a bicameral Parliament 
with a Senate appointed by the Sultan and a popularly 
elected Chamber of Deputies. Only men above the age of 
30 who were competent in Turkish and had full civil rights 
were allowed to stand for election. Reasons for 
disqualification included holding dual citizenship, being 
employed by a foreign government, being bankrupt, 
employed as a servant, or having "notoriety for ill deeds". 
Full universal suffrage was achieved in 1934. In 1893 the 
self-governing colony New Zealand became the first 
country in the world (except for the short-lived 18th-
century Corsican Republic) to establish active universal 
suffrage by recognizing women as having the right to 
vote. 

So the question of democracy and socialism can be likened 
to a nuclear fusion reaction that produces a nuclear 
energy explosion of today's human civilization. Democracy 
will tend to choose any freedom to act individually or 
collectively, while socialism is like a ghost that limits the 
freedom of individual human freewill. 
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lovers of democracy and the lovers of socialism will be an 
all-out battle as shown between the cold war or trade war 
between the USA Europe against China Russia in this 
millennium.  

2.2. South Korea 1945–1948 

The Empire of Japan surrendered to the United States in 
August 1945, ending the Japanese rule of Korea. Under 
the leadership of Lyuh Woon-Hyung committees 
throughout Korea formed to coordinate transition to 
Korean independence. On August 28, 1945 these 
committees formed the temporary national government of 
Korea, naming it the People's Republic of Korea (PRK) a 
couple of weeks later[65].  

On September 8, 1945, the United States government 
landed forces in Korea and thereafter established the 
United States Army Military Government in Korea 
(USAMGK) to govern Korea south of the 38th parallel 
north. The USAMGK outlawed the PRK government. 

In May 1948, Syngman Rhee, who had previously lived in 
the United States, won the election for president, which 
had been boycotted by most other politicians and in 
which voting was limited to property owners and tax 
payers or, in smaller towns, to town elders voting for 
everyone else. Syngman Rhee, backed by the U.S. 
government, set up authoritarian rule that coordinated 
closely with the business sector and lasted until Rhee's 
overthrow in 1961, which led to a similarly authoritarian 
regime that would last ultimately until the late 1980s. 
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2.3. China 1945–1949 

After the nuclear bombing of the cities of Hiroshima and 
Nagasaki in 1945, the Soviet Union finally caught up with 
the experiment of a nuclear bomb in 1945. Currently 
Russia has the most nuclear warheads in the world about 
6000 units. China, on the other hand, attempted nuclear 
bomb testing in 1964. The U.S. government provided 
military, logistical and other aid to the Chinese Nationalist 
Party (KMT) army led by Chiang Kai-shek in its civil war 
against the indigenous communist People's Liberation 
Army (PLA) led by Mao Zedong. Both the KMT and the 
PLA were fighting against Japanese occupation forces, 
until the Japanese surrender to the United States in 
August 1945. This surrender brought to an end the 
Japanese Puppet state of Manchukuo and the Japanese-
dominated Wang Jingwei regime. 

After the Japanese surrender, the US continued to support 
the KMT against the PLA. The US airlifted many KMT 
troops from central China to Manchuria. Approximately 
50,000 U.S. troops were sent to guard strategic sites in 
Hubei and Shandong. The U.S. trained and equipped KMT 
troops, and also transported Korean troops and even 
imperial Japanese troops back to help KMT forces fight, 
and ultimately lose, against the People's Liberation Army. 
President Harry Truman justified deploying the very 
Japanese occupying army under whose boot the Chinese 
people had suffered so terribly to fight against the 
Chinese communists in this way: "It was perfectly clear to 
us that if we told the Japanese to lay down their arms 
immediately and march to the seaboard, the entire 
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country would be taken over by the Communists. We 
therefore had to take the unusual step of using the enemy 
as a garrison until we could airlift Chinese National troops 
to South China and send Marines to guard the seaports." 
Within less than two years after the Sino-Japanese War, 
the KMT had received $4.43 billion from the United 
States—most of which was military aid. 

2.4. Greece 1947–1949 

Greece had been under Axis occupation since 1941. Its 
government-in-exile, unelected and loyal to King George 
II, was based in Cairo. By the Summer of 1944, Communist 
partisans, then known as the Greek People's Liberation 
Army (ELAS), who had been armed by the Western 
powers, liberated nearly all of Greece outside of Athens 
from Axis occupation, while also attacking and defeating 
rival non-Communist partisan groups, forming a rival 
government, the Political Committee of National 
Liberation. On 12 August 1944, German forces retreated 
from the Athens area two days ahead of British landings 
there, ending the occupation. 

The British military together with Greek forces under 
control of the Greek government (now a government of 
national unity led by Konstantinos Tsaldaris, elected in the 
1946 Greek legislative election boycotted by the 
Communists) then fought for control of the country in the 
Greek Civil War against the Communists, who at that time 
were known as the Democratic Army of Greece (DSE). By 
early 1947, the British government could no longer afford 
the huge cost of financing the war against DSE, and 
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pursuant to the October 1944 Percentages Agreement 
between Winston Churchill and Joseph Stalin, Greece was 
to remain part of the Western sphere of influence. 
Accordingly, the British requested the US government to 
step in and the U.S. flooded the country with military 
equipment, military advisers and weapons. With increased 
U.S. military aid, by September 1949 the government 
eventually won, fully restoring the Kingdom of Greece.  

2.5. Costa Rica 1948 

Christian socialist medic Rafael Ángel Calderón Guardia of 
the National Republican Party reached power through 
democratic means in 1944, promoting a general social 
reform and allied to the Costa Rican Communist Party.  

Tensions between government and the opposition, 
supported by the CIA, caused the short-lived Costa Rican 
Civil War of 1948 that ended Calderón's government and 
led to the short de facto rule of 18 months by José 
Figueres Ferrer.  

However, Figueres also held some left-leaning ideas and 
continued the process of social reform. After the war, 
democracy was quickly restored and a two-party system 
encompassed by the parties of the Calderonistas and 
Figueristas developed in the country for nearly 60 years. 
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2.6. Albania 1949–1953 

Albania was in chaos after World War II and the country 
was not as focused on peacetime conferences in 
comparison to other European nations, while having 
suffered high casualties. It was threatened by its larger 
neighbors with annexation. After Yugoslavia dropped out 
of the Eastern Bloc, the small country of Albania was 
geographically isolated from the rest of the Eastern Bloc. 

The United States and United Kingdom took advantage of 
the situation and recruited anti-communist Albanians who 
had fled after the USSR invaded. The US and UK formed 
the Free Albania National Committee, made up of many of 
the emigres. Albanians, recruited, were trained by the U.S. 
and UK., infiltrated the country, multiple times. Eventually, 
the operation was found out and many of the agents fled, 
were executed, or were tried. The operation would 
become a failure. The operation was declassified in 2006, 
due to the Nazi War Crimes Disclosure Act and is now 
available in the National Archives. 

2.7. Syria 1949, 1956-57, 2005–09, 2012–17 

The government of Shukri al-Quwatli, reelected in 1948, 
was overthrown by a junta led by the Syrian Army chief of 
staff at the time, Husni al-Za'im, who became President of 
Syria on April 11, 1949. Za'im had extensive connections 
to CIA operatives, although the exact nature of U.S. 
involvement in the coup remains highly controversial. The 
construction of the Trans-Arabian Pipeline, which had 
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been held up in the Syrian parliament, was approved by 
Za'im, the new president, just over a month after the coup. 

As a result of the 1954 Syrian coup d'état, the Second 
Syrian Republic was ruled by Nasserist civilian politician 
Sabri al-Asali, in close collaboration with the army, 
challenged by the US-backed far right Syrian Social 
Nationalist Party. In 1956 Operation Straggle was a failed 
coup plot against al-Asali. The CIA made plans for a coup 
for late October 1956 to topple the Syrian government. 
The plan entailed takeover by the Syrian military of key 
cities and border crossings. The plan was postponed when 
Israel invaded Egypt in October 1956 and US planners 
thought their operation would be unsuccessful at a time 
when the Arab world is fighting "Israeli aggression." The 
operation was uncovered and American plotters had to 
flee the country. 

In 1957 Operation Wappen was a second coup plan 
against Syria, orchestrated by the CIA's Kermit Roosevelt. 
It called for assassination of key senior Syrian officials, 
staged military incidents on the Syrian border to be 
blamed on Syria and then to be used as pretext for 
invasion by Iraqi and Jordanian troops, an intense US 
propaganda campaign targeting the Syrian population, 
and "sabotage, national conspiracies and various strong-
arm activities" to be blamed on Damascus. This operation 
failed when Syrian military officers paid off with millions of 
dollars in bribes to carry out the coup revealed the plot to 
Syrian intelligence. The U.S. Department of State denied 
accusation of a coup attempt and along with US media 
accused Syria of being a "satellite" of the USSR. 



  101 
 

There was also a third plan in 1957, called "The Preferred 
Plan". Alongside Britain's MI6, the CIA planned to support 
and arm several uprisings. However, this plan was never 
carried out. 

In 2005, after a period of co-operation in the War on 
Terror, the Bush administration froze relations with Syria. 
According to US cables released by WikiLeaks, the State 
Department then began to funnel money to opposition 
groups, including at least $6 million to the anti-
government satellite channel Barada TV and the exile 
group Movement for Justice and Development in Syria, 
although this was denied by the channel. This covert 
backing continued under the Obama administration until 
at least April 2009 when US diplomats expressed concern 
the funding would undermine US attempts to rebuild 
relations with Syrian President Bashar Al-Assad. 

In April 2011, after the outbreak of the Syrian civil war in 
early 2011, three U.S. Senators: Republicans John McCain 
and Lindsey Graham, and Independent Joe Lieberman, 
urged Obama in a joint statement to "state unequivocally" 
that "it is time to go" for President Assad. In August, 2011, 
the U.S. government called on Assad to "step aside" and 
imposed an oil embargo against the Syrian government. 
Starting in 2013, the U.S. provided training, weapons and 
cash to Syrian vetted moderate rebels, and in 2014, the 
Supreme Military Council. In 2015, Obama reaffirmed that 
"Assad must go". 

In March 2017 Ambassador Nikki Haley told a group of 
reporters that the US's priority in Syria was no longer on 
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"getting Assad out." Earlier that day at a news conference 
in Ankara, Secretary of State Rex Tillerson also said that 
the "longer term status of President Assad will be decided 
by the Syrian people." While the US Defense Department's 
program to aid predominantly Kurdish rebels fighting the 
Islamic State of Iraq and the Levant (ISIL) continued, it was 
revealed in July 2017 that US President Trump had 
ordered a "phasing out" of the CIA's support for anti-Assad 
rebels. 

2.8. Burma and  China 1950–1953 

The Chinese Civil War had recently ended, with the 
communists winning and the nationalists losing. The 
nationalists retreated to areas such as Taiwan and north 
Burma. 

In Operation Paper, which began in late 1950 or early 
1951 following Chinese involvement in the Korean War, 
the CIA hired Chinese nationalist militants from Taiwan 
and transported them to Burma, reinforcing the 
Kuomintang insurgency. The insurgency was also known 
as the Yunnan Province Army. The nationalists were flown 
via the Civil Air Transport (CAT, later named Air America), 
an airline co-owned and operated by the CIA and the 
Kuomintang in Taiwan. 

Operation Paper entailed CIA plans used by CIA military 
advisors on the ground in Burma to assist Kuomintang 
incursions into Western China over several years, under 
the command of General Li Mi, with Kuomintang 
leadership hoping to eventually retake China, despite 
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opposition from the US State Department. However, each 
attempted invasion was repelled by the Chinese army. The 
Kuomintang took control of large swaths of Burma, while 
the government of Burma complained repeatedly of the 
military invasion to the United Nations. 

On secret flights from Thailand to Burma, CAT aircraft 
flown by pilots hired by the CIA brought American 
weapons and other supplies to the Kuomintang and on 
return flights the CAT aircraft transported opium from the 
Kuomintang to Chinese organized crime drug traffickers in 
Bangkok, Thailand. 

2.9. Egypt 1952 

In February 1952, following January's riots in Cairo amid 
widespread nationalist discontent over the continued 
British occupation of the Suez Canal and Egypt's defeat in 
the 1948 Arab–Israeli War, CIA officer Kermit Roosevelt Jr. 
was dispatched by the State Department to meet with 
Farouk I of the Kingdom of Egypt. American policy at that 
time was to convince Farouk to introduce reforms that 
would weaken the appeal of Egyptian radicals and 
stabilize Farouk's grip on power. The U.S. was notified in 
advance of the successful July coup led by nationalist and 
anti-communist Egyptian military officers that replaced the 
Egyptian monarchy with the Republic of Egypt under the 
leadership of Mohamed Naguib and Gamal Abdel Nasser. 
CIA officer Miles Copeland Jr. recounted in his memoirs 
that Roosevelt helped coordinate the coup during three 
prior meetings with the plotters (including Nasser, the 
future Egyptian president); this has not been confirmed by 
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declassified documents but is partially supported by 
circumstantial evidence. Roosevelt and several of the 
Egyptians said to have been present in these meetings 
denied Copeland's account; another U.S. official, William 
Lakeland, said its veracity is open to question. Hugh 
Wilford notes that "whether or not the CIA dealt directly 
with the Free Officers prior to their July 1952 coup, there 
was extensive secret American-Egyptian contact in the 
months after the revolution." 

2.10. Iran 1952–1953 

Since 1944, Iran was a constitutional monarchy ruled by 
the Shah Mohammad Reza Pahlavi. From the discovery of 
oil in Iran in the late nineteenth century major powers 
exploited the weakness of the Iranian government to 
obtain concessions that many believed failed to give Iran a 
fair share of the profits. During World War II, the UK, the 
USSR and the US all became involved in Iranian affairs, 
including the joint Anglo-Soviet invasion of Iran in 1941. 
Iranian officials began to notice that British taxes were 
increasing while royalties to Iran declined. By 1948, 
Britain received substantially more revenue from the 
Anglo-Iranian Oil Company (AIOC) than Iran. Negotiations 
to meet this and other Iranian concerns exacerbated 
rather than eased tensions. 

On March 15, 1951 the Majlis, the Iranian parliament, 
passed legislation championed by reformist politician 
Mohammad Mosaddegh to nationalize the AIOC. The 
senate approved the measure two days later. Fifteen 
months later, Mosadegh was elected Prime Minister by the 
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Majlis. International business concerns then boycotted oil 
from the nationalized Iranian oil industry. This contributed 
to concerns in Britain and the US that Mosadegh might be 
a communist. He was reportedly supported by the 
Communist Tudeh Party. 

The CIA began supporting 18 of their favorite candidates 
in the 1952 Iranian legislative election, which Mosaddegh 
suspended after urban deputies loyal to him were elected. 
The new parliament gave Mosaddegh emergency powers 
which weakened the power of the Shah, and there was a 
constitutional struggle over the roles of the Shah and 
prime minister. Britain strongly backed the Shah, while the 
US remained neutral. However, America's position shifted 
in late 1952 with the election of Eisenhower as U.S. 
president. The CIA launched Operation Ajax, directed by 
Kermit Roosevelt Jr., to remove Mosaddegh by persuading 
the Shah to replace him, using diplomacy and bribery. The 
1953 Iranian coup d'état (known in Iran as the "28 Mordad 
coup") orchestrated by the intelligence agencies of the 
United Kingdom (under the name "Operation Boot") and 
the United States  replaced Mosaddegh with the CIA's 
choice, General Fazlollah Zahedi, through decrees 
dictated by the CIA's Donald Wilber. 

The coup saw the transition of Pahlavi from a 
constitutional monarch to an authoritarian, who relied 
heavily on United States government support. That 
support dissipated during the Iranian Revolution of 1979, 
as his own security forces refused to shoot into non-
violent crowds. The CIA did not admit its responsibility 
until the 60th anniversary of the coup in August 2013. 
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2.11. Guetemala 1954 

In a 1954 CIA operation code named Operation 
PBSuccess, the U.S. government executed a coup that 
successfully overthrew the government of President 
Jacobo Árbenz, elected in 1950, and installed Carlos 
Castillo Armas, the first of a line of right-wing dictators, in 
its place. Not only was it done for the ideological purpose 
of containment, but the CIA had been approached by the 
United Fruit Company as it saw possible loss in profits due 
to the situation of workers in the country, i.e. the 
introduction of anti-exploitation laws. The perceived 
success of the operation made it a model for future CIA 
operations because the CIA lied to the president of the 
United States when briefing him regarding the number of 
casualties. 

2.12. Indonesia 1957–1959, 1965–1967 

As a founding member of the Non-Aligned Movement and 
host of the April 1955 Bandung Conference, Indonesia, 
which had been ruled by president Sukarno since 1945, 
was charting a course toward an independent foreign 
policy that was not militarily committed to either side in 
the Cold War. After a visit to the People's Republic of 
China in October 1956, Sukarno instituted a form of 
autocratic rule called Guided Democracy. 

Starting in 1957, Eisenhower ordered the CIA to 
overthrow Sukarno. The CIA supported a failed coup plan 
by rebel Indonesian military officers in February 1958. CIA 
pilots, such as Allen Lawrence Pope, piloted planes 
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operated by CIA front organization Civil Air Transport 
(CAT) that bombed civilian and military targets in 
Indonesia. The CIA instructed CAT pilots to target 
commercial shipping in order to frighten foreign merchant 
ships away from Indonesian waters, thereby to weaken 
the Indonesian economy and thus to destabilize the 
government of Indonesia. The CIA aerial bombardment 
resulted in the sinking of several commercial ships and the 
bombing of a marketplace that killed many civilians. The 
coup attempt failed at that time and Eisenhower denied 
any U.S. involvement. 

Junior army officers and the commander of the palace 
guard of President Sukarno accused senior Indonesian 
military brass of planning a CIA-backed coup against 
President Sukarno and killed six senior generals on 
October 1, 1965. General Suharto and other senior 
military officers attacked the junior officers on the same 
day and accused the Communist Party of Indonesia (PKI) 
of planning the killing of the six generals. The army 
launched a propaganda campaign based on lies and riled 
up civilian mobs to attack those believed to be PKI 
supporters and other political opponents. Indonesian 
government forces with collaboration of some civilians 
perpetrated mass killings over many months. Scholars 
estimate the number of civilians killed range from a half 
million to over a million. US Ambassador Marshall Green 
encouraged the military leaders to act forcefully against 
the political opponents. 

In 2017, declassified documents from the U.S. Embassy in 
Jakarta have confirmed that the US had knowledge of, 



  108 
 

facilitated and encouraged mass killings for its own 
geopolitical interests. US diplomats admitted to journalist 
Kathy Kadane in 1990 that they had provided the 
Indonesian army with thousands of names of alleged PKI 
supporters and other alleged leftists, and that the U.S. 
officials then checked off from their lists those who had 
been murdered. President Sukarno's base of support was 
largely annihilated, imprisoned and the remainder 
terrified, and thus he was forced out of power in 1967, 
replaced by an authoritarian military regime led by 
General Suharto. Historian John Roosa states that "almost 
overnight the Indonesian government went from being a 
fierce voice for cold war neutrality and anti-imperialism to 
a quiet, compliant partner of the US world order."  This 
campaign is considered a major turning point in the Cold 
War, and was such a success that it served as a model for 
other U.S.-backed coups and anti-communist 
extermination campaigns throughout  Asia and Latin 
America. 

2.13. Vietnam 1959-1963 

In 1959 a branch of the Worker's Party of Vietnam was 
formed in the south of the country and began an 
insurgency against the Republic of Vietnam. They were 
supplied through Group 559, which was formed the same 
year by North Vietnam to send weapons down the Ho Chi 
Minh Trail. The US supported the RoV against the 
communists. After the 1960 US election, President John F. 
Kennedy became much more involved with the fight 
against the insurgency. 
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From mid-1963, the Kennedy administration became 
increasingly frustrated with South Vietnamese President 
Ngo Dinh Diem's corrupt and repressive rule and his 
persecution of the Buddhist majority. In light of Diem's 
refusal to adopt reforms, American officials debated 
whether they should support efforts to replace him. These 
debates crystallized after the ARVN Special Forces, which 
took their orders directly from the palace, raided Buddhist 
temples across the country, leaving a death toll estimated 
in the hundreds, and resulted in the dispatch of Cable 243 
on August 24, 1963, which instructed United States 
Ambassador to South Vietnam, Henry Cabot Lodge Jr., to 
"examine all possible alternative leadership and make 
detailed plans as to how we might bring about Diem's 
replacement if this should become necessary". Lodge and 
his liaison officer, Lucien Conein, contacted discontented 
Army of the Republic of Vietnam officers and gave 
assurances that the US would not oppose a coup or 
respond with aid cuts. These efforts culminated in a coup 
d'état on November 1–2, 1963, during which Diem and his 
brother were assassinated. By the end of 1963 the Viet 
Cong switched to a much more aggressive strategy in 
fighting the Southern government and the US. 

The Pentagon Papers concluded that "Beginning in 
August of 1963 we variously authorized, sanctioned and 
encouraged the coup efforts of the Vietnamese generals 
and offered full support for a successor government. In 
October we cut off aid to Diem in a direct rebuff, giving a 
green light to the generals. We maintained clandestine 
contact with them throughout the planning and 
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execution of the coup and sought to review their 
operational plans and proposed new government." 

2.14. Cuba 1959–1962 

General Fulgencio Batista was a military dictator who 
seized power in Cuba in March 1952 and was backed by 
the U.S. government until March 1958. His regime was 
overthrown on December 31, 1958, thus bringing an end 
to the Cuban Revolution that was led by Fidel Castro and 
his 26th of July Movement. Castro became President in 
February 1959. The CIA backed a force composed of CIA-
trained Cuban exiles to invade Cuba with support and 
equipment from the US military, in an attempt to 
overthrow Castro's government. The invasion was 
launched in April 1961, three months after John F. 
Kennedy assumed the presidency in the United States, but 
the Cuban armed forces defeated the invading 
combatants within three days. 

Operation MONGOOSE was a year-long U.S. government 
effort to overthrow the government of Cuba. The 
operation included economic warfare, including an 
embargo against Cuba, "to induce failure of the 
Communist regime to supply Cuba's economic needs", a 
diplomatic initiative to isolate Cuba, and psychological 
operations "to turn the peoples' resentment increasingly 
against the regime."The economic warfare prong of the 
operation also included the infiltration of CIA operatives 
to carry out many acts of sabotage against civilian targets, 
such as a railway bridge, a molasses storage facilities, an 
electric power plant, and the sugar harvest, 
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notwithstanding Cuba's repeated requests to the United 
States government to cease its armed operations.In 
addition, the CIA planned a number of assassination 
attempts against Fidel Castro, head of government of 
Cuba, including attempts that entailed CIA collaboration 
with the American mafia.In April 2021, documents 
released by the National Security Archive showed that the 
CIA was also involved in a plot to assassinate Raúl Castro 
in 1960. 

Having first imposed an embargo on the sale of arms to 
Cuba in March 1958, during the Batista dictatorship, 
Eisenhower imposed further sanctions on October 19, 
1960, after Cuba nationalized the U.S.-owned Cuban oil 
refineries without compensation. This new embargo 
resulted in all exports to Cuba other than food and 
medicine being blocked from getting onto the island. On 
February 7, 1962, Kennedy extended the embargo to 
include almost all exports, which continues to this day. 
Donald Trump added more than two hundred sanctions 
during his administration, and reclassified the country as a 
state sponsor of terrorism shortly before leaving office in 
January 2021, overturning a move by his predecessor, 
Barack Obama, in May 2015. 

2.15. Congo 1960–1965 

Patrice Lumumba was elected the first Prime Minister of 
the Republic of the Congo, now the Democratic Republic 
of the Congo, in May 1960, and in June 1960, the country 
achieved full independence from Belgium. In July, the 
Congo Crisis erupted with a mutiny among army, followed 
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by the regions Katanga and South Kasai succeeding with 
support from Belgium, who wished to keep power over 
resources in the region, starting the Congo Crisis. 
Lumumba called in the United Nations to help him, but 
the U.N. force only agreed to keep peace and not stop the 
separatist movements. Lumumba then agreed to receive 
help from the USSR in order to stop the separatists, 
worrying the United States, due to the supply of uranium 
in the country. At first, The Eisenhower Administration 
planned to poison him with his toothpaste, but this was 
abandoned. The CIA sent official Sydney Gottlieb with a 
poison to liaison with an African CIA asset code-named 
WI/Rogue who was to assassinate Lumumba, but 
Lumumba went into hiding before the operation was 
completed. The United States encouraged Mobutu Sese 
Seko, a colonel in the army, to overthrow him which he 
did on September 14, 1960. After being locked in prison, 
Mobutu sent him to Katanga, and he was executed soon 
after on January 17, 1961. 

After Lumumba was killed, the US began funding Mobutu 
in order to secure him against the separatists and 
opposition. Many of Lumumba's supporters went east and 
formed the Free Republic of the Congo with its capital in 
Stanleyville in opposition to Mobutu's government. 
Eventually, the government in Stanleyville agreed to 
rejoin with the Leopoldville government under the latter's 
rule, however in 1963, Lumumba supporters formed 
another separate government in the east of the country 
and launched the Simba rebellion. The rebellion had 
support from the Soviet Union and many other countries 
in the Eastern Bloc. In November 1964, the U.S. and 
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Belgium launched Operation Dragon Rouge to rescue 
hostages taken by Simba rebels in Stanleyville. The 
operation was a success and expelled the Simba rebels 
from the city, leaving them in disarray. The Simbas were 
ultimately defeated the following year by the Congolese 
army. 

After the March 1965 elections, Mobutu Sese Seko 
launched a second coup in November with the support of 
the U.S. and other powers. Mobutu Sese Seko claimed 
democracy would return in five years and he was popular 
initially. However, he instead took increasingly 
authoritarian powers eventually becoming the dictator of 
the country. 

2.16. Laos 1960 

On August 9, 1960, Captain Kong Le with his paratroop 
battalion seized control of the administrative capital city of 
Vientiane in a bloodless coup on a "neutralist" platform 
with the stated aims of ending the civil war raging in Laos, 
ending foreign interference in the country, ending the 
corruption caused by foreign aid, and better treatment for 
soldiers. With CIA support, Field Marshal Sarit Thanarat, 
the prime minister of Thailand, set up a covert Thai 
military advisory group, called Kaw Taw. Kaw Taw 
together with the CIA backed a November 1960 counter-
coup against the new Neutralist government in Vientiane, 
supplying artillery, artillerymen, and advisers to General 
Phoumi Nosavan, first cousin of Sarit. It also deployed the 
Police Aerial Reinforcement Unit (PARU) to operations 
within Laos, sponsored by the CIA. With the help of CIA 
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front organization Air America to airlift war supplies and 
with other U.S. military assistance and covert aid from 
Thailand, General Phoumi Nosavan's forces captured 
Vientiane in November 1960. 

2.17.Dominican Republic 1961 

In May 1961, the ruler of the Dominican Republic, Rafael 
Trujillo was murdered with weapons supplied by the 
United States Central Intelligence Agency (CIA). An 
internal CIA memorandum states that a 1973 Office of 
Inspector General investigation into the murder disclosed 
"quite extensive Agency involvement with the plotters." 
The CIA described its role in "changing" the government of 
the Dominican Republic as a 'success' in that it assisted in 
moving the Dominican Republic from a totalitarian 
dictatorship to a Western-style democracy." Juan Bosch, 
an earlier recipient of CIA funding, was elected president 
of the Dominican Republic in 1962 and was deposed in 
1963. 

2.18. Brazil  1961–1964 

When Jânio Quadros, President of Brazil elected in 1960, 
resigned in August 1961, he was succeeded by Vice 
President João Goulart, despite the strong opposition of 
conservative powers within the military who tried to veto 
his rule. Goulart was a proponent of democratic rights, the 
legalization of the Communist Party, and economic and 
land reforms, but the US government insisted that he 
established a program of economic austerity. The United 
States government implemented a plan to destabilise the 



  115 
 

country, code named Operation Brother Sam, by cutting 
off aid to the Brazilian government, providing aid to state 
governors of Brazil who opposed the new president, and 
encouraging senior Brazilian military officers to seize 
power and to back army chief of staff General Humberto 
de Alencar Castelo Branco. General Branco led the April 
1964 overthrow of Goulart's government, bringing to an 
end the Fourth Brazilian Republic, and was installed as 
first president of the military regime, while the US 
government expressed approval and re-instituted aid and 
investment in the country. 

2.19. Iraq  1963, 1991, 1992–1996, 2003–2011 

Several sources, notably Said Aburish, have alleged that 
the February 1963 coup that resulted in the formation of a 
Ba'athist government in Iraq was "masterminded" by the 
CIA. No declassified U.S. documents have verified this 
allegation. However, senior National Security Council 
official Robert Komer wrote to President John F. Kennedy 
on February 8, 1963 that the Iraqi coup "is almost certainly 
a net gain for our side ... CIA had excellent reports on the 
plotting, but I doubt either they or UK should claim much 
credit for it." Brandon Wolfe-Hunnicutt states that 
"Scholars remain divided in their interpretations of 
American foreign policy toward the February 1963 coup 
in Iraq," but cites "compelling evidence of an American 
role in the coup." 

Tareq Y. Ismael, Jacqueline S. Ismael, and Glenn E. Perry 
state that "Ba'thist forces and army officers overthrew 
Qasim on February 8, 1963, in collaboration with the CIA." 



  116 
 

Conversely, Bryan R. Gibson argues that "the 
preponderance of evidence substantiates the conclusion 
that the CIA was not behind the February 1963 Ba'thist 
coup." The U.S. offered material support to the new 
Ba'athist government after the coup, amidst an anti-
communist purge and Iraqi atrocities against Kurdish 
rebels and civilians. Because of this, Nathan Citino asserts: 
"Although the United States did not initiate the 14 
Ramadan coup, at best it condoned and at worst it 
contributed to the violence that followed." The Ba'athist 
government collapsed in November 1963 over the 
question of unification with Syria (where a rival branch of 
the Ba'ath Party had seized power in March). 

There has been a great deal of academic discussion 
regarding allegations from King Hussein of Jordan and 
others that the CIA (or other U.S. agencies) provided the 
Ba'athist government with lists of communists and other 
leftists, who were then arrested or killed by the Ba'ath 
Party's militia—the National Guard. Gibson and Hanna 
Batatu emphasize that the identities of Iraqi Communist 
Party members were publicly known and that the Ba'ath 
would not have needed to rely on U.S. intelligence to 
identify them, whereas Citino considers the allegations 
plausible because the U.S. embassy in Iraq had actually 
compiled such lists, and because Iraqi National Guard 
members involved in the purge received training in the 
U.S. 

During and immediately following the Gulf War in 1991, 
the United States broadcast signals encouraging an 
uprising against Saddam Hussein, an autocrat who had 
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ruled Iraq since coming to power in an internal struggle in 
the ruling Ba'ath party in 1979. On February 5, 1991 
George H.W. Bush made a speech on Voice of America 
stating, "There is another way for the bloodshed to stop: 
and that is, for the Iraqi military and the Iraqi people to 
take matters into their own hands and force Saddam 
Hussein, the dictator, to step aside and then comply with 
the United Nations' resolutions and rejoin the family of 
peace-loving nations." On February 24, 1991 a few days 
after the ceasefire was signed the CIA funded and 
operated radio station Voice of Free Iraq called for the 
Iraqi people to rise up against Hussein. The day after the 
Gulf War ended on March 1, 1991, Bush again called for 
the overthrow of Saddam Hussein.The U.S. was hoping for 
a coup but instead, a series of uprisings erupted across 
Iraq right after the war. Two of the largest rebellions were 
led by the Iraqi Kurds in the North and the Shia militias in 
the south. The rebels assumed that they would be getting 
direct U.S. assistance, however United States never 
intended to give assistance to the rebels. The Shia 
uprisings were crushed by the Iraqi military while the 
Pershmegra were more successful, gaining the Iraqi Kurds 
autonomy. The Bush Administration faced heavy criticism 
for not assisting the rebels after encouraging them to rise 
up. The U.S. worried that if Saddam fell and Iraq collapsed, 
Iran would gain power. Colin Powell wrote of his time as 
Chairman of the Joint Chiefs of Staff "our practical 
intention was to leave Baghdad enough power to survive 
as a threat to an Iran that remained bitterly hostile toward 
the United States". At the same time George H.W. Bush 
said that the U.S. had never intended to assist anyone. 
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The United Nations Security Council (UNSC) originally 
imposed sanctions against Iraq in August 1990 under 
Resolution 661 to compel Iraq to withdraw from occupied 
Kuwait without the use of military force, but Iraq refused 
to withdraw its forces, leading to the 1991 Gulf War. After 
the war, the U.S. government successfully advocated that 
sanctions remain in effect with revisions, including linkage 
to removal of weapons of mass destruction, which the 
UNSC did in April 1991 by adopting Resolution 687, albeit 
with the earlier prohibition on foodstuffs lifted. U.S. 
officials stated in May 1991—when it was widely expected 
that the Iraqi government of Saddam Hussein faced 
collapse —that the sanctions would not be lifted unless 
Saddam was ousted. In the subsequent president's 
administration, U.S. officials did not explicitly insist on 
regime change but took the position that the sanctions 
could be lifted if Iraq complied with all of the UN 
resolutions it was violating, including those related to the 
country's human rights record, and not just with UN 
weapons inspections. The effects of the sanctions on the 
Iraqi civilian population, including the child mortality rate, 
were disputed at the time. Whereas it was widely believed 
at the time that the sanctions caused a major rise in child 
mortality, recent research has shown that commonly cited 
data were fabricated by the Iraqi government and that 
"there was no major rise in child mortality in Iraq after 
1990 and during the period of the sanctions." 

The CIA launched DBACHILLES, a coup d'état operation 
against the Iraqi government, recruiting Ayad Allawi, who 
headed the Iraqi National Accord, a network of Iraqis who 
opposed the Saddam Hussein government, as part of the 



  119 
 

operation. The network included Iraqi military and 
intelligence officers but was penetrated by people loyal to 
the Iraqi government. Also using Ayad Allawi and his 
network, the CIA directed a government sabotage and 
bombing campaign in Baghdad between 1992 and 1995. 
The CIA bombing campaign may have been merely a test 
of the operational capacity of the CIA's network of assets 
on the ground and not intended to be the launch of the 
coup strike itself. However, Allawi attempted a coup 
against Saddam Husssein in 1996. The coup was 
unsuccessful, but Ayad Allawi was later installed as prime 
minister of Iraq by the Iraq Interim Governing Council, 
which had been created by the U.S.-led coalition following 
the March 2003 invasion and occupation of Iraq. 

In 1998 as a non-covert measure, the U.S. enacted the 
"Iraq Liberation Act," which states, in part, that "It should 
be the policy of the United States to support efforts to 
remove the regime headed by Saddam Hussein from 
power in Iraq," and appropriated funds for U.S. aid "to the 
Iraqi democratic opposition organizations." After Bush 
was elected he started being more aggressive toward Iraq. 
After the 9/11 attacks the Bush administration claimed 
that Iraq's ruler at the time, Saddam Hussein, had 
connections to Al-Qaeda and was supporting terrorism. 
The administration also stated that Hussein was covertly 
continuing production of weapons of mass destruction 
despite the fact that evidence for both was not conclusive. 
Iraq was also one of the three countries Bush called out in 
his Axis of Evil Speech. In 2002 Congress passed the "Iraq 
Resolution" which authorized the president to "use any 
means necessary" against Iraq. The Iraq War than began 
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in March 2003 when United States-led military coalition 
invaded the country and overthrew the Iraqi government. 
The U.S. captured and helped prosecute Hussein, who was 
later hanged. The U.S. and the new Iraqi government also 
fought an insurgency following the invasion. In 2011 the 
U.S. withdrew its soldiers from the conflict, but returned in 
2014 to help stop the rise of the Islamic State of Iraq and 
the Levant (ISIL). 

2.20. Cambodia 1970 

Prince Norodom Sihanouk, who came to power by the 
1955 parliamentary election, had for years kept Cambodia 
out of the Vietnam War by being friendly with China and 
North Vietnam, and had integrated left wing parties into 
mainstream politics. However, a leftist uprising occurred in 
1967 and the communist Khmer Rouge began an 
insurgency against the prince the following year. 
Following the 1968 Tet Offensive, Sihanouk became 
convinced that North Vietnam was going to lose the war 
so he improved relations with the United States. Henry 
Kissinger suggested that Sihanouk approved U.S. bombing 
of North Vietnamese targets in Cambodia in 1969, 
although this has been heavily disputed by other sources. 

In March 1970 Sihanouk was deposed by right-wing 
General Lon Nol following a vote of no confidence in 
Cambodia's National Assembly. The overthrow followed 
Cambodia's constitutional process and most accounts 
emphasize the primacy of Cambodian actors in Sihanouk's 
removal. Historians are divided about the extent of U.S. 
involvement in or foreknowledge of the ouster, but an 
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emerging consensus posits some culpability on the part of 
U.S. military intelligence. There is evidence that "as early as 
late 1968" Lon Nol floated the idea of a coup to U.S. 
military intelligence to obtain U.S. consent and military 
support for action against Prince Sihanouk and his 
government. The coup further destabilized the country 
and ushered in years of civil war between the right-wing 
government backed by intensified U.S. bombing and 
Khmer Rouge forces backed by North Vietnam. The 
communists eventually took Phnom Penh, winning the 
civil war. 

2.21. Chile 1970–1973 

Between 1960 and 1969, the Soviet government funded 
the Communist Party of Chile at a rate of between 
$50,000 and $400,000 annually. 

The U.S. government ran a psy ops action in Chile from 
1963 until the coup d'état in 1973, and the CIA was 
involved in every Chilean election during that time. In the 
1964 Chilean presidential election, the U.S. government 
supplied $2.6 million in funding to presidential candidate 
Eduardo Frei Montalva, to prevent Salvador Allende and 
the socialists winning. The U.S. also used the CIA to 
provide $12 million in funding to business interests for use 
in harming Allende's reputation. Kristian C. Gustafson 
wrote: 

It was clear the Soviet Union was operating in Chile to 
ensure Marxist success, and from the contemporary 
American point of view, the United States was required to 
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thwart this enemy influence: Soviet money and influence 
were clearly going into Chile to undermine its democracy, 
so U.S. funding would have to go into Chile to frustrate 
that pernicious influence. 

Prior to Allende's inauguration, chief of staff of the 
Chilean army, René Schneider, a general dedicated to 
preserving the constitutional order and considered "a 
major stumbling block for military officers seeking to carry 
out a coup", was targeted in a failed CIA backed 
kidnapping attempt by General Camilo Valenzuela on 
October 19, 1970. Schneider was killed three days later in 
another botched kidnapping attempt led by General 
Roberto Viaux. After the inauguration, there followed an 
extended period of social and political unrest between the 
right-dominated Congress of Chile and Allende, as well as 
economic warfare waged by Washington. U.S. President 
Richard Nixon had promised to "make the economy 
scream" to "prevent Allende from coming to power or to 
unseat him". 

On September 11, 1973, President Allende was 
overthrown by the Chilean armed forces and national 
police, bringing to power the regime of Augusto Pinochet. 
The CIA, through Project FUBELT (also known as Track II), 
worked secretly to prepare the conditions for the coup. 
While the U.S. initially denied any involvement, many 
relevant documents have been declassified in the decades 
since. 
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2.22. Bolivia 1971 

The U.S. government supported the 1971 coup led by 
General Hugo Banzer that toppled President Juan José 
Torres of Bolivia, who had himself come to power in a 
coup the previous year. Torres had displeased Washington 
by convening an "Asamblea del Pueblo" (People's 
Assembly or Popular Assembly), in which representatives 
of specific worker sectors of society were represented 
(miners, unionized teachers, students, peasants), and 
more generally by leading the country in what was 
perceived as a left wing direction. 

Banzer hatched a military uprising starting on August 18, 
1971 that succeeded in taking the reins of power by 
August 22. The U.S. subsequently provided extensive 
military and other aid to the Banzer dictatorship. Torres, 
who had fled Bolivia, was kidnapped and assassinated in 
1976 as part of Operation Condor, the U.S.-supported 
campaign of political repression and state terrorism by 
South American right-wing dictators. 

2.23. Ethiopia 1974–1991 

On September 12, 1974 Emperor Haile Selassie I of the 
Ethiopian Empire, a dynastic monarchy, was overthrown 
in a coup by the Derg, an organization set up by the 
Emperor to investigate the military. The Derg, led by 
dictator Mengistu Haile Mariam, became Marxist–Leninist 
and aligned with the Soviet Union. Numerous rebel 
groups rose up against the Derg, including conservative, 
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separatist groups, and other Marxist–Leninist groups. 
These groups would receive support by the United States. 

In the late 1980s, the rebels and the Eritrean separatists 
began to make gains against the government. The Derg 
dissolved itself in 1987, establishing the People's 
Democratic Republic of Ethiopia (PDRE) under the 
Workers' Party of Ethiopia (WPE) in an attempt to 
maintain its rule. In 1990 the USSR stopped supporting the 
Ethiopian government as it started to collapse, while the 
United States continued to support the rebels. In 1991 
Mengistu Halie Mariam resigned and fled as rebels of the 
Ethiopian People's Revolutionary Democratic Front 
(EPRDF), a coalition of left-wing ethnic rebel groups, took 
over. Despite the fact that the US opposed him, the US 
embassy helped Mariam escape to Zimbabwe. The PDRE 
was dissolved and replaced with the Tigray People's 
Liberation Front-led Transitional Government of Ethiopia, 
and a transition to parliamentary democracy began. 

2.24. Angola 1975–1991 

Beginning in the 1960s, a rebellion broke out against 
Portuguese colonial rule in the Angolan War of 
Independence, mainly involving rebel groups the People's 
Movement for the Liberation of Angola (MPLA) and the 
National Liberation Front of Angola (FNLA). In 1974, the 
right-wing military junta in Portugal was ousted in the 
Carnation Revolution. The new government promised to 
give independence to its colonies including Angola. On 
January 15, 1975, Portugal signed the Alvor Agreement 
giving independence to Angola and establishing a 



  125 
 

transitional government including the MPLA, FNLA and 
National Union for the Total Independence of Angola 
(UNITA). The transitional government consisted of the 
Portuguese High Commissioner, ruling with a Prime 
Ministerial Council (PMC) made up of three 
representatives, one from each Angolan party to the 
agreement, with a rotating premiership among the 
representatives. 

However, the various independence groups started 
fighting one another. The MPLA was a leftist group that 
was advancing upon the other two main rebel groups, the 
FNLA and UNITA, the latter led by Jonas Savimbi, a former 
FNLA fighter and Maoist who eventually became a 
capitalist ideologically and made UNITA into a capitalist 
militant group. China, Yugoslavia, Cuba and the Soviet 
Union sent arms and troops to support the MPLA, while 
South Africa sent in troops to support the FNLA and 
UNITA. By the time the Portuguese formally withdrew in 
December 1975, the MPLA had control over ten provincial 
capitals and declared the People's Republic of Angola, a 
one-party state, in Luanda, while a rival government, the 
Democratic People's Republic of Angola backed by UNITA 
and FNLA, controlled five provincial capitals from 
Huambo. 

The United States covertly supported UNITA and the FNLA 
through Operation IA Feature. President Gerald Ford 
approved of the program on July 18, 1975 while receiving 
dissent from officials in the CIA and State Department. 
Nathaniel Davis, Assistant Secretary of State, quit because 
of his disagreement with this. This program began as the 
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war for independence was ending and continued as the 
civil war began in November 1975. The funding initially 
started at $6 million but then added $8 million on July 27 
and added $25 million in August. The program was 
exposed and condemned by Congress in 1976. The Clark 
Amendment was added to the US Arms Export Control Act 
of 1976 ending the operation and restricting involvement 
in Angola. Despite this CIA Director George H.W. Bush 
conceded that some aid to the FNLA and UNITA 
continued. During the Carter Administration the limited 
support for these organizations continued. Following the 
collapse of the FNLA, only UNITA remained. 

In 1986, Ronald Reagan articulated the Reagan Doctrine, 
which called for the funding of anti-Communist forces 
across the world to "roll back" Soviet influence. The 
Reagan Administration lobbied Congress to repeal the 
Clark Amendment, which eventually occurred on July 11, 
1985. In 1986, the war in Angola became a major Cold 
War proxy conflict. Savimbi's conservative allies in the US 
lobbied for increased support to UNITA. In 1986 Savimbi 
visited the White House and afterwards Reagan approved 
the shipment of Stinger Surface-to-Air Missiles as a part of 
$25 Million in aid. 

After George H.W. Bush became president, aid to Savimbi 
continued. Savimbi began relying on the company Black, 
Manafort, and Stone in order to lobby for assistance. They 
lobbied the H.W. Bush administration for increased 
assistance and weapons to UNITA. Savimbi also met with 
Bush himself in 1990. In 1991, the MPLA and UNITA 
signed the Bicesse Accords ending US and Soviet 
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involvement in the war, initiating multi-party elections and 
establishing the Republic of Angola, while South Africa 
withdrew from Namibia. 

2.25. Argentina 1976 

The Argentine Armed Forces overthrew President Isabel 
Perón, elected in the 1973 presidential election, in the 
1976 Argentine coup d'état, as part of the US-backed 
Operation Condor, starting the military dictatorship of 
General Jorge Rafael Videla known as the National 
Reorganization Process until 1983. Both the coup and the 
following authoritarian regime were endorsed and 
supported by the U.S. government with Henry Kissinger 
paying several official visits to Argentina during the 
dictatorship. According to Spanish judge Baltasar Garzón, 
Kissinger was a witness to the regime's crimes against 
humanity. 

2.26. Afghanistan 1979–1992, 2001–2021 

In 1978, the Saur Revolution brought the Democratic 
Republic of Afghanistan to power, a one-party state 
backed by the Soviet Union. In what was known as 
Operation Cyclone, the U.S. government provided 
weapons and funding for a collection of warlords and 
several factions of jihadi guerrillas known as the Afghan 
mujahideen fighting to overthrow the Afghan 
government. The program began modestly with $695,000 
in nominally "non-lethal" aid to the mujahideen on July 3, 
1979 and escalated following the December 1979 Soviet 
invasion of Afghanistan. Through the Inter-Services 
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Intelligence (ISI) of neighboring Pakistan the U.S. 
channeled training, weapons, and money for Afghan 
fighters. The first CIA-supplied weapons were antique 
British Lee–Enfield rifles shipped out in December 1979, 
but by September 1986 the program included U.S.-origin 
state of the art weaponry, such as FIM-92 Stinger surface-
to-air missiles, some 2,300 of which were ultimately 
shipped into Afghanistan. 

Afghan Arabs also "benefited indirectly from the CIA's 
funding, through the ISI and resistance organizations." 
Some of the CIA's greatest Afghan beneficiaries were 
Islamist commanders such as Jalaluddin Haqqani and 
Gulbuddin Hekmatyar, who were key allies of Osama bin 
Laden over many years. Some of the CIA-funded militants 
would become part of al-Qaeda later on, and included bin 
Laden, according to former Foreign Secretary Robin Cook 
and other sources.Despite these and similar allegations, 
there is no direct evidence of CIA contact with bin Laden 
or his inner circle during the Soviet–Afghan War. 

U.S. support for the mujahideen ended in January 1992 
pursuant to an agreement reached with the Soviets in 
September 1991 on ending external interference in 
Afghanistan by either side. By 1992, the combined U.S., 
Saudi, and Chinese aid to the mujahideen was estimated 
at $6–12 billion, whereas Soviet military aid to 
Afghanistan was valued at $36–48 billion. The result was 
a heavily armed, militarized Afghan society: Some sources 
indicate that Afghanistan was the world's top destination 
for personal weapons during the 1980s. 
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Since 1996, Afghanistan had been under the control of 
the Taliban-led Islamic Emirate of Afghanistan, a largely 
unrecognized unitary Deobandi–Islamic theocratic 
emirate administered by shura councils. On October 7, 
2001, four weeks after the 9/11 attacks by al-Qaeda, the 
United States invaded Afghanistan and began bombing 
the country. George W. Bush said that the goal was to 
capture al-Qaeda leader Osama bin Laden and bring him 
to justice. Although none of the hijackers were of Afghan 
nationality, the attacks had been planned in Kandahar. 

On October 11, four days after the bombing started, Bush 
claimed that it might stop if bin Laden were handed over 
to the U.S. by the Taliban, which had provided safe haven 
to al-Qaeda. "If you cough him up and his people today, 
then we'll reconsider what we are doing to your country," 
Bush said. "You still have a second chance. Just bring him 
in, and bring his leaders and lieutenants and other thugs 
and criminals with him." On October 14, Bush turned 
down an offer from the Taliban to discuss sending bin 
Laden to a third country. The United Kingdom was a key 
ally of the United States, offering support for military 
action from the start of preparations for the invasion, and 
the two countries worked with anti-Taliban Afghan forces 
in the Northern Alliance. By the end of October, a further 
goal had emerged: to remove the Taliban from power in 
Afghanistan. 

From December 6–17, 2001, a team of Northern Alliance 
fighters, led by Boyce and U.S. General Tommy Franks, 
pursued bin Laden in the cave complex of Tora Bora in 
eastern Afghanistan, but he escaped to neighbouring 
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Pakistan. That same month, the Taliban Islamic Emirate of 
Afghanistan fell and was replaced by the Afghan Interim 
Administration and then the Transitional Islamic State of 
Afghanistan in 2002, and finally the Islamic Republic of 
Afghanistan in 2004. Bin Laden was killed by a team of 
United States Navy SEALs in a raid on his clandestine 
residence in Pakistan in May 2011, nearly ten years after 
the initial invasion. Despite bin Laden's death, the U.S. 
remained in Afghanistan, propping up the governments 
of Hamid Karzai and Ashraf Ghani. 

President Donald Trump struck an arrangement with the 
Taliban in February 2020 that would see U.S. troops 
withdraw from Afghanistan. In April 2021, his successor, 
Joe Biden announced that a full withdrawal would occur 
in August of that year. This was followed by the return of 
the Taliban to power. 

2.27. Poland 1980–1989 

Since the 1952 Constitution, Poland was a one-party 
Communist state, the Polish People's Republic. In the 
1980s, opposition to it crystallised in the Solidarity trade 
union, founded in 1980. The Reagan administration 
supported the Solidarity, and — based on CIA intelligence 
— waged a public relations campaign to deter what the 
Carter administration felt was "an imminent move by large 
Soviet military forces into Poland." Michael Reisman and 
James E Baker named operations in Poland as one of the 
covert actions of CIA during Cold War. Colonel Ryszard 
Kukliński, a senior officer on the Polish General Staff was 
secretly sending reports to the CIA. The CIA transferred 
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around $2 million yearly in cash to Solidarity, for a total of 
$10 million over five years. There were no direct links 
between the CIA and Solidarność, and all money was 
channeled through third parties. CIA officers were barred 
from meeting Solidarity leaders, and the CIA's contacts 
with Solidarność activists were weaker than those of the 
AFL-CIO, which raised $300,000 from its members, which 
were used to provide material and cash directly to 
Solidarity, with no control of Solidarity's use of it. The U.S. 
Congress authorized the National Endowment for 
Democracy to promote democracy, and the NED allocated 
$10 million to Solidarity. 

When the Polish government launched martial law in 
December 1981, however, Solidarity was not alerted. 
Potential explanations for this vary; some believe that the 
CIA was caught off guard, while others suggest that 
American policy-makers viewed an internal crackdown as 
preferable to an "inevitable Soviet intervention." CIA 
support for Solidarity included money, equipment and 
training, which was coordinated by Special Operations. 
Henry Hyde, U.S. House intelligence committee member, 
stated that the US provided "supplies and technical 
assistance in terms of clandestine newspapers, 
broadcasting, propaganda, money, organizational help 
and advice".  

Initial funds for covert actions by CIA were $2 million, but 
soon after authorization were increased and by 1985 CIA 
successfully infiltrated Poland. 
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2.28. Chad 1981–1982 

In 1975 as part of the First Chadian Civil War, the military 
overthrew François Tombalbaye and installed Félix 
Malloum as head of state. Hissène Habré was appointed 
Prime minister, and attempted to overthrow the 
government in February 1979, failing, and being forced 
out. In 1979 Malloum resigned and Goukouni Oueddei 
became head of state. Oueddei agreed to share power 
with Habre, appointing him Minister of Defense, but 
fighting resumed soon after. Habre was exiled to Sudan in 
1980. 

At the time the U.S. government wanted a bulwark 
against Muammar Gaddafi in Libya, and saw Chad, Libya's 
southern neighbor, as a good option. Chad and Libya had 
recently signed an agreement to attempt to end their 
border conflict and "to work to achieve full unity between 
the two countries", which the United States was against. 
The United States also saw Oueddei as too close to 
Gaddafi. Habre was already pro-western and pro-
American, as well as against Oueddei. The Reagan 
administration gave him covert support through the CIA 
when he returned in 1981 to continue fighting, and he 
overthrow Goukouni Oueddi on June 7, 1982, making 
himself the new president of Chad. 

The CIA continued to support Habre after he took power, 
including training and equipping the Documentation and 
Security Directorate (DDS), Chad's notorious secret police. 
They also supported Chad in their 1986–1987 war against 
Libya. 
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2.29. Nicaragua1981–1990 

The FSLN (Sandinista National Liberation Front) had 
overthrown in 1979 the Somoza family, friendly with the 
US. At first the Carter Administration tried to be friendly 
with the new government, but the Reagan Administration 
that came after had a much more anti-communist foreign 
policy. Immediately in January 1981, Ronald Reagan cut 
off aid to the Nicaraguan government, and August 6, 
1981 Reagan signed National Security Decision Directive 
7, authorizing the production and shipment of arms to the 
region but not their deployment. On November 17, 1981 
Reagan signed National Security Directive 17, allowing 
covert support to anti-Sandinista forces. The U.S. 
government attempted to topple the government of 
Nicaragua by secretly arming, training and funding the 
Contras, a rebel group based in Honduras that fought to 
overthrow the Nicaraguan government. As part of the 
training, the CIA distributed a detailed manual entitled 
"Psychological Operations in Guerrilla War," which 
instructed the Contras, among other things, on how to 
blow up public buildings, to assassinate judges, to create 
martyrs, and to blackmail ordinary citizens. In addition to 
backing the Contras, the U.S. government also blew up 
bridges and mined harbors, causing the damaging of at 
least seven merchant ships and blowing up numerous 
Nicaraguan fishing boats. They also attacked Corinto 
harbour, causing 112 wounded according to the 
Nicaraguan government. 

After the Boland Amendment made it illegal for the U.S. 
government to provide funding for Contra activities, the 
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administration of President Reagan secretly sold arms to 
the Iranian government to fund a secret U.S. government 
apparatus that continued illegally to fund the Contras, in 
what became known as the Iran–Contra affair. The U.S. 
continued to arm and train the Contras even after the 
Sandinista government of Nicaragua won the elections of 
1984. In the 1990 Nicaraguan General Election, the 
George H.W. Bush Administration authorized 49.75 
million dollars of non-lethal aid to the Contras. They 
continued to assassinate candidates and fight the war and 
distributed leaflets promoting the opposition party UNO 
(National Opposition Union), which won the election. The 
Contras ended fighting soon afterwards. 

2.30. Grenada 1983 

On 25 October 1983, the U.S. military and a coalition of six 
Caribbean nations invaded the nation of Grenada, 
codenamed Operation Urgent Fury, and successfully 
overthrew the Marxist government of Hudson Austin 
which was backed by Cuban soldiers.  

The conflict was triggered by the killing of the previous 
leader of Grenada Maurice Bishop and the establishment 
of Hudson as the country's leader a week before on 19 
October.  

The United Nations General Assembly called the U.S. 
invasion "a flagrant violation of international law" but a 
similar resolution widely supported in the United Nations 
Security Council was vetoed by the U.S. 
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2.31. Panama 1989–1994 

In 1979, the U.S. and Panama signed a treaty to end the 
Panama canal zone and promise that the U.S. would hand 
over the canal after 1999. Manuel Noriega ruled the 
country of Panama as dictator. He was an ally of the 
United States working with them against the Sandinistas 
in Nicaragua and the EZLN in El Salvador. Despite this, 
relations began to deteriorate as he was implicated in the 
Iran-Contra Scandel including drug trafficking. As relations 
continued to deteriorate Noriega started to ally with the 
Eastern Bloc. This also worried US officials and 
government officials like Elliott Abrams started arguing to 
Reagan that the US should invade Panama. Reagan 
decided to hold off due to George H. W. Bush's ties to 
Noriega when he was the head of the CIA running his 
election, but after Bush was elected he started pressuring 
Noriega. Despite irregularities in the 1989 Panamanian 
general election, Noriega refused to allow the opposition 
candidate into power. Bush called on him to honor the 
will of the Panamanian people. Coup attempts were made 
against Noriega and skirmishes broke out between U.S. 
and Panamanian troops. Noriega was also indicted for 
drug charges in the United States. 

In December 1989, in a military operation code-named 
Operation Just Cause, the U.S. invaded Panama. Noriega 
went into hiding but was later captured by US forces. 
President-elect Guillermo Endara was sworn into office. 
The United States ended Operation Just Cause in January 
1990 and began Operation Promote Liberty, which was 
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the occupation of the country to set up the new 
government until 1994. 

2.32. Haiti 1991, 1994–1995 

Eight months after what was widely considered the first 
honest election held in Haiti, the newly elected President 
Jean-Bertrand Aristide was deposed by the Haitian army. 
It is alleged by some that the CIA "paid key members of the 
coup regime forces, identified as drug traffickers, for 
information from the mid-1980s at least until the coup." 
Coup leaders Cédras and François had received military 
training in the United States. 

After a right-wing military junta took over Haiti in 1991 in 
a coup, the U.S. initially had good relations with them. 
George H. W. Bush's administration supported the right 
wing junta; however, after the 1992 U.S. general election 
Bill Clinton came to power. Clinton was supportive of 
returning Jean-Bertrand Aristide to power, and his 
administration was active for the return of democracy to 
Haiti. This culminated in United Nations Security Council 
Resolution 940, which authorized the United States to 
lead an invasion of Haiti and restore Aristide to power. A 
diplomatic effort was led by former U.S. president Jimmy 
Carter. Then the U.S. gave the Haitian government an 
ultimatum: either the dictator of Haiti, Raoul Cedras, retire 
peacefully and let Aristide come back to power, or be 
invaded and forced out. Cedras capitulated; however, he 
did not immediately disband the armed forces. Protesters 
fought the military and police. The U.S. sent in the military 
to stop the violence, and soon it was quelled. Aristide 
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returned to lead the country in October 1994. Clinton and 
him presided over ceremonies and Operation Uphold 
Democracy officially ended on March 31, 1995. 

2.33. Zaire 1996–1997 

Due to the end of the Cold War, US support for Mobutu 
Sese Seko in Zaire reduced. In 1990 the Rwandan Patriotic 
Front (FPR) invaded Rwanda, beginning the Rwandan 
Civil War, which culminated in the Rwandan genocide 
against the Tutsis and caused over 1.5 million refugees to 
flee into Zaire, where fighting broke out between refugee 
and non-refugee Tutsis, Hutu refugees, and other ethnic 
groups. In response, Rwanda formed Tutsi militias in Zaire, 
causing tensions between the militias and the Zaire 
government leading to the Banyamulenge Rebellion on 
August 31, 1996, which led to the creation of Tutsi and 
non-Tutsi militias opposed to Mobutu into the Alliance of 
Democratic Forces for the Liberation of the Congo (AFDL), 
led by Laurent-Desire Kabila. This would begin the First 
Congo War with Rwanda, along with Uganda, Burundi, 
and later on Angola supporting the AFDL. The anti-
Mobutu forces succeeded and Mobutu fled the country. 

The United States covertly supported Rwanda before and 
during the Congo war. The U.S. believed it was time for 
"new generation of African leaders", such as Kagame and 
Yoweri Museveni in Uganda, which was part of the reason 
the U.S. had previously stopped supporting Mobutu. The 
U.S. sent soldiers to train the FPR and brought FPR 
commanders to the U.S as well before the war in 1995 for 
training. During the war, rebels in Bukavu were joined by 
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a group of African–American mercenaries, who claimed 
they had been recruited in an unofficial U.S. mission. The 
CIA and U.S. army set up communications in Uganda, and 
during the war, several aircraft landed in Kigali and 
Entebbe, claiming to be bringing "aid for the genocide 
victims"; however, it has been alleged they were bringing 
military and communication supplies for the FPR. At the 
same time, U.S. operated anti-Mobutu support from the 
International Rescue Committee (IRC). 

2.34. Yugoslavia 2000 

Following issues regarding the results of the 2000 
Yugoslavian general election, the U.S. State Department 
heavily supported opposition groups such as Otpor! 
through the supply of promotional material and 
consulting services via Quangos. United States 
involvement served to speed up and organize dissent 
through exposure, resources, moral and material 
encouragement, technological aid and professional 
advice. This campaign was one of the factors contributing 
to incumbent president's defeat in the 2000 Yugoslavian 
general election and subsequent Bulldozer Revolution 
which overthrew Milošević on October 5, 2000 after he 
refused to recognise the results of the election. 

2.35. Palestina 2006–2007 

The Bush Administration was displeased with the 
government formed by Hamas, which won 56 percent of 
the seats in the Palestinian legislative election of 2006. 
The U.S. government pressured the Fatah faction of the 
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Palestinian leadership to topple the Hamas government of 
Prime Minister Ismail Haniyeh, and provided funding, 
including a secret training and armaments program that 
received tens of millions of dollars in congressional 
funding. This funding was initially blocked by Congress, 
who feared that arms provided to Palestinians might later 
be used against Israel, but the Bush administration 
circumvented Congress. 

Fatah launched a war against the Haniyeh government. 
When the government of Saudi Arabia attempted to 
negotiate a truce between the sides so as to avoid a wide-
scale Palestinian civil war, the U.S. government pressured 
Fatah to reject the Saudi plan and to continue the effort to 
topple the Hamas government. Ultimately, the Hamas 
government was prevented from ruling over all of the 
Palestinian territories, with Fatah retreating to the West 
Bank and Hamas retreating to and taking control of the 
Gaza strip. 

2.36. Libya 2011 

In 2011, Libya had been led by Muammar Gaddafi since 
1969. In February 2011, amid the "Arab Spring", a 
revolution broke out against him, spreading from the 
second city Benghazi (where an interim government was 
set up on 27 February), to the capital Tripoli, sparking the 
First Libyan Civil War. On 17 March, United Nations 
Security Council Resolution 1973 was adopted, 
authorizing a no-fly zone over Libya, and "all necessary 
measures" to protect civilians. Two days later, France, the 
United States and the United Kingdom launched the 2011 
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military intervention in Libya with Operation Odyssey 
Dawn, US and British naval forces firing over 110 
Tomahawk cruise missiles, the French and British Air 
Forces undertaking sorties across Libya and a naval 
blockade by Coalition forces. A coalition of 27 states from 
Europe and the Middle East soon joined the NATO-led 
intervention, as Operation Unified Protector. The Gaddafi 
government collapsed in August, leaving the National 
Transitional Council as the de facto government, with UN 
recognition. Gaddafi was captured and killed in October 
by National Transitional Council forces and NATO action 
ceased. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 

III. ANTI COMMUNISM 
WARS 1945-2022      
3.1. Anti Communism Mindset Trap 
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associated with communism. Satanic democracy continues 
to campaign against socialism as an atheist that can be 
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Civilized Socialism are civilized religious and aware that 
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the 1917 October Revolution in Russia and it reached 
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States and the Soviet Union engaged in an intense rivalry. 
Anti-communism has been an element of movements 
which hold many different political positions, including 
conservatism, fascism, liberalism, nationalism, social 
democracy, libertarianism, and the Anti-Stalinist left. Anti-
communism has also been expressed in philosophy, by 
several religious groups, and in literature. Some well-
known proponents of anti-communism claim to be former 
communists. Anti-communism has also been prominent 
among movements resisting Communist governance. 

The first organization which was specifically dedicated to 
opposing communism was the Russian White movement 
which fought in the Russian Civil War starting in 1918 
against the recently established Bolshevik government. 
The White movement was militarily supported by several 
allied foreign governments which represented the first 
instance of anti-communism as a government policy. 
Nevertheless, the Red Army defeated the White 
movement and the Soviet Union was created in 1922. 
During the existence of the Soviet Union, anti-communism 
became an important feature of many different political 
movements and governments across the world. 

In the United States, anti-communism came to prominence 
during the First Red Scare of 1919–1920. During the 
1920s and 1930s, opposition to communism in Europe 
was promoted by conservatives, fascists, liberals, and 
social democrats. Fascist governments rose to prominence 
as major opponents of communism in the 1930s. In 1936, 
the Anti Comintern Pact, initially between Nazi Germany 
and the Empire of Japan, was formed as an anti-
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communist alliance. In Asia, the Empire of Japan and the 
Kuomintang (the Chinese Nationalist Party) were the 
leading anti-communist forces in this period. 

During World War II, the communist Soviet Union was 
among major Allied nations fighting the Axis Powers. 
Shortly after the end of World War II, rivalry between the 
Marxist–Leninist Soviet Union and liberal-capitalist United 
States resulted in the Cold War. During this period, the 
United States government played a leading role in 
supporting global anti-communism as part of its 
containment policy. Military conflicts between 
Communists and anti-Communists occurred in various 
parts of the world, including during the Chinese Civil War, 
the Korean War, the Malayan Emergency, the Vietnam 
War, the Soviet–Afghan War and Operation Condor. 
NATO was founded as an anti-communist military alliance 
in 1949, and continued throughout the Cold War. 

After the Revolutions of 1989 and the dissolution of the 
Soviet Union in 1991, most of the world's communist 
governments were overthrown, and the Cold War ended. 
Nevertheless, anti-communism remains an important 
intellectual element of many contemporary political 
movements. Organized anti-communist movements 
remain in opposition to People's Republic of China and 
other Communist nations. 

Since the 19th century, United States government has 
participated and interfered, both overtly and covertly, in 
the replacement of several foreign governments. In the 
latter half of the 19th century, the U.S. government 
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initiated actions for regime change mainly in Latin 
America and the southwest Pacific, including the Spanish–
American and Philippine–American wars. At the onset of 
the 20th century, the United States shaped or installed 
governments in many countries around the world, 
including neighbors Panama, Honduras, Nicaragua, 
Mexico, Haiti, and the Dominican Republic. 

During World War II, the United States helped overthrow 
many Nazi German or Imperial Japanese puppet regimes. 
Examples include regimes in the Philippines, Korea, the 
Eastern portion of China, and much of Europe. United 
States forces were also instrumental in ending the rule of 
Adolf Hitler over Germany and of Benito Mussolini over 
Italy. 

In the aftermath of World War II, the U.S. government 
struggled with the Soviet Union for global leadership, 
influence and security within the context of the Cold War. 
Under the Eisenhower administration, the U.S. 
government feared that national security would be 
compromised by governments propped by the Soviet 
Union's own involvement in regime change and promoted 
the domino theory, with later presidents following 
Eisenhower's precedent. Subsequently, the United States 
expanded the geographic scope of its actions beyond 
traditional area of operations, Central America and the 
Caribbean. Significant operations included the United 
States and United Kingdom-orchestrated 1953 Iranian 
coup d'état, the 1961 Bay of Pigs Invasion targeting Cuba, 
and support for the overthrow of Sukarno by General 
Suharto in Indonesia. In addition, the U.S. has interfered in 
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the national elections of countries, including Italy in 1948, 
the Philippines in 1953, and Japan in the 1950s and 1960s 
as well as Lebanon in 1957. According to one study, the 
U.S. performed at least 81 overt and covert known 
interventions in foreign elections during the period 1946–
2000. Another study found that the U.S. engaged in 64 
covert and six overt attempts at regime change during the 
Cold War. 

Following the dissolution of the Soviet Union, the United 
States has led or supported wars to determine the 
governance of a number of countries. Stated U.S. aims in 
these conflicts have included fighting the War on Terror, 
as in the Afghan War, or removing dictatorial and hostile 
regimes, as in the Iraq War. 

3.2. China War  1945–1949  

The U.S. government provided military, logistical and 
other aid to the Chinese Nationalist Party (KMT) army led 
by Chiang Kai-shek in its civil war against the indigenous 
communist People's Liberation Army (PLA) led by Mao 
Zedong. Both the KMT and the PLA were fighting against 
Japanese occupation forces, until the Japanese surrender 
to the United States in August 1945. This surrender 
brought to an end the Japanese Puppet state of 
Manchukuo and the Japanese-dominated Wang Jingwei 
regime. 

After the Japanese surrender, the US continued to support 
the KMT against the PLA. The US airlifted many KMT 
troops from central China to Manchuria. Approximately 
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50,000 U.S. troops were sent to guard strategic sites in 
Hubei and Shandong. The U.S. trained and equipped KMT 
troops, and also transported Korean troops and even 
imperial Japanese troops back to help KMT forces fight, 
and ultimately lose, against the People's Liberation Army. 
President Harry Truman justified deploying the very 
Japanese occupying army under whose boot the Chinese 
people had suffered so terribly to fight against the 
Chinese communists in this way: "It was perfectly clear to 
us that if we told the Japanese to lay down their arms 
immediately and march to the seaboard, the entire 
country would be taken over by the Communists. We 
therefore had to take the unusual step of using the enemy 
as a garrison until we could airlift Chinese National troops 
to South China and send Marines to guard the seaports." 
Within less than two years after the Sino-Japanese War, 
the KMT had received $4.43 billion from the United 
States—most of which was military aid. 

3.3. Ukraine 1991-2022 

Decommunization in Ukraine started during and after the 
dissolution of the Soviet Union in 1991. With the success 
of the Revolution of Dignity in 2014, the Ukrainian 
government approved laws that outlawed communist 
symbols. 

On 15 May 2015, President of Ukraine Petro Poroshenko 
signed a set of laws that started a six-month period for the 
removal of communist monuments (excluding World War 
II monuments) and renaming of public places named after 
communist-related themes.] At the time, this meant that 
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22 cities and 44 villages were set to get new names. Until 
21 November 2015, municipal governments had the 
authority to implement this; if they failed to do so, the 
Oblasts of Ukraine had until 21 May 2016 to change the 
names. If after that date the settlement had retained its 
old name, the Cabinet of Ministers of Ukraine would wield 
authority to assign a new name to the settlement. In 2016, 
51,493 streets and 987 cities and villages were renamed, 
and 1,320 Lenin monuments and 1,069 monuments to 
other communist figures removed. Violation of the law 
carries a penalty of a potential media ban and prison 
sentences of up to five years. 

On 24 July 2015, the Ministry of the Interior stripped the 
Communist Party of Ukraine, the Communist Party of 
Ukraine (renewed), and the Communist Party of Workers 
and Peasants of their right to participate in elections and 
stated it was continuing the court actions that started in 
July 2014 to end the registration of communist parties in 
Ukraine. By 16 December 2015, these three parties had 
been banned in Ukraine; however, the Communist Party 
of Ukraine appealed the ban, meaning the court's decision 
to ban the party did not come into force. The April 2015 
decommunization law contains a norm that allows the 
Ministry of Justice to prohibit the party from participating 
in elections. 

An unofficial decommunization process started in Ukraine 
after the dissolution of the Soviet Union and the following 
independence of Ukraine in 1991.Decommunization was 
carried out much more ruthlessly and visibly in the former 
Soviet Union's Baltic states and Warsaw Pact countries 
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outside the Soviet Union. Ukraine's first president after the 
country's 1991 independence from the Soviet Union, 
Leonid Kravchuk, had also issued orders aimed at "de-
sovietisation" in the early 1990s. The following years, 
although at a slow rate, historical monuments to Soviet 
leaders were removed in Ukraine; this process went on 
much further in the Ukrainian-speaking western regions 
than in the industrialised, largely Russian-speaking eastern 
regions. Decommunization laws were drafted in the 
Ukrainian parliament in 2002, 2005, 2009, 2011, and 
2013, but they all failed to materialize. 

During and after Euromaidan, starting with the fall of the 
monument to Lenin in Kyiv on 8 December 2013, several 
Lenin monuments and statues were removed or destroyed 
by protesters. 

In April 2014, a year before the formal, nationwide 
decommunization process in Ukraine local authorities 
removed and altered communist symbols and place 
names, as in Dnipropetrovsk. 

On 9 April 2015, the Ukrainian parliament passed 
legislation on decommunization. It was submitted by the 
Second Yatsenyuk Government, banning the promotion of 
symbols of "Communist and National Socialist totalitarian 
regimes". One of the main provisions of the bill was the 
recognition of the Soviet Union was "criminal" and one 
that it "pursued a state terror policy". The legislation 
prohibits the use of Communist symbols and propaganda 
and also bans all symbols and propaganda of national-
socialism and its values and any activities of Nazi or fascist 
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groups in Ukraine. The ban applies to monuments, place 
and street names. The ban does not apply to World War II 
monuments and when symbols are located in a cemetery. 
Expressing pro-communist views was not made illegal. The 
ban on communist symbols did result in the removal of 
hundreds of statues, the replacement of millions of street 
signs and the renaming of populated places including 
some of Ukraine's biggest cities like Dnipro. The city 
administration of Dnipro estimated in June 2015 that 80 
streets, embankments, squares, and boulevards would 
have to be renamed. Maxim Eristavi of Hromadske.TV 
estimated late April 2015 that the nationwide renaming 
would cost around $1.5 billion. The legislation also 
granted special legal status to veterans of the "struggle for 
Ukrainian independence" from 1917 to 1991 (the lifespan 
of the Soviet Union). The same day, the parliament also 
passed a law that replaced the term "Great Patriotic War" 
in the national lexicon with "World War II" from 1939 to 
1945, a change of great significance. 

On 15 May 2015, President of Ukraine Petro Poroshenko 
signed the Decommunisation Laws. This started a six-
month period for the removal of communist monuments 
and renaming of public places named after communist-
related themes. 

The Ukrainian decommunization law applies, but is not 
limited to: 

 the Flag of the Soviet Union 
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 the Flag of the Ukrainian Soviet Socialist Republic and 
its 14 other republics as well as the socialist countries of 
Eastern Europe and abroad 

 the State Emblem of the Soviet Union and its 
constituent republics as well as the socialist countries of 
Eastern Europe and abroad 

 the State Anthem of the Soviet Union and the republics 
 the Red star 
 the Hammer and sickle 
 images bearing the likeness of Vladimir Lenin, Leon 

Trosky, Joseph Stalin, Mao Zedong and Che Guevara 
 military uniforms 

The laws were published in Holos Ukrayiny on 20 May 
2015; this made them come into force officially the next 
day. 

On 3 June 2015, the Ukrainian Institute of National 
Memory published a list of 22 cities and 44 villages subject 
to renaming. By far most of these places were in the 
Donbass region in East Ukraine; the others were situated 
in Central Ukraine and South Ukraine. Under the 
Decommunisation Laws the municipal governments had 
until 21 November 2015 to change the name of the 
settlement they govern. For settlements that failed to 
rename, the provincial authorities had until 21 May 2016 
to change the name. If after that date the settlement still 
retained its old name the Cabinet of Ministers of Ukraine 
renamed the settlement. 

In a 24 July 2015 decree based on the decommunization 
laws, the Ukrainian Interior Ministry stripped the 
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Communist Party of Ukraine, Communist Party of Ukraine 
(renewed) and Communist Party of Workers and Peasants 
of their right to participate in elections and it stated it was 
continuing the court actions (that started in July 2014) to 
end the registration of Ukraine's communist parties. 

On 30 September 2015, the District Administrative Court 
in Kyiv banned the parties Communist Party of Workers 
and Peasants and Communist Party of Ukraine (renewed); 
they both did not appeal. 

In October 2015, a statue of Lenin in Odessa was 
converted into a statue of Star Wars villain Darth Vader. 
On 16 December 2015, the Kyiv District Administrative 
Court validated the claim of the Ministry of Justice in full, 
banning the activities of the Communist Party of Ukraine. 
The party appealed this ban at the European Court of 
Human Rights. 

In March 2016, statues of Lenin, Felix Dzerzhinsky, Sergey 
Kirov and a Komsomol monument were removed or taken 
down in the eastern city of Zaporizhia. The statue 
overlooking the Dnieper Hydroelectric Station (formerly 
named Lenin Dam) was the largest remaining Lenin statue 
in Ukraine. 

On 19 May 2016, the Ukrainian parliament voted to 
rename Ukraine's fourth-largest city Dnipropetrovsk to 
"Dnipro". The renaming of various locations was signed 
into the law on 20 May 2016. 
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The Ukrainian parliament declared in July 2016 that the 
new names of places in Crimea, under full Russian control 
since the 2014 Russian annexation of Crimea, "will enter 
force with the return of temporarily occupied territory of 
the Autonomous Republic of Crimea and Sevastopol under 
the general jurisdiction of Ukraine." 

In May 2017, 46 Ukrainian MPs, mainly from the 
Opposition Bloc faction, appealed to the Constitutional 
Court of Ukraine to declare the 2015 decommunization 
laws unconstitutional. 

Director of the Ukrainian Institute of National 
Remembrance Volodymyr Viatrovych stated in February 
2018 that "De-communism in the context of depriving the 
symbols of the totalitarian regime has actually been 
completed". Although according to him the city of Kyiv 
was lagging behind. 

In February 2019, the Central Election Commission of 
Ukraine refused to register the candidacy of (leader of 
Communist Party) Petro Symonenko for the 2019 
Ukrainian presidential election due to the fact that the 
statute, name and symbolism of the Communist Party of 
Ukraine did not comply with the 2015 decommunization 
laws. Symonenko appealed the decision, but the court of 
appeal confirmed decision of the Central Election 
Commission of Ukraine. During the same month of 
February, it was announced that the oblast of 
Dnipropetrovsk would be renamed to "Sicheslav" in the 
future. 
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On 16 July 2019, the Constitutional Court of Ukraine 
upheld the 2015 Ukrainian decommunization laws. 

On 7 November 2020 in the village Mala Rohan , a coat of 
arms of the USSR was dismantled from the facade of a 
school. 

On 18 May 2015, the OSCE expressed concern that the 
laws could negatively impact the freedom of the press in 
Ukraine. The OSCE also regretted what it perceived as a 
lack of opportunity of civil society to participate in public 
discussions about the laws. 

The Kharkiv Human Rights Protection Group stated (in 
May 2015) the laws "(one of which) effectively criminalizes 
public expression of views held by many Ukrainians". 

Russian lawmakers have argued (in April 2015) that it was 
"cynical" to put communist and Nazi symbol on par with 
each other, and pro-Russian rebels in Donbas (a region in 
eastern Ukraine) have condemned the law. The then head 
of the Donetsk People's Republic Alexander Zakharchenko 
stated in late February 2016 that when renamed cities 
"return under our jurisdiction", they would be renamed to 
their pre-decommunized name. 

On 18 December 2015, the Venice Commission stated that 
Ukraine's Decommunization Laws did not comply with 
European legislative standards. It was in particular critical 
about the banning of Communist parties. 
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In February 2022, in connection with a presidential 
address of Russian president Vladimir Putin in the midst of 
the Russo-Ukrainian crisis, Putin addressed the Ukrainian 
legal process of decommunisation that had begun in 
Ukraine in 2015, and extended the traditional definition 
of decommunization in Ukraine and said, "You want 
decommunisation? That suits us fine. But don’t stop 
halfway. We’re ready to show Ukraine what real 
decommunisation means for Ukraine." During the same 
speech, Putin had stated that Ukraine was a creation of 
the Bolsheviks, specifically blaming Vladimir Lenin for 
"detaching Ukraine from Russia. 

Since 16 December 2015 three communist parties are 
banned in Ukraine (the Communist Party of Ukraine, 
Communist Party of Ukraine (renewed) and Communist 
Party of Workers and Peasants). The only party that 
appealed this ban was the Communist Party of Ukraine; 
this resulted in the court's decision to ban the Communist 
Party of Ukraine did not come into force. However, the 
April 2015 decommunization law contains a norm that 
allows the Ministry of Justice to prohibit the Communist 
Party from participating in elections. 

Ukraine had 5,500 Lenin monuments in 1991, declining to 
1,300 by December 2015. More than 700 Lenin 
monuments were removed and/or destroyed from 
February 2014 (when 376 came down) to December 
2015.  On 16 January 2017 the Ukrainian Institute of 
National Remembrance announced that 1,320 Lenin 
monuments were dismantled during decommunization. 
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On 16 January 2017, the Ukrainian Institute of National 
Remembrance stated that 51,493 streets, squares and 
"other facilities" had been renamed due to 
decommunization. By June 2016 there were renamed 19 
raions, 27 urban districts, 29 cities, 48 urban-type 
settlements, 119 rural settlements and 711 villages. The 
fourth largest city was renamed from Dnipropetrovsk to 
Dnipro. In the second-largest city of Ukraine, Kharkiv, 
more than 200 streets, 5 administrative raions, 4 parks and 
1 metro station had been renamed by early February 
2016. In all of 2016 51,493 streets and 987 cities and 
villages were renamed, 25 raions were renamed and 1,320 
Lenin monuments and 1,069 monuments to other 
communist figures removed. In some villages Lenin statues 
were remade into "non-communist historical figures" to 
save money. One of the most prominent examples was 
Lenin monument in Odessa, which was remade into the 
monument to Darth Vader. 

In February 2019, The Guardian reported that the two 
Lenin statues in the Chernobyl Exclusion Zone were the 
only two remaining statues of Lenin in Ukraine, if not 
taking to account occupied territories of Ukraine. In 
January 2021 "Radio Free Europe/Radio Liberty" located 
three remaining Lenin statues in three (Ukrainian 
controlled) small villages. 

In January 2021, 24 Ukrainian streets were still named 
after former cosmonaut Valentina Tereshkova (6 of them 
in parts of Ukrainian not under government control), 
according to the 2015 decommunization laws they should 
have been renamed. The last Lenin statue in Ukraine 
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(excluding territories currently annexed by Russia or 
occupied by separatists) was demolished in Stari Troyany, 
Izmail Raion, Odessa Oblast on 27 January 2021. A 
November 2016 poll, found that 48% of respondents 
supported a ban on Communist ideology in Ukraine, 36% 
were against it and 16% are undecided. It also found that 
41% of respondents said they support the initiative to 
dismantle all monuments to Lenin in the country, whereas 
(48 percent) are against this and 11% are undecided. 

3.4. Indonesia Mass Killing 1965-1966 

The Indonesian mass killings of 1965–1966, also known as 
the Indonesian genocide, Indonesian Communist Purge, 
or Indonesian politicide (Indonesian: Pembunuhan Massal 
Indonesia & Pembersihan G.30.S/PKI), were large-scale 
killings and civil unrest that occurred in Indonesia over 
several months, targeting Communist Party of Indonesia 
(PKI) party members, communist sympathisers, Gerwani 
women, ethnic Javanese Abangan, ethnic Chinese, and 
alleged leftists, often at the instigation of the armed forces 
and government, which were supported by the United 
States and other Western countries. It began as an anti-
communist purge following a controversial attempted 
coup d'état by the 30 September Movement. According to 
the most widely published estimates at least 500,000 to 
more than one million people were killed, with some 
estimates going as high as two to three million. The purge 
was a pivotal event in the transition to the "New Order" 
and the elimination of PKI as a political force, with impacts 
on the global Cold War. The upheavals led to the fall of 
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President Sukarno and the commencement of Suharto's 
three-decade authoritarian presidency. 

The abortive coup attempt released pent-up communal 
hatreds in Indonesia; these were fanned by the 
Indonesian Army, which quickly blamed the PKI. 
Additionally, the intelligence agencies of the United 
States, United Kingdom and Australia engaged in black 
propaganda campaigns against Indonesian communists. 
During the Cold War, the U.S. government and its Western 
Bloc allies had the goal of halting the spread of 
communism and bringing countries into its sphere of 
influence. Britain had additional reasons for seeking 
Sukarno's removal, as his government was involved in an 
undeclared war with the neighbouring Federation of 
Malaya, a Commonwealth federation of former British 
colonies. 

Communists were purged from political, social, and 
military life, and the PKI itself was disbanded and banned. 
Massacres began in October 1965, in the weeks following 
the coup attempt, and reached their peak over the 
remainder of the year before subsiding in the early 
months of 1966. They started in the capital, Jakarta, and 
spread to Central and East Java, and later Bali. Thousands 
of local vigilantes and Army units killed actual and alleged 
PKI members. Killings occurred across the country, with 
the worst in the PKI strongholds of Central Java, East Java, 
Bali, and northern Sumatra. It is possible that over one 
million people were imprisoned at one time or another. 
Sukarno's balancing act of "Nasakom" (nationalism, 
religion, and communism) unravelled. His most significant 
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pillar of support, the PKI, was effectively eliminated by the 
other two pillars—the Army and political Islam; and the 
Army was on the way to unchallenged power. In March 
1967, Sukarno was stripped of his remaining power by 
Indonesia's provisional parliament, and Suharto was 
named Acting President. In March 1968, Suharto was 
formally elected president. 

The killings are skipped over in most Indonesian history 
textbooks and have received little introspection by 
Indonesians due to their suppression under the Suharto 
regime. The search for satisfactory explanations for the 
scale and frenzy of the violence has challenged scholars 
from all ideological perspectives. The possibility of 
returning to similar upheavals is cited as a factor in the 
"New Order" administration's political conservatism and 
tight control of the political system. Vigilance and stigma 
against a perceived communist threat remained a 
hallmark of Suharto's doctrine, and it is still in force even 
today. 

Despite a consensus at the highest levels of the U.S. and 
British governments that it would be necessary "to 
liquidate Sukarno", as related in a CIA memorandum from 
1962, and the existence of extensive contacts between 
anti-communist army officers and the U.S. military 
establishment – training of over 1,200 officers, "including 
senior military figures", and providing weapons and 
economic assistance – the CIA denied active involvement 
in the killings. Declassified U.S. documents in 2017 
revealed that the U.S. government had detailed 
knowledge of the mass killings from the beginning and 



  159 
 

was supportive of the actions of the Indonesian Army. U.S. 
complicity in the killings, which included providing 
extensive lists of PKI officials to Indonesian death squads, 
has previously been established by historians and 
journalists. A top-secret CIA report from 1968 stated that 
the massacres "rank as one of the worst mass murders of 
the 20th century, along with the Soviet purges of the 
1930s, the Nazi mass murders during the Second World 
War, and the Maoist bloodbath of the early 1950s. 

Support for Sukarno's presidency under his "Guided 
Democracy" depended on his forced and unstable 
"Nasakom" coalition between the military, religious 
groups, and communists. The rise in influence and 
increasing militancy of the Communist Party of Indonesia 
(PKI), and Sukarno's support for it, was a serious concern 
for Muslims and the military, and tension grew steadily in 
the early and mid-1960s. The third-largest communist 
party in the world, the PKI had approximately 300,000 
cadres and full membership of around two million. The 
party's assertive efforts to speed up land reform frightened 
those who controlled the land and threatened the social 
position of Muslim clerics. Sukarno required government 
employees to study his Nasakom principles as well as 
Marxist theory. He had met with Zhou Enlai, Premier of 
the People's Republic of China, and after this meeting had 
decided to create a militia, called a Fifth Force, which he 
intended to control personally. Sukarno ordered weapons 
from China to equip this Fifth Force. He declared in a 
speech that he favoured revolutionary groups whether 
they were nationalist, religious or communist, stating, "I 
am a friend of the Communists because the Communists 
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are revolutionary people." He said at a Non-Aligned 
Movement summit meeting in Cairo in October 1964 that 
his current purpose was to drive all of Indonesian politics 
to the left and thereby to neutralise the "reactionary" 
elements in the Army that could be dangerous for the 
revolution. Sukarno's international policies increasingly 
reflected his rhetoric. 

Sukarno hosted the Bandung Conference in 1955 (in 
Bandung, Indonesia). It was a conference of mostly former 
colonised countries throughout Asia and Africa (including 
China, North Vietnam, Laos, and Cambodia). The 
conference was the predecessor to the Non-Aligned 
Movement and was not a communist convention. 
However, this was enough for the U.S. to be very 
suspicious of Sukarno and suspect him of deep communist 
sympathies.  

The PKI became very popular in Indonesia and performed 
better and better in elections throughout the 1950s. They 
were less corrupt than other political parties and followed 
through on their promises.  

As early as 1958, Western powers—in particular the U.S. 
and the U.K.—pushed for policies that would encourage 
the Indonesian Army to act forcefully against the PKI and 
the Left, which included a covert propaganda campaign 
designed to damage the reputation of Sukarno and the 
PKI, and secret assurances along with military and 
financial support to anti-communist leaders within the 
Army.  The U.S. Central Intelligence Agency (CIA) 
considered assassinating Sukarno and selected an "asset" 
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to do the job, but instead produced a porn video with an 
actor portraying Sukarno and a Soviet flight attendant to 
delegitimise him and paint him as a communist. However, 
the video was not released because the agency could not 
put together a convincing enough film. 

The Army removed top civilian and military leaders it 
thought sympathetic to the PKI. The parliament and 
cabinet were purged of Sukarno loyalists. Leading PKI 
members were immediately arrested, some summarily 
executed. Army leaders organised demonstrations in 
Jakarta during which on 8 October, the PKI Jakarta 
headquarters was burned down. Anti-Communist youth 
groups were formed, including the Army-backed 
Indonesian Students' Action Front (KAMI), the Indonesian 
Youth and Students' Action Front (KAPPI), and the 
Indonesian University Alumni Action Front (KASI). In 
Jakarta and West Java, over 10,000 PKI activists and 
leaders were arrested, including famed novelist 
Pramoedya Ananta Toer. 

The initial deaths occurred during organised clashes 
between the Army and the PKI, including some 
Indonesian armed forces units who were sympathetic to 
communism and were resisting General Suharto's 
crackdown. For example, much of the Marine Corps, the 
Air Force, and the Police Mobile Brigade Corps were 
infiltrated up to commander level by the PKI. In early 
October, forces of the Strategic Command (Suharto's 
Kostrad) and the RPKAD para-commandos led by Colonel 
Sarwo Edhie Wibowo were sent to Central Java, a region 
with strong PKI support, while troops of uncertain loyalty 
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were ordered out. At the same time, the Siliwangi Division 
was deployed to guard Jakarta and West Java, both of 
which, unlike Central and East Java, remained relatively 
immune to the mass killings. Early fighting in the Central 
Java highlands and around Madiun suggested the PKI 
might be able to establish a rival regime centred on these 
regions. However, widespread fears of a civil war between 
factions supported by the United States and China, 
respectively, quickly evaporated as the forces sent by 
Suharto took control. Many rebel commanders chose not 
to fight as Suharto-deployed forces arrived, although 
resistance came from some, like General Supardjo, for a 
few more weeks. 

As the Sukarno presidency began to unravel and Suharto 
began to assert control following the coup attempt, the 
PKI's top national leadership was hunted and arrested, 
with some summarily executed. In early October, PKI 
chairman Dipa Nusantara Aidit had flown to Central Java, 
where the coup attempt had been supported by leftist 
officers in Yogyakarta, Salatiga, and Semarang. Fellow 
senior PKI leader Njoto was shot around 6 November, 
Aidit on 22 November, and First Deputy PKI Chairman 
M.H. Lukman was killed shortly after that. 

The killings started in October 1965 in Jakarta, spread to 
Central and East Java and later to Bali, and smaller 
outbreaks occurred in parts of other islands, including 
Sumatra. The communal tensions and hatreds that had 
built up were played upon by the Army leadership, which 
characterised Communists as villains, and many 
Indonesian civilians took part in the killings. The worst 
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massacres were in Aceh, Bali, Central and East Java where 
PKI support was at its strongest. The situation varied 
across the country, and the role of the Army has never 
been fully explained. In some areas, the Army organised, 
encouraged, trained, and supplied civilian groups and 
local militias. In other areas, communal vigilante action 
preceded the Army, although in most cases, killings did 
not commence before military units had sanctioned 
violence by instruction or example. It was in the earlier 
stages of the killings that the Army's direct involvement in 
clashes with the PKI occurred. By the end of October, 
groups of devout Muslims joined the purge of 
Communists, claiming it was their duty to cleanse 
Indonesia of atheism. 

In some areas, civilian militia knew where to find known 
Communists and their sympathisers, while in others, the 
Army demanded lists of Communists from village heads. 
There was no disguise associated with PKI membership, 
and most suspects were easy to identify within 
communities. The U.S. Embassy in Jakarta supplied the 
Indonesian military with lists of up to 5,000 suspected 
Communists. Although some PKI branches organised 
resistance and reprisal killings, most went passively to 
their deaths. Not all victims were PKI members. Often the 
label "PKI" was used to include anyone to the left of the 
Indonesian National Party (PNI). In other cases, victims 
were suspected or simply alleged Communists or were 
victims of grievance settling with little or no political 
motive. Anti-Communist killings were then instigated with 
youths, assisted by the Army. Most of the victims were not 
major political figures and were mostly among the poor 
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and the lower middle-class such as farmers, plantation 
labourers, factory workers, students, teachers, artists and 
civil servants. They were often targeted because they or 
someone they knew, such as a friend or family member, 
had joined the PKI or affiliated organisation.  

With very few exceptions, the killings were not 
spontaneous but carried out with a high degree of 
organisation. Most of the victims were also detainees of 
the Indonesian Army, making the killings summary 
executions.  Initially, many leftists willingly turned 
themselves in to the military and the police, believing they 
would be safe and, therefore, the reasonable thing to do.  
The killings were carried out 'face to face' as in Rwanda or 
Cambodia, unlike the mechanical methods of killing used 
by Nazi Germany.  The methods of non-mechanised 
violence and killing included shooting, dismembering 
alive, stabbing, disembowelment, castration, impaling, 
strangling and beheading with Japanese-style samurai 
swords. Firearms and automatic weapons were used on a 
limited scale, with most of the killings being carried out 
with knives, sickles, machetes, swords, ice picks, bamboo 
spears, iron rods and other makeshift weapons. Islamic 
extremists often paraded severed heads on spikes. Corpses 
were often thrown into rivers, and at one point, officials 
complained to the Army of congested rivers that run into 
the city of Surabaya due to the bodies. In areas such as 
Kediri in East Java, Nahdlatul Ulama youth wing (Ansor 
Youth Movement) members lined up Communists, cut 
their throats and disposed of the bodies in rivers. Rows of 
severed penises were often left behind as a reminder to 
the rest. The killings left whole sections of villages empty, 
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and the houses of victims or the interned were looted and 
often handed over to the military. 

Local Chinese Indonesians were killed in some areas, and 
their properties looted and burned as a result of anti-
Chinese racism, on the excuse that D.N. Aidit had brought 
the PKI closer to China. In the predominantly Christian 
islands of Nusa Tenggara, Christian clergy and teachers 
suffered at the hands of Muslim youth. 

Although there were occasional and isolated flare-ups 
until 1969, the killings mostly subsided by March 1966, 
when either there were no more suspects or authorities 
intervened. Solo residents said that exceptionally high 
flooding in March 1966 of the Solo River, considered 
mystical by the Javanese, signalled the end of the killings 

To Western governments, the killings and purges were 
seen as victory over communism at the height of the Cold 
War. Western governments and much of the West's media 
preferred Suharto and the "New Order" to the PKI and the 
increasingly leftist "Old Order". The British ambassador, 
Andrew Gilchrist, wrote to London: "I never concealed 
from you my belief that a little shooting in Indonesia 
would be an essential preliminary to effective change." 
News of the massacre was carefully controlled by Western 
intelligence agencies. Journalists, prevented from entering 
Indonesia, relied on the official statements from Western 
embassies. The British embassy in Jakarta advised 
intelligence headquarters in Singapore on how the news 
should be presented: "Suitable propaganda themes might 
be: PKI brutality in murdering Generals, ... PKI subverting 
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Indonesia as agents of foreign Communists. ... British 
participation should be carefully concealed." 

A headline in U.S. News & World Report read: "Indonesia: 
Hope... where there was once none". Australian Prime 
Minister Harold Holt commented in The New York Times, 
"With 500,000 to 1 million Communist sympathizers 
knocked off, I think it is safe to assume a reorientation has 
taken place."  The right-wing oilman H. L. Hunt proclaimed 
Indonesia the sole bright spot for the United States in the 
Cold War and called the ouster of Sukarno the "greatest 
victory for freedom since the last decisive battle of World 
War II." Time described the suppression of the PKI as "The 
West's best news for years in Asia," and praised Suharto's 
regime as "scrupulously constitutional." "It was a triumph 
for Western propaganda," Robert Challis, a BBC reporter in 
the area, later reflected. Many Western media reports 
repeated the Indonesian Army's line by downplaying its 
responsibility for and the rational, organised nature of the 
mass killing. They emphasised the role of civilians instead, 
invoking the orientalist stereotype of Indonesians as 
primitive and violent. A New York Times journalist wrote 
an article titled "When a Nation Runs Amok" explaining 
that the killings were hardly surprising since they occurred 
in "violent Asia, where life is cheap." 

U.S government officials were "almost uniformly 
celebratory" of the mass killings.  In recalling their attitudes 
regarding the killings, State Department intelligence 
officer Howard Federspiel said that "no one cared, as long 
as they were Communists, that they were being 
butchered." Within the United States, Robert F. Kennedy 
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was one of the only prominent individuals to condemn the 
massacres. He said in January 1966: "We have spoken out 
against the inhuman slaughters perpetrated by the Nazis 
and the Communists. But will we speak out also against 
the inhuman slaughter in Indonesia, where over 100,000 
alleged Communists have not been perpetrators, but 
victims?" U.S. economic elites were also pleased with the 
outcome in Indonesia. Following Suharto's consolidation 
of power in 1967, many companies, including Goodyear 
Tire and Rubber Company, General Electric, American 
Express, Caterpillar Inc., StarKist, Raytheon Technologies 
and Lockheed Martin, went to explore business 
opportunities in the country.  

USSR's Andrei Sakharov called the killings a 'tragic event' 
and described it as "an extreme case of reaction, racism 
and militarism", but otherwise, the Soviet response was 
relatively muted. It was likely in response to the PKI siding 
with China in the Sino-Soviet split.  Other Communist 
states issued sharp criticism of the killings. The Chinese 
government stated they were "heinous and diabolical 
crimes ... unprecedented in history." China also offered 
refuge to Indonesian leftists fleeing the violence.  One 
Yugoslav diplomat commented that "even assuming the 
guilt of the politburo, which I do not, does this justify 
genocide? Kill the Central Committee, but do not kill 
100,000 people who do not know and had no part in it ." 
The killings perhaps provided a justification for the 
Cultural Revolution in China, as Chinese communist 
leaders were fearful that "hidden bourgeois elements" 
could infiltrate or destroy leftist movements and 
organisations, and it was built around this narrative.  The 
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Suharto government was condemned as a "military fascist 
regime" by the government of North Korea. 

At the time of the killings, the Cold War between Western 
powers, in particular the United States, and the 
communist powers, was at its height. The U.S. government 
and the rest of the Western Bloc had the goal of halting 
the spread of communism and bringing countries into its 
sphere of influence; the eradication of the PKI and 
Suharto's taking power would be a major turning point in 
the Cold War.  The United Kingdom had an additional, 
direct, motive to want Sukarno out of power: he opposed 
the Malayan federation, formed from former states of 
British Malaya neighbouring Indonesia; since 1963 there 
had been conflict and armed incursions by the Indonesian 
army across the border, following communist insurgency 
from 1948 to 1960 in British Malaya and then 
independent Commonwealth member Malaya. 

Geoffrey B. Robinson, professor of history at UCLA, posits 
that, based on documentary evidence, powerful foreign 
states, in particular the United States, Great Britain and 
their allies, were instrumental in facilitating and 
encouraging the Indonesian Army's campaign of mass 
killing, and without such support, the killings would not 
have happened.  He elaborates in his 2018 book The 
Killing Season: 

The United States and other Western states have 
steadfastly denied any responsibility for the terrible 
violence that followed the alleged coup of October 1, 
1965. That violence, they have maintained, was the 
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product of domestic political forces over which outside 
powers had little, if any, influence. That claim is untrue. 
There is now clear evidence that in the crucial six months 
after the alleged coup, Western powers encouraged the 
army to move forcefully against the Left, facilitated 
widespread violence including mass killings, and helped to 
consolidate the political power of the army, In doing so, 
they helped to bring about the political and physical 
destruction of the PKI and its affiliates, the removal of 
Sukarno and his closest associates from political power, 
their replacement by an army elite led by General Suharto, 
and a seismic shift in Indonesia's foreign policy towards 
the West and the capitalist model it advanced.  

While the exact role of the U.S. government during the 
massacres remains obscured by still-sealed government 
archives on Indonesia for this period, it is known that "at a 
minimum," the U.S. government supplied money and 
communications equipment to the Indonesian Army that 
facilitated the mass killings, gave fifty million rupiah to the 
KAP-Gestapu death squad, and provided targeted names 
of thousands of alleged PKI leaders to the Indonesian 
Army. Robert J. Martens, political officer at the U.S. 
Embassy in Jakarta from 1963 to 1966, told journalist 
Kathy Kadane in 1990 that he led a group of State 
Department and CIA officials who drew up the lists of 
roughly 5,000 Communist Party operatives, which he 
provided to an Army intermediary. Kadane asserts that 
approval for the release of names came from top U.S. 
Embassy officials, including U.S. Ambassador to Indonesia 
Marshall Green, deputy chief of mission Jack Lydman and 
political section chief Edward Masters, who all later denied 
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involvement. Martens claimed he acted without approval 
to avoid red tape at a critical time. The State Department 
volume Foreign Relations of the United States, 1964–
1968, which the CIA attempted to suppress in 2001, 
acknowledges that the U.S. Embassy provided lists of 
communist leaders to Indonesians involved in the purges, 
and notes that Marshall Green stated in a 1966 airgram to 
Washington, which was drafted by Martens and approved 
by Masters, that the lists of communists were "apparently 
being used by Indonesian security authorities who seem 
to lack even the simplest overt information on PKI 
leadership." Scholars have also corroborated the claim that 
U.S. Embassy officials provided lists of communists to 
Suharto's forces, who, according to Mark Aarons, "ensured 
that those so named were eliminated in the mass killing 
operations." Geoffrey B. Robinson asserts that U.S. 
government officials, among them Marshall Green, 
"published memoirs and articles that sought to divert 
attention from any possible U.S. role, while questioning 
the integrity and political loyalties of scholars who 
disagreed with them."  

Vincent Bevins writes that this was not the first instance of 
U.S. officials providing lists of suspected communists to 
members of a foreign government to be rounded up and 
killed, as they had done so in Guatemala in 1954 and Iraq 
in 1963.  Besides U.S. officials, managers of U.S.-owned 
corporate plantations also provided the Indonesian Army 
with lists of "troublesome" communists and union leaders 
who were subsequently hunted down and killed.  



  171 
 

Robert Cribb, writing in 2002, claims "there is considerable 
evidence that the U.S. encouraged the killings, by both 
providing funds to anti-communist forces and supplying 
the Indonesian Army with the names of people whom it 
believed were PKI members. There is no evidence, 
however, that U.S. intervention significantly increased the 
scale of the killings." Vincent Bevins says that the 
Indonesian military bears "prime responsibility for the 
massacres and concentration camps," but adds that 
"Washington was the prime mover" of the operation and 
"shares guilt for every death."  Mark Aarons contends that 
Marshall Green is "long seen as one of the principal 
officials involved in encouraging the slaughter." Kai Thaler 
asserts that declassified documents show that "U.S. 
officials were accessories to this mass murder" and "helped 
create the conditions for the killings." Bradley Simpson, 
Director of the Indonesia/East Timor Documentation 
Project at the National Security Archive, contends that 
"Washington did everything in its power to encourage 
and facilitate the Army-led massacre of alleged PKI 
members, and U.S. officials worried only that the killing of 
the party's unarmed supporters might not go far enough, 
permitting Sukarno to return to power and frustrate the 
[Johnson] Administration's emerging plans for a post-
Sukarno Indonesia." He claims that documents show "the 
United States was directly involved to the extent that they 
provided the Indonesian Armed Forces with assistance 
that they introduced to help facilitate the mass killings," 
which included the CIA providing small arms from 
Thailand, and the U.S. government providing monetary 
assistance and limited amounts of communications 
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equipment, medicine and a range of other items, including 
shoes and uniforms, to the Indonesian military. 

Western support for the Indonesian Army solidified as it 
demonstrated its "resolve" through the mass killing 
campaigns.  U.S. President Lyndon B. Johnson's National 
Security Advisor McGeorge Bundy reported to the 
president that the events since 1 October had been "a 
striking vindication of U.S. policy towards Indonesia in 
recent years: a policy of keeping our hand in the game for 
the long-term stakes despite recurrent pressure to pull 
out" and that it was made clear to the Indonesian Army 
via U.S. Embassy's deputy chief of mission, Francis Joseph 
Galbraith, that "Embassy and the USG generally 
sympathetic with and admiring of what Army doing."  The 
primary concerns of U.S. officials by December 1965 were 
that Sukarno had yet to be removed and that plans to 
nationalise U.S. oil companies had yet to be reversed and 
warned the emerging Indonesian leadership that 
Washington would withhold support if threats to U.S. 
investments were not halted.  Professor Ruth Blakeley 
writes "the case of Indonesia reveals the extent to which 
the U.S. state prioritised its elite interests over the human 
rights of hundreds of thousands of Indonesians." 

The United States, along with Great Britain and Australia, 
also played an active role in "black propaganda 
operations" during the killings, which included clandestine 
radio broadcasts being transmitted into the country that 
repeated Indonesian Army propaganda as part of a 
psychological warfare campaign designed to encourage 
support for the killings and to discredit the PKI. British 
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Foreign Office documents declassified in 2021 revealed 
that British propagandists secretly incited anti-communists 
including army generals to eliminate the PKI, and used 
black propaganda, due to Sukarno's hostility to the 
formation of former British colonies into the Malayan 
federation from 1963. Harold Wilson's government had 
instructed propaganda specialists from the Foreign Office 
to send hundreds of inflammatory pamphlets to leading 
anti-communists in Indonesia, inciting them to kill the 
foreign minister, Subandrio, and claiming that ethnic 
Chinese Indonesians deserved the violence meted out to 
them. 

Of all countries, Swedish arms supplies seem to have been 
the most substantial. According to a report by an 
Indonesian refugee in Japan, from early December 1965, 
Indonesia signed "a contract with Sweden for an 
emergency purchase of $10,000,000 worth of small arms 
and ammunition to be used for annihilating elements of 
the PKI." The Swedish Embassy's concerns about the 
slaughter did grow some months later, with Sweden's 
ambassador openly critical of the campaign of violence, 
but apparently after the fact.  

Documentary filmmaker Joshua Oppenheimer, director of 
The Act of Killing (2012) and The Look of Silence (2014), 
called on the U.S. to account for its role in the killings 
during a screening of the former for U.S. Congress 
members. On 10 December 2014, the same day The Look 
of Silence was released in Indonesia, Senator Tom Udall 
(D-NM) introduced a "Sense of the Senate Resolution" 
which condemned the killings and called for the 
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declassification of all documents on U.S. involvement in 
the events, noting that "the U.S. provided financial and 
military assistance during this time and later, according to 
documents released by the State Department." 

Declassified documents released by the U.S. Embassy in 
Jakarta in October 2017 show that the U.S. government 
had detailed knowledge of the massacres from the start 
and specifically refer to mass killings ordered by Suharto. 
The documents also reveal that the U.S. government 
actively encouraged and facilitated the Indonesian Army's 
massacres to further its geopolitical interests in the region 
and that U.S. officials and diplomats at the embassy kept 
detailed records of which PKI leaders were being killed. 
U.S. officials, dismayed at Indonesia's shift towards the left, 
were "ecstatic" over the seizure of power by right-wing 
generals who proceeded to exterminate the PKI, and were 
determined to avoid doing anything that might thwart 
the efforts of the Indonesian Army. The U.S. also withheld 
credible information which contradicted the Indonesian 
Army's version of events regarding the abortive coup by 
junior officers on 30 September 1965, which triggered the 
killings. On 21 December 1965, the Embassy's first 
secretary, Mary Vance Trent, sent a cable to the State 
Department which provided an estimate of 100,000 
people killed, and referred to the events as a "fantastic 
switch which has occurred over 10 short weeks." Bradley 
Simpson said these previously secret cables, telegrams, 
letters, and reports "contain damning details that the U.S. 
was willfully and gleefully pushing for the mass murder of 
innocent people." 
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Discussion of the killings was heavily tabooed in Indonesia 
and, if mentioned at all, usually called peristiwa enam 
lima, the incident of '65. Inside and outside Indonesia, 
public discussion of the killings increased during the 
1990s and especially after 1998 when the New Order 
government collapsed. Jailed and exiled members of the 
Sukarno regime, as well as ordinary people, told their 
stories in increasing numbers. Foreign researchers felt 
more empowered to publish on the topic, with the end of 
intimidation by the military regime. 

The killings are skipped over in most Indonesian histories 
and have received little introspection by Indonesians as 
well as comparatively little international attention. 
Indonesian textbooks typically depict the killings as a 
"patriotic campaign" that resulted in less than 80,000 
deaths. In 2004, the textbooks were briefly changed to 
include the events, but this new curriculum discontinued 
in 2006 following protests from the military and Islamic 
groups. The textbooks which mentioned the mass killings 
were subsequently burnt by order of Indonesia's Attorney 
General. John Roosa's Pretext for Mass Murder (2006) was 
initially banned by the Attorney General's Office. The 
Indonesian parliament set up a truth and reconciliation 
commission to analyse the killings, but it was suspended 
by the Indonesian High Court. An academic conference 
regarding the killings was held in Singapore in 2009. A 
hesitant search for mass graves by survivors and family 
members began after 1998, although little has been 
found. Over three decades later, great enmity remains in 
Indonesian society over the events. 
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The Supardjo Document is a copy of the personal notes of 
General Supardjo regarding the 30 September Movement. 
It is one of the few primary sources of this event and gives 
insight into the movement from a military perspective, 
including Supardjo's opinion on what may have caused 
the movement to fail. 

Satisfactory explanations for the scale and frenzy of the 
violence have challenged scholars from all ideological 
perspectives. One view attributes the communal hatreds 
behind the killings to the forcing of parliamentary 
democracy onto Indonesian society, claiming that such 
changes were culturally unsuitable and unnecessarily 
disruptive in the post-independence 1950s. A contrasting 
view is that when Sukarno and the military replaced the 
democratic process with authoritarianism, competing 
interests—i.e., the Army, political Islam, and Communism—
could not be openly debated. They were suppressed 
instead and could only be expressed through violence. 
Conflict resolution methods have broken down, and 
Muslim groups and the military adopted an "us or them 
attitude" and that when the killings were over, many 
Indonesians dismissed as something the Communists had 
deserved. The possibility of returning to similar upheavals 
is cited as a factor in the "New Order" administration's 
political conservatism and tight control of the political 
system. Vigilance against an alleged Communist threat 
remained a hallmark of Suharto's three-decade presidency. 

Although mostly unknown in the West compared to the 
Vietnam War and various right-wing coups in Latin 
America, the massacres and Suharto's rise to power are 
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considered by historians to be a significant turning point 
in the Cold War. The massacres were also crucial to the 
expansion of capitalism in Indonesia, with Suharto rapidly 
implementing the economic policies of the "Berkeley 
Mafia", whose training had been funded by the Ford 
Foundation, to liberalise the economy. Given U.S. foreign 
policy goals of stopping the spread of communism and 
bringing nations into its sphere of influence, the bloody 
purge which decimated the PKI, the third-largest 
Communist Party in the world at the time, was considered 
a huge victory. After viewing declassified documents 
released in 2017, historian John Roosa notes that much 
"of the U.S. foreign policy establishment viewed it as a 
great victory that they were able to sort of 'flip' Indonesia 
very quickly." He also asserts that the U.S. did not simply 
"stand by" and allow the killings to happen, stating "it's 
easy for American commentators to fall into that 
approach, but the U.S. was part and parcel of the 
operation, strategising with the Indonesian Army and 
encouraging them to go after the PKI." 

In surveying the most recent histories of the events, along 
with declassified documents and witness statements, 
Vincent Bevins posits that the mass killings in mid-1960s 
Indonesia were not necessarily an isolated incident and 
serves as the apex of "a loose network of U.S.-backed anti-
communist extermination programs" which emerged 
around the world from 1945 to 1990 (such as Operation 
Condor), and "carried out mass murder in at least 22 
countries." He argues that, unlike the violence unleashed 
by communist leaders such as Joseph Stalin and Pol Pot, 
the violence of the anti-communist crusade of the United 
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States has deeply shaped the world we live in today, a 
"worldwide capitalist order with the United States as its 
leading military power and center of cultural production." 
He argues that contrary to the popular notion that much 
of the developing world peacefully and willingly adopted 
the capitalist system advocated by the United States and 
its allies, it's possible that without this violence, "many of 
these countries would not be capitalist at all."  

Geoffrey B. Robinson asserts that while there is no 
consensus on the matter, some scholars have described 
the mass killings as genocide.  Jess Melvin claims the 
1965–1966 massacre constitutes genocide under the legal 
definition as particular religious and ethnic groups were 
targeted collectively for their relations to the PKI. She cites 
Matthew Lippman and David Nersessian stating atheists 
are covered under the genocide convention and argues 
the Indonesian military prescribed the elimination of 
"atheists" and "unbelievers" collectively for their 
association with communism and the PKI, and thus these 
killings would constitute genocide. Melvin also emphasises 
the extermination of the PKI as an act of genocide by 
pointing out that the PKI themselves identified with a 
particular religious denomination known as "Red Islam" 
that mixed Islam with communism. She further argues the 
killings constitute genocide because the PKI constitute an 
ideologically based "national group." 

In November 2015, the International People's Tribunal on 
1965 Crimes Against Humanity in Indonesia, presided 
over by seven international judges, was held in The 
Hague, Netherlands. It was formally established in 2014 
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by human rights activists, academics, and Indonesian 
exiles in response to an "absence of an official domestic 
process of transitional justice based on truth finding." In 
July 2016, chief judge Zak Yacoob publicly read the 
tribunal's findings, which called the state of Indonesia 
directly responsible for the events and guilty of crimes 
against humanity, blamed Suharto for spreading false 
propaganda and laying the grounds for the massacres, 
and concluded that the massacres "intended to annihilate 
a section of the population and could be categorised as 
genocide"; the report also highlighted other allegations 
which the panel found to be well-founded, including 
enslavement in labour camps, ruthless torture, systematic 
sexual violence, and forced disappearance. Indonesia 
rejected the tribunal's ruling; Security Minister Luhut 
Pandjaitan said the killings were "none of their business, 
they are not our superiors and Indonesia has its own 
system." The court has no legal authority to issue binding 
decisions or rulings. 

Judge Yacoob stated that "the United States of America, 
the United Kingdom and Australia were all complicit to 
differing degrees in the commission of these crimes 
against humanity." The judges concluded that the U.S. 
supported the Indonesian military "knowing well that they 
were embarked upon a programme of mass killings", 
which included providing lists of alleged communist party 
officials to the Indonesian security forces with a "strong 
presumption that these would facilitate the arrest and/or 
the execution of those that were named", whereas the UK 
and Australia repeated false propaganda from the 
Indonesian Army, even after it became "abundantly clear 
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that killings and other crimes against humanity were 
taking place." Australia's foreign affairs ministry rejected 
the tribunal's conclusion, which it described as a "human 
rights NGO", and denies the country was in any way 
complicit in the killings. The U.S. and the U.K. have not 
responded to the tribunal's findings. Indonesian human-
rights lawyer Nursyahbani Katjasungkana(Indonesian) 
called on all three countries to admit their complicity, 
stating that it had been proved from their various 
diplomatic communications and could no longer be 
denied. 

The 350-year long history of how the Dutch divided 
Indonesia was used to carry out mass killings of PKI 
followers.  

In Indonesia, the Islamic factor was not a determining 
element of unity against the Dutch colonialists, the proofs 
are that almost all Islamic kingdoms in the archipelago 
could be dissolved by the Dutch by fighting between 
princes and kings who wanted to continue in power. For 
example, how the Dutch destroyed the Islamic kingdoms 
in West Sumatra, South Sulawesi, Ternate-Tidore, Java and 
so on.  

The fall of Sukarno's power in 1965 and Suharto's 1998, 
by engineering student demonstrations as camouflage, 
are strong evidences that the forces of military oligarchs 
and business conglomerates are actually the masterminds 
who play political orchestras.  



  181 
 

Judging from the historical side of the war of 
independence, Indonesia was given the opportunity for 
independence by Japan in 1944-45 with the formation of 
paramilitaries such as Heiho, and finally Indonesia 
liberated itself in the proclamation of 17 August 1945.  

If only the student demonstration factor, while the 
political elite, intellectuals , the nation's thinkers are only 
cowardly silent and do not dare to take the initiative to 
conduct demonstrations for a better future constitution.  

This all proves that indeed Indonesia is still easily divided 
by the forms of colonialism, and is still being divided by 
the colonialism of the nation itself.  

This is a harsh reality, when conglomerate entrepreneurs 
save Rp 14,000 trillion of money abroad while Indonesia's 
foreign debt burden is Rp 7,000 trillion, this means that 
275 million Indonesian people's fate is in the hands of a 
handful of entrepreneurial oligarchs.  

A form of colonialism, an invisible form of slavery, may be 
said to be like the colonial form of the rulers and 
businessmen of the Dutch VOC era. 

This means that the satanic democracy carried out by the 
USA against Indonesia succeeded in infiltrating a new 
form of colonialism, a new form of slavery, through the 
politics of division, omission of mass killings in 1965-1966, 
the rupiah fell into slavery against the US dollar currency 
due to the burden of foreign debt.  
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IV. China Socialist 
Capitalist Market 
Economy 
4.1. Socialist Philosophy 

After Columbus circled the Earth, humans kept asking if 
there was another earth from 1500 AD to 2000 AD
turned out to be an absurd answer. The age of civilization 
is only 6000 years, why should we need 100,000 years to 
get to the nearest star system Alpha Centauri.
civilization only has one choice, like it or not, humans must 
be able to become civilized socialists. It was dest
God Almighty, end goals  of religious socialism are on top 
of pyramid of civilization. 
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Socialists argue that the accumulation of capital generates 
waste through externalities that require costly corrective 
regulatory measures. They also point out that this process 
generates wasteful industries and practices that exist only 
to generate sufficient demand for products such as high-
pressure advertisement to be sold at a profit, thereby 
creating rather than satisfying economic demand. 

Socialists argue that capitalism consists of irrational 
activity, such as the purchasing of commodities only to sell 
at a later time when their price appreciates, rather than 
for consumption, even if the commodity cannot be sold at 
a profit to individuals in need and therefore a crucial 
criticism often made by socialists is that "making money", 
or accumulation of capital, does not correspond to the 
satisfaction of demand (the production of use-values). The 
fundamental criterion for economic activity in capitalism is 
the accumulation of capital for reinvestment in 
production, but this spurs the development of new, non-
productive industries that do not produce use-value and 
only exist to keep the accumulation process afloat 
(otherwise the system goes into crisis), such as the spread 
of the financial industry, contributing to the formation of 
economic bubbles. 

Socialists view private property relations as limiting the 
potential of productive forces in the economy. According 
to socialists, private property becomes obsolete when it 
concentrates into centralised, socialised institutions based 
on private appropriation of revenue—but based on 
cooperative work and internal planning in allocation of 
inputs—until the role of the capitalist becomes redundant. 
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With no need for capital accumulation and a class of 
owners, private property in the means of production is 
perceived as being an outdated form of economic 
organisation that should be replaced by a free association 
of individuals based on public or common ownership of 
these socialised assets. Private ownership imposes 
constraints on planning, leading to uncoordinated 
economic decisions that result in business fluctuations, 
unemployment and a tremendous waste of material 
resources during crisis of overproduction. 

Excessive disparities in income distribution lead to social 
instability and require costly corrective measures in the 
form of redistributive taxation, which incurs heavy 
administrative costs while weakening the incentive to 
work, inviting dishonesty and increasing the likelihood of 
tax evasion while (the corrective measures) reduce the 
overall efficiency of the market economy. These corrective 
policies limit the incentive system of the market by 
providing things such as minimum wages, unemployment 
insurance, taxing profits and reducing the reserve army of 
labour, resulting in reduced incentives for capitalists to 
invest in more production. In essence, social welfare 
policies cripple capitalism and its incentive system and are 
thus unsustainable in the long-run. Marxists argue that 
the establishment of a socialist mode of production is the 
only way to overcome these deficiencies. Socialists and 
specifically Marxian socialists argue that the inherent 
conflict of interests between the working class and capital 
prevent optimal use of available human resources and 
leads to contradictory interest groups (labour and 
business) striving to influence the state to intervene in the 
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economy in their favour at the expense of overall 
economic efficiency. 

Early socialists (utopian socialists and Ricardian socialists) 
criticised capitalism for concentrating power and wealth 
within a small segment of society. In addition, they 
complained that capitalism does not use available 
technology and resources to their maximum potential in 
the interests of the public. 

The theoretical system of socialism with Chinese 
characteristics is a set of political theories and policies of 
the Chinese Communist Party (CCP) that are seen by their 
proponents as representing Marxism–Leninism adapted to 
Chinese circumstances and specific time periods, 
consisting of Deng Xiaoping Theory, Three Represents 
(Jiang Zemin), Scientific Outlook on Development (Hu 
Jintao), and Xi Jinping Thought on Socialism with Chinese 
Characteristics for a New Era of beyond 2000 AD. 

In this view, Xi Jinping Thought is considered to represent 
Marxist–Leninist policies suited for China's present 
condition while Deng Xiaoping Theory was considered 
relevant for the period when it was formulated. 

The term entered common usage during the era of Deng 
Xiaoping and was largely associated with Deng's overall 
program of adopting elements of market economics as a 
means to foster growth using foreign investment and to 
increase productivity (especially in the countryside where 
80% of China's population lived) while the CCP retained 
both its formal commitment to achieve communism and its 
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monopoly on political power. In the party's official 
narrative, socialism with Chinese characteristics is 
Marxism–Leninism adapted to Chinese conditions and a 
product of scientific socialism. The theory stipulated that 
China was in the primary stage of socialism due to its 
relatively low level of material wealth and needed to 
engage in economic growth before it pursued a more 
egalitarian form of socialism, which in turn would lead to 
a communist society described in Marxist orthodoxy. 

4.2. China Market  Capitalism Socialism 

Deng Xiaoping, the architect of the Chinese economic 
reforms, did not believe that the market economy was 
synonymous with capitalism or that planning was 
synonymous with socialism. During his southern tour, he 
said that "planning and market forces are not the essential 
difference between socialism and capitalism. A planned 
economy is not the definition of socialism, because there is 
planning under capitalism; the market economy happens 
under socialism, too. Planning and market forces are both 
ways of controlling economic activity". 

In the 1980s, it became evident to Chinese economists 
that the Marxist theory of the law of value—understood as 
the expression of the labor theory of value—could not 
serve as the basis of China's pricing system. They 
concluded that Marx never intended his theory of law of 
value to work "as an expression of 'concretized labor 
time'". Marx's notion of "prices of production" was 
meaningless to the Soviet-styled planned economies since 
price formations were according to Marx established by 
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markets. Soviet planners had used the law of value as a 
basis to rationalize prices in the planned economy. 
According to Soviet sources, prices were "planned with an 
eye to the basic requirements of the law of value". 
However, the primary fault with the Soviet interpretation 
was that they tried to calibrate prices without a 
competitive market since according to Marx competitive 
markets allowed for an equilibrium of profit rates which 
led to an increase in the prices of production. The 
rejection of the Soviet interpretation of the law of value 
led to the acceptance of the idea that China was still in the 
primary stage of socialism. The basic argument was that 
conditions envisaged by Marx for reaching the socialist 
stage of development did not yet exist in China. 

Mao said that the imposition of "progressive relations of 
production" would revolutionize production. His 
successor's rejection of this view according to A. James 
Gregor has thwarted the ideological continuity of 
Maoism—officially Mao Zedong Thought. Classical 
Marxism had argued that a socialist revolution would only 
take place in advanced capitalist societies and its success 
would signal the transition from a capitalist commodity-
based economy to a "product economy" in which goods 
would be distributed for people's need and not for profit. 
If because of a lack of a coherent explanation in the 
chance of failure this revolution did not occur, the 
revolutionaries would be forced to take over the 
responsibilities of the bourgeoisie. Chinese communists 
are thus looking for a new Marxist theory of development. 
Party theorist Luo Rongqu recognized that the founders of 
Marxism had never "formulated any systematic theory on 
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the development of the non-Western world" and said that 
the CCP should "establish their own synthesized 
theoretical framework to study the problem of modern 
development". According to A. James Gregor, the 
implication of this stance is that "Chinese Marxism is 
currently in a state of profound theoretical discontinuity". 

The Chinese government's understanding of private 
ownership is claimed to be rooted in classical Marxism. 
According to party theorists, since China adopted state 
ownership when it was a semi-feudal and semi-colonial 
country, it is claimed to be in the primary stage of 
socialism. Because of this, certain policies and system 
characteristics—such as commodity production for the 
market, the existence of a private sector and the reliance 
of the profit motive in enterprise management—were 
changed. These changes were allowed as long as they 
improved productivity and modernized the means of 
production, thus furthering the development of socialism. 

The CCP still considers private ownership to be non-
socialist. However, according to party theorists, the 
existence and growth of private ownership does not 
necessarily undermine socialism or promote capitalism in 
China. They argue that Karl Marx and Friedrich Engels 
never proposed the immediate abolishment of private 
ownership. According to Engels' book Principles of 
Communism, the proletariat can only abolish private 
ownership when the necessary conditions have been met. 
In the phase before the abolishment of private ownership, 
Engels proposed progressive taxation, high inheritance 
taxes and compulsory bond purchases to restrict private 
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property, while using the competitive powers of state-
owned enterprises to expand the public sector. Marx and 
Engels proposed similar measures in The Communist 
Manifesto with regard to advanced countries, but since 
China was economically undeveloped, party theorists 
called for flexibility regarding the party's handling of 
private property. According to party theorist Liu Shuiyuan, 
the New Economic Policy program initiated by Soviet 
authorities in the aftermath of the war communism 
program is a good example of flexibility by socialist 
authorities. 

Party theorist Li Xuai said that private ownership 
inevitably involved capitalist exploitation. However, Li 
regards private property and exploitation as necessary in 
the primary stage of socialism, claiming that capitalism in 
its primary stage uses remnants of the old society to build 
itself. Sun Liancheng and Lin Huiyong said that Marx and 
Engels—in their interpretation of The Communist 
Manifesto—criticized private ownership when it was 
owned solely by the bourgeoisie, but not individual 
ownership in which everyone owns the means of 
production, hence this cannot be exploited by others. 

Individual ownership is considered consistent with 
socialism, since Marx wrote that a post-capitalist society 
would entail the rebuilding of "associated social individual 
ownershipSocialists have taken different perspectives on 
the state and the role it should play in revolutionary 
struggles, in constructing socialism and within an 
established socialist economy.  
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In the 19th century, the philosophy of state socialism was 
first explicitly expounded by the German political 
philosopher Ferdinand Lassalle. In contrast to Karl Marx's 
perspective of the state, Lassalle rejected the concept of 
the state as a class-based power structure whose main 
function was to preserve existing class structures. Lassalle 
also rejected the Marxist view that the state was destined 
to "wither away". Lassalle considered the state to be an 
entity independent of class allegiances and an instrument 
of justice that would therefore be essential for achieving 
socialism. 

Preceding the Bolshevik-led revolution in Russia, many 
socialists including reformists, orthodox Marxist currents 
such as council communism, anarchists and libertarian 
socialists criticised the idea of using the state to conduct 
central planning and own the means of production as a 
way to establish socialism. Following the victory of 
Leninism in Russia, the idea of "state socialism" spread 
rapidly throughout the socialist movement and eventually 
state socialism came to be identified with the Soviet 
economic model. 

Joseph Schumpeter rejected the association of socialism 
and social ownership with state ownership over the 
means of production because the state as it exists in its 
current form is a product of capitalist society and cannot 
be transplanted to a different institutional framework. 
Schumpeter argued that there would be different 
institutions within socialism than those that exist within 
modern capitalism, just as feudalism had its own distinct 
and unique institutional forms. The state, along with 
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concepts like property and taxation, were concepts 
exclusive to commercial society (capitalism) and 
attempting to place them within the context of a future 
socialist society would amount to a distortion of these 
concepts by using them out of context. 
 
Karl Marx and Friedrich Engels argued that socialism 
would emerge from historical necessity as capitalism 
rendered itself obsolete and unsustainable from 
increasing internal contradictions emerging from the 
development of the productive forces and technology. It 
was these advances in the productive forces combined 
with the old social relations of production of capitalism 
that would generate contradictions, leading to working-
class consciousness. 

Marx and Engels held the view that the consciousness of 
those who earn a wage or salary (the working class in the 
broadest Marxist sense) would be moulded by their 
conditions of wage slavery, leading to a tendency to seek 
their freedom or emancipation by overthrowing 
ownership of the means of production by capitalists and 
consequently, overthrowing the state that upheld this 
economic order. For Marx and Engels, conditions 
determine consciousness and ending the role of the 
capitalist class leads eventually to a classless society in 
which the state would wither away. The Marxist 
conception of socialism is that of a specific historical phase 
that would displace capitalism and precede communism. 
The major characteristics of socialism (particularly as 
conceived by Marx and Engels after the Paris Commune of 
1871) are that the proletariat would control the means of 
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production through a workers' state erected by the 
workers in their interests. Economic activity would still be 
organised through the use of incentive systems and social 
classes would still exist, but to a lesser and diminishing 
extent than under capitalism. 

For orthodox Marxists, socialism is the lower stage of 
communism based on the principle of "from each 
according to his ability, to each according to his 
contribution" while upper stage communism is based on 
the principle of "from each according to his ability, to each 
according to his need", the upper stage becoming possible 
only after the socialist stage further develops economic 
efficiency and the automation of production has led to a 
superabundance of goods and services. Marx argued that 
the material productive forces (in industry and commerce) 
brought into existence by capitalism predicated a 
cooperative society since production had become a mass 
social, collective activity of the working class to create 
commodities but with private ownership (the relations of 
production or property relations). This conflict between 
collective effort in large factories and private ownership 
would bring about a conscious desire in the working class 
to establish collective ownership commensurate with the 
collective efforts their daily experience. 

4.3. China Socialism  Capitalism Transformation 

Many commentators and scholars have described China's 
economic system as a form of state capitalism, particularly 
after the industrial reforms of the 1980s and 1990s, noting 
that while the Chinese economy maintains a large state 
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sector, the state-owned enterprises operate like private-
sector firms and retain all profits without remitting them 
to the government to benefit the entire population. This 
model brings into question the rationale for widespread 
public ownership as well as the applicability of the 
descriptor "socialist", and has led to concern and debate 
regarding the distribution of state profits. 

However, starting in 2017 as part of its state-owned 
enterprise reform program, the central government began 
to encourage state-owned enterprises to start paying 
dividends to the government. Other reforms have 
transferred state-owned assets to social-security funds to 
help finance pensions, and the Shenzhen municipal 
government has proposed using their state-owned 
enterprises to finance a social dividend-type of system for 
its residents. 

Chinese economist Cui Zhiyuan argues that James 
Meade's model of liberal socialism is similar to China's 
socialist market economy and can be used to make sense 
of the model. Meade's model of market socialism involved 
public ownership of firms with independent management 
- with the state acting as a residual claimant to the profits 
generated by its enterprises, but without exercising 
control rights over the management and operations of its 
firms. This model has the advantage that the state would 
have a source of income independent of taxation and 
debt, enabling a reduction of the tax burden on individual 
incomes and the private sector while promoting greater 
equality. Cui points to the Chongqing experience with 
municipal state-owned enterprises enabling high social 
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expenditure alongside low taxes and extremely high rates 
of growth as validation of the socialist market economy 
model. The Chongqing model used state enterprise profits 
to fund public services (including housing), providing the 
main source of public finance and enabling Chongqing to 
lower its corporate tax rate (15% compared to the 33% 
national corporate tax rate) to attract foreign investment. 

Julan Du and Chenggang Xu analyzed the Chinese model 
in a 2005 paper to assess whether it represents a type of 
market socialism or capitalism. They concluded that 
China's contemporary economic system represents a form 
of capitalism rather than market socialism because: 

financial markets exist which permit private share 
ownership—a feature absent in the economic literature on 
market socialism; and state profits are retained by 
enterprises rather than being distributed among the 
population in a social dividend or similar scheme, which 
are central features in most models of market socialism 

Du and Xu concluded that China is not a market socialist 
economy, but an unstable form of capitalism.  

Another analysis carried out by the Global Studies 
Association at the DePaul University in 2006 reports that 
the Chinese economic system does not constitute a form 
of socialism when socialism is defined as a planned 
economy where production for use has replaced 
production for profit as the driving force behind economic 
activity, or when socialism is defined as a system where 
the working class is the dominant class which controls the 
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surplus value produced by the economy. The Chinese 
economy also does not constitute socialism in the sense of 
widespread self-management or workplace democracy. 
The study concluded that as of 2006 capitalism is not the 
dominant mode of organization either and China instead 
has a partially pre-capitalist agrarian system with almost 
50% of its population engaged in agricultural work. 

In 2015 Curtis J. Milhaupt and Wentong Zheng classified 
China's economic system as state capitalism because the 
state directs and guides all major aspects of the Chinese 
economy—including both the state and private sectors—
while not collecting dividends from the ownership of its 
enterprises. They noted that Chinese state-owned 
enterprises and privately owned enterprises shared many 
similarities with respect to state subsidies, proximity to 
state power and execution of government policy 
objectives. Within the state sector, the emphasis was more 
on government control than on the ownership of assets. 

Proponents of the socialist market economy compare it to 
the New Economic Policy in 1920s Soviet Russia that 
introduced market-oriented reforms while maintaining 
state-ownership of the commanding heights of the 
economy. The reforms are justified through the belief that 
changing conditions necessitate new strategies for 
socialist development. 

According to Li Rongrong, in 2003 the chairman of the 
State-Owned Assets Supervision and Administration 
Commission of the State Council, China's socialist 
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economic system is underpinned by the foundational role 
of public enterprise: 

Public ownership, as the foundation of the socialist 
economic system, is a basic force of the state to guide and 
promote economic and social development and a major 
guarantee for realising the fundamental interests and the 
common prosperity of the majority of the people… The 
state owned economy has taken a dominant place in 
major trades that have a close bearing on the country's 
economic lifeline and key areas, and has propped-up, 
guided and brought along the development of the entire 
socio-economy. The influence and control capacity of 
SOEs have further increased. State owned economy has 
played an irreplaceable role in China's socialist 
modernisation drive. 

Other Marxist analyses point out that because the Chinese 
economic system is based on commodity production, has a 
role for private capital and disempowers the working 
class, it represents a capitalist economy. Classical Marxists 
believe a socialist commodity economy (or a socialist 
market economy) is contradictory. Other socialists believe 
the Chinese have embraced many elements of market 
capitalism, specifically commodity production and 
privatisation, resulting in a full-blown capitalist economic 
system. In the past, although many enterprises were 
nominally publicly owned, the profits were retained by the 
enterprises and used to pay managers excessively high 
salaries rather than being distributed amongst the 
population. This old status quo is no longer the case, as 
part of Xi Jinping's anti-corruption campaign, SOE 
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executives have faced 50% pay cuts, the "commanding 
role" of the CCP over SOEs has been cemented in law and 
Staff and Worker Representative Congresses (SWRCs), a 
form of workplace democracy have been restored to the 
status that they held in the 1980s, SOEs have been legally 
required to have them and 80% of registered companies in 
China have them, including some private sector 
companies. 
In a 2021 academic study, Canadian political scientist 
Maxence Poulin stated: The modern Chinese mode of 
production, since 1990s, follows a logic similar to the 
Soviet one during the NEP era. In the light of the NEP 
experience, our research shows that the Chinese 
development strategy shouldn't be understood as 
trending towards a neoliberal model. It is rather an 
original evolution of Marxism, in line with the tradition of 
Marxism-Leninism, adapted to the cohabitation with a 
globalized capitalist system. 

Public ownership in the socialist market economy consists 
of state-owned assets, collectively owned enterprises and 
the publicly owned shares of mixed enterprises. These 
various forms of public ownership play a dominant role in 
the socialist market economy alongside substantial private 
and foreign enterprises. 

There are a few major forms of state-owned enterprises in 
China today: State-owned enterprises: commercial 
enterprises established by either the central government 
or a local government, where managers are appointed by 
the government or public bodies. This category only 
includes wholly state-funded and managed firms. Most 
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state-owned enterprises are not entities of the central 
government. Central government state-owned enterprises 
are subunits of the State-owned Assets Supervision and 
Administration Commission (SASAC). 

State-holding enterprises: state-holding, or state-
controlled enterprises, are publicly listed firms where the 
state owns a large share or a controlling share within the 
firms, thereby exerting influence on the management of 
the firm. These include firms that receive foreign direct 
investment. 

The socialist market economy consists of a wide range of 
state-owned enterprises (SOE) that represent one form of 
public ownership. Beginning with the 1978 reforms, in the 
1980s during the industrial reforms state enterprises were 
gradually corporatised and transformed into joint-stock 
corporations with the state retaining either full or majority 
ownership of their shares. By the early 2000s, most major 
SOEs in non-strategic sectors were listed on the Shanghai 
and Hong Kong stock exchanges and some SOEs adopted 
mixed ownership structures where the central 
government and various other state entities—including 
state banks, other SOEs, provincial and local 
governments—own varying degrees of the firm's listed 
shares alongside foreign and private shareholders. The 
result has been a highly diffuse form of public ownership 
where state-owned enterprises are owned by various 
different government entities, agencies and other state-
owned enterprises. This makes gauging the true size and 
scope of the state sector difficult, particularly when SOEs 
with mixed ownership structures are taken into account. 
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In 2013, the public sector accounted for 30% of the 
number of firms in China, but 55% of assets, 45% of 
revenue and 40% of profits. 

In 1996, China implemented a comprehensive series of 
industrial reforms termed "Grasping the large, letting go of 
the small". These reforms involved closing unprofitable 
state enterprises, merging smaller enterprises and 
privatization of other small-to-medium enterprises. 
Centrally owned SOEs were reformed into joint-stock 
companies with the aim of delegating more authority to 
SOE managers. SOEs at all levels shifted their primary 
focus to profitability and shed their social welfare function 
of providing social services and benefits to their workers in 
what was known as the "Iron Rice Bowl" system. The State-
owned Assets Supervision and Administration Commission 
(SASAC) was formed in 2003 to oversee the management 
of the large centrally owned state enterprises. 

Modern SOEs are operationally very different from those 
in the 1990s. SOEs are much larger in size and fewer in 
number, with central government-owned SOEs clustered 
in "strategic sectors" including banking, finance, mining, 
energy, transportation, telecommunications and public 
utilities. By comparison, provincial and municipal level 
SOEs number in the thousands and are involved in almost 
every industry including information technology and 
automobiles design and production. State sector reform is 
an ongoing process in China. As of 2017, the CCP has 
rejected the Singapore model of Tamasek-style state 
investment companies for China's SOEs, where SOEs 
operate solely to maximize profits on a commercial basis. 
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In particular, China maintains that centrally owned SOEs 
also pursue national and industrial policy objectives. As a 
result of recent reforms to increase profitability and 
unload debt, the government reported the profits of 
central government-owned SOEs rose by 15.2% in 2017. 

Despite becoming increasingly profitable, SOEs in China 
have not paid dividends to the state, causing some 
analysts question the rationale for public ownership in the 
first place. As part of SASAC's ongoing reforms, SOEs will 
now be encouraged and required to pay a higher portion 
of their profits as dividends to the state, with some state-
owned assets being transferred to social security funds to 
help finance pensions for China's aging population. This is 
part of a broader reform effort of restructuring the state 
sector to become a source of finance for public services. As 
part of the SOE reform goals outlined in 2015 by SASAC, 
SOEs are to be classified as either commercial or public 
service entities, with the former being required to 
distribute a higher proportion of their profits as dividends. 
Dividend payments are set to rise from 5–15% to 30% by 
2020. 

Privately owned enterprises (POEs) are recognized as one 
of the components of the socialist market economy 
alongside state, collective and individually owned 
enterprises. The private sector has played an increasingly 
large role since the adoption of the 1994 Company Law. 
Additionally, the boundary between public and private 
enterprises have blurred in China as many publicly listed 
firms are under mixed ownership by various state and 
non-state entities. Additionally, private sector firms that 
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operate in industries targeted for growth often receive 
favorable loans and preferential government treatment 
while SOEs in non-strategic sectors might be exempt from 
subsidies. As an example, ZTE Corporation is a majority 
state-owned enterprise that was forced to rely on equity 
markets whereas its employee-owned private sector 
competitor Huawei is viewed as a "national champion" 
and therefore received major state funding from state 
banks. Like their state-owned counterparts POEs are 
expected to follow state policies and are subject to party 
control, suggesting that the distinction between public 
and private ownership is not a meaningful distinction to 
make for understanding China's economic model. As of 
2015, state control and state-directed development (in 
both public and private sectors) is the overriding feature 
of the Chinese economic system that plays a more 
substantial role than the public ownership of assets. 

While the private sector has been accorded a role in the 
socialist market economy and has greatly increased in size 
and scope since the 1990s, the private sector does not 
dominate the Chinese economy. The exact size of the 
private sector is difficult to determine in part because 
private enterprises may have a minority of their stock 
owned by state entities and because of different 
classification standards used for classifying enterprises. 
For example, in the first quarter of 2016 the National 
Bureau of Statistics of China reported fixed investment by 
private firms at 35%, and by wholly state-owned SOEs at 
27%, with the bulk of the remainder belonging to non-
wholly state funded limited liability corporations. 
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V. 2022-2032 THE END 
OF USA HEGEMONY ON 
ASIA         
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Currently, the nations of the USA and Europe glorify that 
they are the innovators of new technologies, and this is 
the result of the process of democratic freedom of opinion 
and choice that they carry out. But at the beginning of its 
civilizational path, Europe had chosen the jihadist path 
through religious wars in 700-1100 AD. When now 2000 
AD China takes over the leadership of world technology 
trade, then Western thinkers should realize that all this is 
just a game of civilization created by God Almighty. Maybe 
before there was a nuclear bomb, the theory of war 
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engineering could be implemented to maintain 
hegemony. The conclusion is simple, so high intelligence, 
high-tech products of Western civilization, it's just a game 
of civilization. Real fact, Earth is only one. Perhaps 
imagining exploration around the Earth, this can also be 
done interstellar exploration between galaxies. It turns out 
that everything is absurd nonsense with pride in the 
results of human technology. What has been achieved is 
that nuclear technology allows humans to destroy each 
other, humans actually create hellfire, this is absolutely 
absurd. 

5.1. Next Battle of Malacca Street 
The satanic democracy war led by the USA and its allies 
by justifying all means of global financial sanctions and 
embargoes, this will definitely make the world more 
dangerous towards nuclear war. In the near future, the 
siege and seizure of the Malacca strait will occur, because 
the Malacca strait is the key to the world's oil and gas 
energy transportation routes. 
Sooner or later, the Straits of Malacca, which was ruled by 
Western colonialism for 400 years 1600-2000 AD, will 
definitely be reclaimed by the East combined forces of 
China and Indonesia. In 2022 Indonesia has a current 
population of 270 million people, formerly for 1500 years 
was the ruler of the Straits of Malacca or Temasek 
through the Buddhist kingdom of Sriwijaya and the 
Hindu kingdom of Majapahit which was closely related to 
past Chinese empires. To defeat the Satanic Democracy 
style colonialism led by the USA and its allies around the 
world, the world must unite. As a result of the Russian-
Ukrainian war, the action of a devil with the embargo 
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and sanctions carried out by the USA, this must be 
stopped because it is against a universal sense of 
humanity.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
The embargo and sanctions of this devil will continue to 
try to make a nation of hunger, poverty, but human 
always has the miracle given by the Almighty God, to find 
a way out. What is clear, the Earth will continue to be 
one remaining in this universe, there is no other Earth in 
the time space leading to end-journey. 
 
Seeing 2022 political upheaval in Indonesia still continues 
where the condition of the Indonesian currency has been 
controlled by the US Dollar, where the gap between rich 
is so wide. Examples of wealth of Indonesian 
conglomerates who hold their money amounting to Rp. 
14,000 trillion abroad, while foreign debt Rp. 5500 
trillion is a real proof of potential instability in the near 
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future. These are all the results of the demon democratic 
campaign carried by the USA and its allies. 
 
5.2. Next  China vs Taiwan Potential War  

Argument for Taiwan being 
legally part of China
Cairo Conference of 1943, 
the allied powers agreed to 
have Japan restore "all the 
territories Japan has stolen 
from the Chinese", 
specifically listing 
and Penghu, to the Republic 
of China after the defeat of 
Japan. According to both 
the People's Republic of 
China and the Republic of 

China, this agreement was given legal force by the 
Instrument of Surrender of Japan in 1945. The PRC's UN 
Ambassador, Wang Yingfan, has stated multiple times in 
the UN general committee: "Taiwan is an inseparable part 
of China's territory since antiquity" and "both the 1943 
Cairo Declaration and the 1945 Potsdam Declaration 
have reaffirmed in unequivocal terms China's sovereignty 
over Taiwan as a matter of international law." The PRC 
rejects arguments involving the lack of a specific treaty 
(San Francisco Peace Treaty) transferring Taiwan's 
sovereignty to China by noting that neither PRC nor ROC 
was a signatory to any such treaty, making the treaties 
irrelevant with regard to Chinese claims. Also, according 
to the Treaty of Shimonoseki, China legally surrendered 
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its sovereignty and jurisdiction over Taiwan (Formosa) 
forever. So, this treaty therefore renders Japan's 
declaration of the returning of sovereignty over Taiwan 
to China as well as the PRC's UN Ambassador, Wang 
Yingfan's claims regarding China's right to sovereignty 
over Taiwan, as legally extraneous and unsubstantiated. 
The US and UK governments also hold that the Cairo 
Declaration made in 1943 is just a war-time statement of 
intention and cannot itself transfer the sovereignty of 
Taiwan from Japan to China. 

The ROC argues that the Treaty of Taipei implicitly 
transferred sovereignty of Taiwan to it, however the US 
State Dept. disagreed with such an interpretation in its 
1971 Starr Memorandum.  

Arguments against Taiwan being legally part of China. A 
number of supporters of Taiwan independence argue 
that Taiwan was only formally incorporated as a Chinese 
territory under the Qing Dynasty in 1683, and as a 
province in 1885. Subsequently, because of the 
Shimonoseki Treaty of 1895, Taiwan had been de jure 
part of Japan when the ROC was established in 1912 and 
thus was not part of the Chinese republic. Also, because 
the Cairo Declaration was an unsigned press 
communiqué, the independence advocates argue that 
the legal effectiveness of the Declaration is highly 
questionable. Furthermore, they point out that the 
Instrument of Surrender of Japan was no more than an 
armistice, a "modus vivendi" in nature, which served as a 
temporary or provisional agreement that would be 
replaced with a peace treaty. Therefore, only a military 
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occupation of Taiwan began on 25 October 1945, and 
both the Treaty of San Francisco and Treaty of Taipei hold 
legal supremacy over the surrender instrument. These 
treaties did not transfer the title of Taiwan from Japan to 
China. Some argue that Taiwan was returned to the 
people of Taiwan when Japan renounced sovereignty of 
Taiwan based on the policy of self-determination which 
has been applied to "territories which detached from 
enemy states as a result of the Second World War" as 
defined by article 76b and 77b of the United Nations 
Charter and also by the protocol of the Yalta Conference. 
The United Nations General Assembly has not been 
particularly receptive to this argument, and the ROC's 
applications for admission to the United Nations have 
been rejected 15 times. 

Although the interpretation of the peace treaties was 
used to challenge the legitimacy of the ROC on Taiwan 
before the 1990s, the introduction of popular elections in 
Taiwan has compromised this position. Except for the 
most extreme Taiwan independence supporters, most 
Taiwanese support the popular sovereignty theory and 
no longer see much conflict between this theory of 
sovereignty and the ROC position. In this sense, the ROC 
government currently administering Taiwan is not the 
same ROC which accepted Japanese surrender because 
the ruling authorities were given popular mandate by 
different pools of constituencies: one is the mainland 
Chinese electorate, the other is the Taiwanese 
constituencies. In fact, former president Chen Shui-bian 
has been frequently emphasizing the popular sovereignty 
theory in his speeches. 
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However, as of 2010, the conflict between these two 
theories still plays a role in internal Taiwanese politics. 
The popular sovereignty theory, which the pan-green 
coalition emphasizes, suggests that Taiwan could make 
fundamental constitutional changes by means of a 
popular referendum. The ROC legal theory, which is 
supported by the pan-blue coalition, suggests that any 
fundamental constitutional changes would require that 
the amendment procedure of the ROC constitution be 
followed. 

The United States of America is one of the main allies of 
Taiwan and, since the Taiwan Relations Act passed in 
1979, the United States has sold arms and provided 
military training to Taiwan's Republic of China Armed 
Forces. This situation continues to be a point of 
contention for People's Republic of China, which 
considers US involvement disruptive to the stability of the 
region. In January 2010, the Obama administration 
announced its intention to sell $6.4 billion worth of 
military hardware to Taiwan. As a consequence, China 
threatened the United States with economic sanctions 
and warned that their cooperation on international and 
regional issues could suffer. The official position of the 
United States is that China is expected to "use no force or 
threaten to use force against Taiwan" and that Taiwan is 
to "exercise prudence in managing all aspects of Cross-
Strait relations." Both are to refrain from performing 
actions or espousing statements "that would unilaterally 
alter Taiwan's status." The United States maintains the 
American Institute in Taiwan. 
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The United States, the United Kingdom, Japan, India, 
Pakistan and Canada have formally adopted the One 
China policy, under which the People's Republic of China 
is theoretically the sole legitimate government of China. 
However, the United States and Japan acknowledge 
rather than recognize the PRC position that Taiwan is 
part of China. In the case of the United Kingdom and 
Canada, bilateral written agreements state that the two 
respective parties take note of Beijing's position but do 
not use the word support.  

The UK government position that "the future of Taiwan 
be decided peacefully by the peoples of both sides of the 
Strait" has been stated several times. Despite the PRC 
claim that the United States opposes Taiwanese 
independence, the United States takes advantage of the 
subtle difference between "oppose" and "does not 
support". In fact, a substantial majority of the statements 
Washington has made says that it "does not support 
Taiwan independence" instead of saying that it "opposes" 
independence.  

Thus, the US currently does not take a position on the 
political outcome, except for one explicit condition that 
there be a peaceful resolution to the differences between 
the two sides of the Taiwan Strait. The United States bi-
partisan position is that it does not recognize the PRC's 
claim over Taiwan, and considers Taiwan's status as 
unsettled. All of this ambiguity has resulted in the United 
States constantly walking on a diplomatic tightrope with 
regard to cross strait relations. 
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5.3. Shadows of Fall of  Singapore 1942 and Next Fall       

With the change in the geopolitical hegemony between 
China and Western civilization, this will certainly affect 
and test the solidarity of the cohesiveness of a country 
and nation in the coming decades. There is a book that 
tells Indonesia unstability  scenario within World War 3 
entitled "Ghost Fleet" by P.W. Singer and August Cole, in 
the story chapter, tell that Indonesia will be divided in 
2030 (11 years from 2019).  

Whereas in the future, if the Malacca Strait were blocked 
by China due to the China vs USA world war, the oil and 
gas energy crisis will damage the Indonesian economy 
because 70% of oil is imported, where the oil supply from 
Dahran Saudi Arabia will stop due to the bombing.  

1942 history of the Fall of Singapore, also known as the 
Battle of Singapore, took place in the South–East Asian 
theatre of the Pacific War.  

The Empire of Japan captured the British stronghold of 
Singapore—nicknamed the "Gibraltar of the East"—with 
fighting in Singapore lasting from 8 to 15 February 1942. 
Singapore was the foremost British military base and 
economic port in South–East Asia and under the 
Singapore strategy was important to British interwar 
defence planning for the region.  

The capture of Singapore resulted in the largest British 
surrender in history. 



 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Prior to the battle, Japanese General Tomoyuki Yamashita 
had already advanced south with 23,000 men down the 
Malayan Peninsula in the Malayan campaign. The British 
erroneously considered the jungle terrain impassable, 
leading to a swift Japanese invasion as defences were 
inadequate. The British Lieutenant-General Arthur Percival 
commanded 85,000 British troops on Singapore island, 
although many units were under-strength and most units 
lacked experience. The British enjoyed a signific
numerical and positional advantage on the island but 
much of its water was drawn from reservoirs on the 
mainland. To impede the Japanese, the British destroyed 
the causeway which led into the city, forcing the Japanese 
into an opposed crossing of the Johore Strait. The island 
was so important that the Prime Minister, Winston 
Churchill, ordered Percival to fight to the last man.
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The Japanese attacked the weakest part of the island 
defences and established a beachhead on 8 February. 
Percival had expected a crossing in the north and failed to 
reinforce the defenders in time. Communication and 
leadership failures beset the British and there were few 
defensive positions or reserves near the beachhead. The 
Japanese advance continued and the British began to run 
out of supplies. By 15 February, about a million civilians in 
the city had fled into the remaining area held by the 
Commonwealth, 1 per cent of the island. Japanese aircraft 
had continuously bombed the civilian water supply which 
was expected to fail within days. The Japanese were also 
at the end of their supplies and General Yamashita 
wanted to avoid costly house-to-house fighting. 

Yamashita demanded unconditional surrender as a ruse 
and that afternoon, Percival ignored his orders and 
capitulated. About 80,000 British, Indian, and Australian 
troops became prisoners of war, joining the 50,000 taken 
in Malaya. Many died of neglect, abuse or forced labour. 
About 40,000 mostly Indian soldiers joined the Indian 
National Army and fought with the Japanese. Churchill 
called it the "worst disaster" in British military history. It 
greatly decreased confidence in the British Army and 
provided the Japanese with an important strategic 
position until the end of the war. The fall of Singapore and 
other defeats in 1942 undermined British prestige and 
contributed to the end of European colonialism in the 
region. 

The Japanese 25th Army invaded Malaya from Indochina, 
moving into northern Malaya and Thailand by amphibious 
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assault on 8 December 1941. This was virtually 
simultaneous with the Japanese attack on Pearl Harbor 
which precipitated the United States' entry into the war. 
Thailand resisted landings on its territory for about 5 to 8 
hours; it then signed a ceasefire and a Treaty of Friendship 
with Japan, later declaring war on the UK and the US. The 
Japanese then proceeded overland across the Thai–
Malayan border to attack Malaya. At this time, the 
Japanese began bombing Singapore. 

The 25th Army was resisted in northern Malaya by III 
Corps of the British Indian Army. Although the 25th Army 
was outnumbered by Commonwealth forces in Malaya 
and Singapore, they did not take the initiative with their 
forces while Japanese commanders concentrated theirs. 
The Japanese were superior in close air support, armour, 
co-ordination, tactics and experience. Conventional British 
military thinking was that the Japanese forces were 
inferior and characterised that the Malayan jungles as 
"impassable"; the Japanese were repeatedly able to use it 
to their advantage to outflank hastily established 
defensive lines. Prior to the Battle of Singapore the most 
resistance was met at the Battle of Muar which involved 
the 8th Australian Division and the 45th Indian Brigade. 
The British troops left in the city of Singapore were 
basically garrison troops. 

At the start of the campaign, the Commonwealth forces 
had only 164 first-line aircraft in Malaya and Singapore 
and the only fighter type was the sub-standard Brewster 
339E Buffalo. The Buffaloes were operated by one Royal 
New Zealand Air Force (RNZAF), two Royal Australian Air 
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Force (RAAF), and two Royal Air Force (RAF) squadrons. 
The aircraft were, according to historian Peter Dennis, "not 
considered good enough for use in Europe" and major 
shortcomings included a slow rate of climb and the fuel 
system, which required the pilot to hand-pump fuel if 
flying above 6,000 ft (1,800 m). The Imperial Japanese 
Army Air Force was more numerous and better trained 
than the second-hand assortment of untrained pilots and 
inferior Commonwealth equipment remaining in Malaya, 
Borneo and Singapore. Japanese fighters were superior to 
the Commonwealth fighters, which helped the Japanese 
to gain air supremacy. Although outnumbered and 
outclassed, the Buffalos were able to provide some 
resistance, with RAAF pilots alone managing to shoot 
down at least 20 Japanese aircraft before the few 
survivors were withdrawn. 

Brittain Force Z, consisting of the battleship HMS Prince of 
Wales, the battlecruiser HMS Repulse and four destroyers, 
sailed north out of Singapore on 8 December 1941 to 
oppose expected Japanese landings along the coast of 
Malaya. Japanese land-based aircraft found and sank the 
two capital ships on 10 December, leaving the east coast 
of the Malayan Peninsula exposed and allowing the 
Japanese to continue their amphibious landings. Japanese 
forces quickly isolated, surrounded and forced the 
surrender of Indian units defending the coast. Despite 
their numerical inferiority, they advanced down the 
Malayan Peninsula, overwhelming the defences. The 
Japanese forces also used bicycle infantry and light tanks, 
allowing swift movement through the jungle. The 
Commonwealth having thought the terrain made them 
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impractical, had no tanks and only a few armoured 
vehicles, which put them at a severe disadvantage. 

Although more Commonwealth units—including some 
from the 8th Australian Division—joined the campaign, the 
Japanese prevented them from regrouping. The Japanese 
overran cities and advanced toward Singapore, which was 
an anchor for the operations of the American-British-
Dutch-Australian Command (ABDACOM), the first Allied 
joint command of the Second World War. Singapore 
controlled the main shipping channel between the Indian 
and the Pacific Oceans. An ambush was sprung by the 
2/30th Australian Battalion on the main road at the 
Gemenceh River near Gemas on 14 January 1942, causing 
many Japanese casualties. 

At Bakri, from 18 to 22 January 1942, the Australian 
2/19th and 2/29th battalions and the 45th Indian Brigade 
(Lieutenant Colonel Charles Anderson) repeatedly fought 
through Japanese positions before running out of 
ammunition near Parit Sulong. The survivors were forced 
to leave behind about 110 Australian and 40 Indian 
wounded, who were later beaten, tortured and murdered 
by Japanese troops during the Parit Sulong Massacre. Of 
over 3,000 men from these units only around 500 men 
escaped. For his leadership in the fighting withdrawal, 
Anderson was awarded the Victoria Cross. A determined 
counter-attack by the 5/11th Sikh Regiment (Lieutenant-
Colonel John Parkin) in the area of Niyor, near Kluang, on 
25 January and an ambush around the Nithsdale Estate 
by the 2/18th Australian Battalion on 26/27 January 1942 
bought valuable time and permitted East Force, based on 
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the 22nd Australian Brigade (Brigadier Harold Taylor), to 
withdraw from eastern Johor (formerly Johore). On 31 
January, the last Commonwealth forces crossed the 
causeway linking Johor and Singapore and engineers 
blew it up. 

Throughout the night of 14/15 February 1942, the 
Japanese continued to press against the Commonwealth 
perimeter, and though the line largely held, the military 
supply situation was rapidly deteriorating. The water 
system was badly damaged and supply was uncertain, 
rations were running low, petrol for military vehicles was 
all but exhausted, and there was little ammunition left for 
the field artillery and anti-aircraft guns, which were 
unable to disrupt the Japanese air attacks causing many 
casualties in the city centre. Little work had been done to 
build air raid shelters, and looting and desertion by 
Commonwealth troops further added to the chaos in the 
area. At 09:30, Percival held a conference at Fort Canning 
with his senior commanders. He proposed two options: an 
immediate counter-attack to regain the reservoirs and the 
military food depots around Bukit Timah, or surrender. 
After a full and frank exchange of views, all present 
agreed that no counter-attack was possible, and Percival 
opted for surrender. Post-war analysis has shown that a 
counter-attack might have succeeded. The Japanese were 
at the limit of their supply line and their artillery units 
were also running out of ammunition. 

A delegation was selected to go to the Japanese 
headquarters. It consisted of a senior staff officer, the 
colonial secretary and an interpreter. The three set off in a 
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motor car bearing a Union Jack and a white flag of truce 
toward the enemy lines to discuss a cessation of hostilities. 
They returned with orders that Percival himself proceed 
with staff officers to the Ford Motor Factory, where 
Yamashita would lay down the terms of surrender. A 
further requirement was that the Japanese Rising Sun Flag 
be hoisted over the Cathay Building, the tallest building in 
Singapore. Percival formally surrendered shortly after 
17:15. Earlier that day, Percival had issued orders to 
destroy all secret and technical equipment, ciphers, codes, 
secret documents and heavy guns. 

Under the terms of the surrender, hostilities were to cease 
at 20:30 that evening, all military forces in Singapore were 
to surrender unconditionally, all Commonwealth forces 
would remain in position and disarm themselves within an 
hour, and the British were allowed to maintain a force of 
1,000 armed men to prevent looting until relieved by the 
Japanese.  

Yamashita also accepted full responsibility for the lives of 
the civilians in the city. Following the surrender, Bennett 
caused controversy when he decided to escape. After 
receiving news of the surrender, Bennett handed 
command of the 8th Australian Division to the divisional 
artillery commander, Brigadier Cecil Callaghan and—along 
with some of his staff officers—commandeered a small 
boat.  

They eventually made their way back to Australia while 
between 15,000 and 20,000 Australian soldiers were 
reportedly captured. Bennett blamed Percival and the 
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Indian troops for the defeat but Callaghan reluctantly 
stated that Australian units had been affected by the 
desertion of many men toward the end of the battle. The 
Kappe Report, compiled by Colonels J.H. Thyer and C.H. 
Kappe, concedes that at most only two-thirds of the 
Australian troops manned the final perimeter. Many 
British units were reported to have been similarly affected. 

In analysing the campaign, Clifford Kinvig, a senior 
lecturer at Royal Military Academy Sandhurst, blamed the 
commander of the 27th Infantry Brigade, Brigadier 
Duncan Maxwell, for his defeatist attitude and not 
properly defending the sector between the Causeway and 
the Kranji River. Elphick also claims that Australians made 
up the majority of stragglers.   

According to another source, Taylor cracked under the 
pressure. Thompson argues that the 22nd Australian 
Brigade was "so heavily outnumbered that defeat was 
inevitable" and Costello states that Percival's insistence on 
concentrating the 22nd Australian Brigade at the water's 
edge had been a serious mistake. Yamashita, the Japanese 
commander, laid the blame on the British 
"underestimating Japanese military capabilities" and 
Percival's hesitancy in reinforcing the Australians on the 
western side of the island. 

A classified wartime report by Wavell released in 1992 
blamed the Australians for the loss of Singapore. 
According to John Coates, the report "lacked substance", 
for though there had undoubtedly been a lack of 
discipline in the final stages of the campaign—particularly 



  220 
 

among the poorly trained British, Indian and Australian 
reinforcements that were hurriedly dispatched as the crisis 
worsened—the 8th Australian Division had fought well 
and had gained the respect of the Japanese.  

5.3. Indonesia’s Divided Risks of Potential World War 3 . 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Revolution and reform in Indonesia will definitely 
continue to occur from 1965 to 2022 and next, because 
the two changes of power still use camouflage masks with 
student demonstrations, where the masterminds hide 
behind a well-organized student movement. While 
intellectuals, thinkers of the nation's future, these are still 
cowards. We'll see in 1965 -1966, mass killings took place, 
what can the students do. What can students do to think 
about the future constitution of the nation that prioritizes 
the justice of the archipelago.  As long as the nation's 
intellectuals, the nation's scholars, the nation's thinkers, 
do not dare to appear for demonstrations independently, 
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as long as the change in political power still uses the 
power of students to encourage riots, economic instability, 
there is no future civilized socialism. See graph of 
conglomerates colonialism wealth power.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
After the fall of Sukarno 1966 with student demonstration 
engineering, since then the influence of demonic 
democracy USA controlled Indonesian mining and oil 
resources. Then repeat the fall of Suharto 1998 with 
student demonstration engineering. This means that 
Indonesian intellectual society is immature to realize the 
future constitution[1]. What can be expected for student 
demonstrations, only low quality political silliness. Where 
the scholar community, political intellectual dares to 
march in front of the House of Representatives as a 
constitutional main enforcer. The power of oligarchy in 
Indonesia was so strong destructive, from 1966 until now 
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2022 (55 years), due to the influence of Satanic 
Democracy USA. As an example of a law-related energy 
cost efficiency, it is strongly influenced by the politics of 
oligarchy, it actually violates its own constitution. For 
example, for 55 years, the solar power plant that is free of 
its energy source, only around 40 MW, while Vietnam is 
just independent 1967, has reached 5000 MW. The 
violation of this constitution is based on very superficial 
reasons, that solar power generation products must have 
a local content close to 100%, to protect the local industry, 
this is where oligarchs do not see their own future how to 
save the cost of future energy. With this energy 
constitution violation model, Indonesia has lost its foreign 
exchange of Rp. 3,000 trillion due to spending expensive 
oil imports sold much cheaper in the country. That is the 
consciousness of the constitution which is still immature. 
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No Regional Province Province District City 
1 Aceh (NAD) 1 18 5 
2 Bali 1 8 1 
3 Banten 1 4 4 
4 Bengkulu 1 9 1 
5 DI Yogyakarta 1 4 1 
6 DKI Jakarta 1 1 5 
7 Gorontalo 1 5 1 
8 Jambi 1 9 2 
9 Jawa Barat 1 18 9 

10 Jawa Tengah 1 29 6 
11 Jawa Timur 1 29 9 
12 Kalimantan Barat 1 12 2 
13 Kalimantan Selatan 1 11 2 
14 Kalimantan Tengah 1 13 1 
15 Kalimantan Timur 1 7 3 
16 Kalimantan Utara 1 4 1 
17 Kep. Babel 1 6 1 
18 Kepulauan Riau 1 5 2 
19 Lampung 1 13 2 
20 Maluku 1 9 2 
21 Maluku Utara 1 8 2 
22 NTB 1 8 2 
23 NTT 1 21 1 
24 Papua 1 28 1 
25 Papua Barat 1 12 1 
26 Riau 1 10 2 
27 Sulawesi Barat 1 6 0 
28 Sulawesi Selatan 1 21 3 
29 Sulawesi Tengah 1 12 1 
30 Sulawesi Tenggara 1 15 2 
31 Sulawesi Utara 1 11 4 
32 Sumatera Barat 1 12 7 
33 Sumatera Selatan 1 13 4 
34 Sumatera Utara 1 25 8 

 Regional Govt 548 

The Indonesia’s reform of 548 provincial, district and 

city governments shall achieve better energy 

transportation economy according to the constitution.  
 



 
 

This means that the Indonesian people are still not fully 
independent, meaning that the Indonesian people are still 
colonized by the oligarchy of their own nation, the 
colonial oligarchy that organized student demonstrations 
in 1966 and 1998, the colonial oligarchy hiding in the 
legislature, the colonial oligarchy hiding in the political 
parties. Oligarchy hiding among conglomerates who keep 
their wealth abroad, while these colonial conglomerates 
control mining wealth, these colonial conglomerates have 
controlled plantations since the Suharto era 1966 until 
now 2022[1]. 
 
What can be learned from this revolution and 
seems that students are only puppets, used for power 
struggles that take the victims of the innocent
in 1998 and earlier in 1966. What's the matter with 
Indonesia's reform? It shows high cost and risk of elite 
power struggle in Jakarta 
 

1998 
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Why does Malaysia not need bloody and tiring reforms like 
the 1998 Indonesian reform, that is certain because not 
only was Malaysia's independence in 1957 prepared by 
the British ex colonials, but the constitution and laws were 
also prepared by the British Commonwealth. Meanwhile, 
the 1945 Indonesian independence revolution was a 
formidable struggle through the war for independence 
that gave birth to many national heroes.  
 
The essence of the problem that challenges Indonesia is 
that this country is divided by large islands, small islands 
from Java, Sumatra, Kalimantan, Sulawesi, Bali, Nusa 
Tenggara, Maluku, and Papua which stretch from end to 
end Sabang to Merauke. as far as 5000 km. From 1945, the 
history of the disintegration of the Indonesian nation has 
been extraordinarily filled with separatism, rebellions 
based on religion, ethnicity, communism, and 
shall become a great country, the unitary state of the 
Republic of Indonesia[1]. 

1966 
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The ethnic groups of Indonesia are almost the same as the 
ethnic groups of Malaysia with Malay as the root of the 
Indonesian language, why is Indonesia a rebellious child 
while Malaysia is like a patient child waiting for 
independence given by the colonizer. But remember that 
even an independent America went through the war of 
independence against the British colonialists, so it should 
be seen in the future that the goal of independence was to 
bring a more advanced Indonesian civilization to the same 
level as the colonizer. Like it or not, whether they like it or 
not, the colonial nation had a civilization that was more 
advanced, more stable, more democratic, with a strong 
economy and technology. There is nothing in this world, 
the world colonizing nations have retreated their 
civilization in this millennium era. Portugal and Spain were 
colonizers since 500 years ago, they still exist as Portugal 
and Spain, especially the game of football in Europe. So 
Indonesia must have the courage to le
neighboring countries if their constitution and laws can 
make their country more democratic, make its currency 
more stable, make its energy and transportation system 
are better.  
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Indonesia could return to learn from the past world 
colonizers how to make the people's welfare laws better, 
not just focus on regional autonomy and be busy with 
local expansion projects with new regents, new mayors, 
new governors. 
 
500 years ago, East Asia and Southeast Asia were colonies 
cakes of the British, Dutch and Portuguese. By 1913, the 
British had occupied Burma, Malaya and the northern 
Borneo territories, the French controlled Indochina, the 
Dutch ruled the Netherlands East Indies while Portugal 
managed to hold on to Portuguese Timor.  The second 
phase of European colonization of Southeast Asia is 
related to the Industrial Revolution and the rise of 
powerful nation states in Europe. As the primary 
motivation for the first phase was the mere accumulation 
of wealth, the reasons for and degree of European 
interference during the second phase are dictated by geo-
strategic rivalries, the need to defend and grow spheres of 
interest, competition for commercial outlets, long term 
control of resources and the Southeast Asian economies 
becoming more closely tied to European industrial and 
financial affairs by the late 19th century. 
 
Indonesia was colonized by the Dutch for 350 years, a 
history that has always been reminded to us since 
elementary school, but the nation could also remember 
that Dutch has united the islands of the archipelago to 
become the name of the Dutch East Indies, finally 
Indonesia, that is the fate of the Indonesian people. Do 
not forget that Indonesia has been independent for 73 
years (1945-2018). 



 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

The question is, has social justice for all Indonesian people 
been achieved? Indonesia has been a place of struggle
invaders for natural resources and energy since 1000 
years ago. The Dutch were colonizer who succeeded in 
uniting the colonization of the large islands of Java, 
Sumatra, Kalimantan, Sulawesi, Papua, and other small 
islands such as Bali, Nusa Tenggara and Maluku, later 
called the Dutch Indies (Dutch Indie). The way to unify 
Dutch colonialism was known as the political name 
"devide et impera".  If the Dutch could build roads and 
railroads from Anyer, from western tip of Java to 
Banyuwangi eastern tip of Java, then Indonesia 
be able to enlarge what the colonizer had built. So it is the 
state's obligation to build the same thing for energy 
systems, gas / oil pipelines, electricity transmission / 
distribution, end-to-end road transport on the islands of 
Sumatra, Kalimantan, Sulawesi, Papua, Bali, Nusa 
Tenggara and Maluku.  
 

  228 

Indonesian people 
been achieved? Indonesia has been a place of struggle 

for natural resources and energy since 1000 
years ago. The Dutch were colonizer who succeeded in 
uniting the colonization of the large islands of Java, 

lawesi, Papua, and other small 
islands such as Bali, Nusa Tenggara and Maluku, later 
called the Dutch Indies (Dutch Indie). The way to unify 
Dutch colonialism was known as the political name 

If the Dutch could build roads and 
western tip of Java to 

eastern tip of Java, then Indonesia shall also 
be able to enlarge what the colonizer had built. So it is the 
state's obligation to build the same thing for energy 

transmission / 
end road transport on the islands of 

Sumatra, Kalimantan, Sulawesi, Papua, Bali, Nusa 

 



  229 
 

Indonesia is an ASEAN member country whose ties are 
loose because of the different early histories of each 
country. For example, in contrast to the former British 
colony of ASEAN, which already prepared a constitutional 
system by the colonialist Britain, such as English in 
constitution, which is same-based laws for Commonwealth 
countries. By prepared constitutional Commonwealth, the 
risks of revolutionary desintegration fluctuation are less. 
Indonesia could learn how British prepared democratic 
constitutional laws for social justice responsibility. The 
revolution in Indonesia has been full dynamics since the 
beginning of Indonesian independence in 1945, and main 
potential risk is disintegration of the archipelago in future.  

 

How about is Indonesia? Indonesia reform, what is the 
matter? The reforms, which had been initiated by student 
protests in 1966 and 1998, have proven to be only puppet 
tools for political acrobats like in the beginning of the new 
order in 1966 and the beginning of the 1998 reformation. 
It is proven that these two moments of revolution failed to 
provide social justice for all Indonesian people.  
 
The Indonesia’s reform of 548 provincial, district and city 
governments shall achieve better energy transportation 
economy according to the constitution.  
 
In the beginning of the new order in 1966, it sought 
justice for food, clothing, housing, and it could be said 
that the people had already got a 95% chance. But in this 
reformation era, energy justice and transportation related 
to energy, a nation will become a colonized nation trap 
with subsidies. Ruppert warned of the danger of energy 
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inequality which is 10 times dangerous from food 
inequality which can damage the integration of a nation 
in the future.  
 
Do not underestimate the scientific predictions of World 
War 3.   
 
The shadow’s of “Ghost Fleet” story of 2030. The year 
2030 is only 11 years from 2019.  
 
If the fuel, gas and electricity energy subsidy conditions 
explode of Rp. 1500 trillion when the rupiah falls from 
USD 1 = Rp. 13,500 to be USD 1 = Rp. 25,000 along with 
the increase in world oil prices to USD 150 per barrel such 
as in the era of 2008.   
 
In 1988 USD1 = IDR 1500, in 2018 USD1 = IDR 15,000, in 
2030, the exchange rate could be USD1 = IDR 21,000 - IDR 
25,000 due to the import burden / increase in oil, gas fuel 
prices.  
 
In 2030 the price of crude oil will explode by IDR 20,000 / 
liter. With USD 1 = IDR 25,000 and a crude oil price of IDR 
20,000 per liter, it is predicted that in 2030, the import 
value of our fuel and crude oil will be IDR 1500 trillion.  
 
The typical Indonesian crisis is not similar to ASEAN 
countries but is more similar to typical South American 
countries with the characteristics of racial riots, looting, 
arson, tendencies to be barbaric, complications of racial 
conflicts as quoted from wikipedia of 1998 story. Growing 
dissatisfaction with Suharto's authoritarian rule and the 
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rapid erosion of the economy led many, chiefly the 
younger generation, to renew their protests directly 
against the New Order. During the period 1997–1998 
(mainly at 13–15 May 1998), a massive riot broke out in 
Indonesia. People were burning everything within the 
city, including cars, motorcycles, buildings, and 
monuments in addition to pillaging and looting from 
stores. This was further worsened when many were killed 
and raped, most of which were Chinese Indonesians. No 
action was taken by the army or the police[1]. 
 
The Ghost Fleet scenario war is a satellite technology war 
won by China, supported by Russia. In future in 2030, the 
rupiah could become USD 1 = IDR 25,000. It is predicted 
that in 2030 the price of crude oil will explode by 
Rp.20,000 / liter.  
 
With USD 1 = IDR 25,000 and a crude oil price of IDR 
20,000 per liter, it is predicted that in 2030, the 
import value of our fuel, gas and crude oil will be IDR 
1500 trillion. 
 

That's where the domino effect of the great crisis will 
occur. The prices of basic necessities will soar, there will be 
a shortage of fuel. Finally, the foreign exchange reserves 
were depleted only for the import of fuel to be subsidized.  
 
The Indonesian crisis will be even more devastating than 
the energy crises of the Philippines and Thailand in 2008, 
due to the weak value of the Indonesian rupiah.   
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The long history of the early days of Indonesian 
independence was full of struggles to unite the nation as a 
result of split interests, for example Indonesia was once 
formed as union states or RIS in 1948-49.  
 
So the 73 years of independence remain a very formidable 
challenge. The 22 years of the Sukarno era (1945-1967), 
the era of maintaining the integrity of the nation, the 31 
years of the Suharto era (1967-1998) the development era 
with foreign debt policies, then entering the maturity of 
the 21 years of the reform era (1998-2019) but the 
Indonesian rupiah did not become stronger support for a 
stable economy. There is still a steep road to achieve the 
ideals of the 5th principle of Pancasila, "Social Justice for 
All Indonesians".  
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Why can the awareness of the constitution of a nation be 
low in seeing the future? China is a capitalistic communist 
country that can be best exemplified for the future 
energy and transportation system in its big cities. China 
currently has 100 million green electric motorbikes, but 
Indonesia still has 100 million fuel motorbikes which 
continue to erode state money for fuel subsidies. If China 
and seeing the ASEAN countries have established united 
authority of railway and road, why does Indonesia still 
have 2 different authority,  railway and road.  
 
In 1967, Indonesia and China both treaded poverty as a 
result of the revolution and the terrible domestic conflict, 
in 2019 China had built a subway MRT transportation 
system in 70 of its major cities, while Indonesia in 2019 
just completed the MRT in 1 city of Jakarta.  
 
A theory said, great nation must see that they must 
prepare for war if they are to be peaceful, they must be 
strong in competition if they are not to be colonized 
economically. 
 
The leadership of the nation does not focus on seeing the 
real problem of the need for efficiency, conservation of 
fossil energy and electricity for future national 
competition which is described by the novel "Ghost 
Fleet".  
 
It is rare for the leaders of this nation to compare and 
make benchmarks with neighboring ASEAN countries 
and China, rarely do the leaders of this nation shout that 



 
 

China's MRT system must be emulated for Indonesian 
cities.  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
.  
When Vietnam was fully independent in 1974 due to civil 
war and now 2019 had finished building the Hanoi city 
MRT train system which is integrated with existing trains 
and is operated by their state-owned enterprises, the 
leaders of this country remain relaxed not seeing
civilization competition will continue from time to time.
 
If we look at the journey of Chinese civilization for 3000 
years, then China tends not to be an expansive nation 
between continents. When the Mongols controlled
from 1215-1294 AD, integration took place so that China 
became an expansive nation in the era of Kublai Khan's 
reign (1260-1294 AD) and the next Yuan Dynasty. The 
Mongol nation and its army were actually a joint army of 

China
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36 MRT Subway 
started in 36 cities 

1970-1990

Green 100 million 
unit Electric motor 

cycle   

Indonesia

50 years

1 MRT  Subway 
started 2019 in 1 
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million fuel oil 
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Turkey-Kazakh-Russia-Mongol mercenaries after the 
hegemony of the Byzantine Empire began to fall due to 
the expansion of Islamic kingdoms in the Middle East. 
That is why the world's largest and longest great wall of 
21,196 km is in China, showing evidence of Chinese 
civilization tending to be a defensive nation to invade 
other great civilizations. In this millennium, China proved 
again, they have built the longest metro subway train 
network in the world with a length of 8600 km, while the 
total length of the world's metro subway is 9940 km.
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
In the near future when fossil energy will run out in 2100, 
natural gas will definitely run out, oil will run out faster in 
2050. The world is not ready, this is proven when 
Germany is very dependent on gas supplies from Russia, 
when Russia's oil and natural gas supplies stop due to US 
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and European sanctions, the price of natural gas and oil 
skyrockets. Industries in Europe do need cheap fossil 
energy to provide competitive trade prices. In the future 
the tourism industry is very potential to provide local 
people's income, but the state must support efficient, 
feasible and economical energy and transportation 
infrastructure for foreign tourists interested in visiting. 
That's how we see China building its future. 
 

No City Name Length Unit 
1 Beijing Beijing Subway 761 km 
2 Changchun Changchun Rail Transit 73 km 
3 Changsha Changsha Metro 143 km 
4 Changzhou Changzhou Metro 54 km 
5 Chengdu Chengdu Metro 518 km 
6 Chongqing Chongqing Rail Transit 402 km 
7 Dalian Dalian Metro 201 km 
8 Dongguan Dongguan Rail Transit 38 km 
9 Foshan Foshan Metro 72 km 

10 Fuzhou Fuzhou Metro 60 km 
11 Guangzhou Guangzhou Metro 607 km 
12 Guiyang Guiyang Metro 76 km 
13 Hangzhou Hangzhou Metro 419 km 
14 Harbin Harbin Metro 79 km 
15 Hefei Hefei Metro 156 km 
16 Hohhot Hohhot Metro 49 km 
17 Hong Kong Mass Transit Railway 204 km 
18 Jinan Jinan Metro 84 km 
19 Kunming Kunming Metro 139 km 
20 Lanzhou Lanzhou Metro 26 km 
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No City Name Length Unit 
21 Luoyang Luoyang Subway 44 km 
22 Macau Macau Light Rapid  9 km 
23 Nanchang Nanchang Metro 128 km 
24 Nanjing Nanjing Metro 427 km 
25 Nanning Nanning Metro 129 km 
26 Ningbo Ningbo Rail Transit 183 km 
27 Qingdao Qingdao Metro 284 km 
28 Shanghai Shanghai Metro 803 km 
29 Shaoxing Shaoxing Metro 20 km 
30 Shenyang Shenyang Metro 115 km 
31 Shenzhen Shenzhen Metro 419 km 
32 Shijiazhuang Shijiazhuang Metro 77 km 
33 Suzhou Suzhou Rail Transit 211 km 
34 Taiyuan Taiyuan Metro 24 km 
35 Tianjin Tianjin Metro 265 km 
36 Ürümqi Ürümqi Metro 28 km 
37 Wenzhou Wenzhou Rail Transit 53 km 
38 Wuhan Wuhan Metro 435 km 
39 Wuhu Wuhu Rail Transit 46 km 
40 Wuxi Wuxi Metro 114 km 
41 Xiamen Xiamen Metro 98 km 
42 Xi'an Xi'an Metro 266 km 
43 Xuzhou Xuzhou Metro 64 km 
44 Zhengzhou Zhengzhou Metro 206 km 

 
  TOTAL = 8609 km 

 
Can Indonesia follow China to catch up with the results of 
its better future civilization ? See this is a big question 
picture of Indonesia fate of 270 million people.    
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VI. Power Point Brief-
Satanic Democracy 
Studies  
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